LRB-34854% J,

K/PG/MES:¢js:md

1 AN ACT to renuptber and amend 13.48 (15) and 101.025 (4) (intro.); to amend
2 16.84 (5), 101.027 (2), 101.027 (3) (a) 1., 101.027 (3) (b) 1., 101.05 (1) and (3),
3 101.65 (1) (a) (intro.) and 119.04 (1); and to create 13.48 (2) (jm), 13.48 (15) (b),
4 16.85 (3m), 16.856, 66.0902, 101.02 (23), 101.025 (4) (ar), 101.028, 120.24 and
5 145.133 of the statutes; relating to: energy conservation standards for the
6 construction of certain buildings, energy and environmental design standards
7 for state buildings, structures, and facilities, energy and environmental design
8 standards for school district facilities and other local government buildings,
9 leasing of state buildings, structures, and facilities, standards for the
10 construction and use of graywater systems, and granting rule-making
11 authority.

Analysis by the Legislative Reference Bureau
a 1 m Ac a Stswill vided ima late

urrently, with certain exceptions, the Department of Administration (DOA)
must ensure that the specifications for each state construction project require the use



2009 - 2010 Legislature -2- LRB-3485/P7
JTK/RNK/PG/MES:¢js:md

of recovered and recycled materials to the extent that such use is technically and
economically feasible. With certain exceptions, DOA must also prescribe and enforce
energy efficiency standards for energy consuming equipment that is installed in
connection with state construction projects. The standards must meet or exceed
specified statutory standards. The Building Commission must also apply these
standards when entering into certain leases on behalf of the state. Current law also
requires the commission to employ a design for cogeneration of steam and electricity
in state-owned central steam generating facilities unless the commission
determines that such a design is not cost-effective and technically feasible.
Currently, the commission must also ensure that state-operated steam generating
facilities are designed to allow the use of biomass fuels and refuse-derived fuels to
the greatest extent cost-effective and technically feasible. In addition, unde

current law, the commission is prohibited from approving the construction or majgr gﬁfaﬂ
remodeling of or addition to any state building or structure unless the building pr ps[ ael
structure makes maximum practical use of passive solar energy system desig é‘;{‘%gﬂg}
elements and, unless not technically or economically feasible, incorporates an acti%e 3)‘2‘{;“ Y
solar energy system or photovoltaic solar energy system or other renewable energy b ‘3{5 . K_quff%
system. 5 ov . |

This bill directs DOA and the Building Commission to ensure that the plans \ f«c- v
and specifications for each major state construction project (each project for the \ 1</
construction of any new state building, structure, or facility containing at least ‘ZF
10,000 gross square feet of conditioned space, or for the repair, renewalg'éﬁ'm&f@ foi A

igp of any existing building, structure, or facility for occupancy by any state 10, 0

entity if the building, structure, or facility contains at least 10,000 gross square feet

of conditioned space and the project affects more than 50 percent of the existi
square feet of conditioned space in the building strucglre or facility conform at a
minimum to the requirements under the LEED Preen u11d1ng rating ‘ystem at the
silver performance level, as prescribed by the Department of Commerce (Commerce) (¢ GWEL finn.
based upon the standards of the U.S. Green Building Council. The bill also directs \ 5« *
DOA and the Building Commission to ensure that each such building, structure, or
facility conforms to specific standards specified by Commerce that are derived from
various national and international building codes for energy performance,
?W ventilation components, indoor air quality performance, and

water usage level. The bill also{directs the commission to enforce compliance with
the bill’s requirements with respect to all major construction projects whenever the
buildings, structures, or facilitieslbeing constructed are purchased by the state under
a purchase agreement or whenéver construction, repair, renewal, renovation, or
expansion of a building, structure, or facility is performed for the state under alease
agreement with option to purchalke.

The bill also directs the Building Commission to apply all moneys available for
its use under the Authorized State Building Program to achieve certification as of
January 1, 2015, by the U.S. Grgen Building Council for not less than 15 percent of
the gross square footage of condjtioned space owned or leased by state agencies, as
determined by DOA, as meetingminimum LEED energy performance requirements
for the operation and mamtenaﬁ ce of existing buildings. In addition, the bill directs

\ ek Dofr awd fe commissisn Tp ensue
ﬁﬂ fw é d%’ )’ﬁcm"%r $uchk @"“’fg}‘“"ﬁ%cﬁ(“‘r 2 !Ca'c{!zJ

o M 5 Fcentario hospei i ot irements [pr recyeling
@, Qm&fyad‘}&q WQSP‘E a-hﬁc Ofvﬁrsf!ﬁ@h P’/‘cr“}ihq ‘5. lw a/!’/cf f“f}sﬁl\#ﬁ/




2009 - 2010 Legislature -3- JTK/RNK/p(I;J/I;/[BE;gtJngZ

DOA to promulgate rules that require the Building Commission to continue to apply
all moneys available for its use under the Authorized State Building Program during
the period from January 1, 2015, to January 1, 2030, to achieve certification by the
U.S. Green Building Council for greater percentages of the gross square footage of
conditioned space owned or leased by state agencies as meeting minimum LEED
performance requirements for the operation and maintenance of existing buildings
by specified dates.

Currently, DOA has responsibility for the negotiation and administration of
leases of real property by this state, except as otherwise provided by law. The
Building Commission has authority to approve leases of real property by the state,
except as otherwise provided by law. This bill directs DOA, before entering into any
lease, or renewing or extending any lease, for improved real property to be used by
a state agency, to require the prospective lessor to disclose the energy use intensity
for the total property and the annual energy usage for the total property, calculated
in accordance with Energy Star standards, as determined by Commerce, and to
verify and forward that information to the Building Commission. The bill directs
DOA to require other state agencies that have authority to enter into leases for
improved real property to obtain and forward the same information to the Building
Commission before entering into, or renewing or extending, any lease for real
property. The bill then prohibits the Building Commission from approving any lease
for improved real property to be used by this state unless DOA certifies to the
commission that the energy use intensity for the total property and the annual
energy usage for the total property conform to Energy Star standards at a Jevel

ufficient to meet the minimum threshold for compliance with the LEED Preen
%ulldmg %@tlng §ystem for existing buildings-operation and maintenance
performance requirements, as determined by Commerce. The bill directs the
Building Commission to require other state agencies that have authority to enter
into leases for improved real property, to certify to the commission, before entering
into, or renewing or extending, any lease for real property to be used by this state,
that the energy use intensity for the total property and the annual energy usage for

~ the total property conform to the same standards.

The bill also requires DOA, with limited exceptions, to ensure that major state

buildings, structures, and facilities that are constructed by or for the state conform

to specified energy performance standards at increasingly stringent levels by .

specified dates beginning on the first day of the 7th month beginning after the day
the act resulting from the bill becomes law and ending on January 1, 2030, by which
date all major state buildings, structures, and facilities that are constructed by or for
the state must achieve a zero net energy level of energy performance. In addition,
the bill directs DOA to report annually to the governor and the Building Commission
concerning the percentage level of adherence to the requirements imposed upon
DOA under the bill that become effective on a date later than the end of the preceding
year and the percentage level of adherence to the requirement imposed upon the
Building Commission to apply all moneys available to the commission to achieve
certification for at least 15 percent of conditioned space in existing owned or leased




2009 - 2010 Legislature -4 - LRB-3485/P7
JTK/RNK/PG/MES:cjs:md

state buildings, structures, or facilities as meeting the LEED energy performance
standards specified in the bill.

Under current law, Commerce is required to promulgate an energy
conservation code that sets design requirements for construction and equipment for
the purpose of energy conservation in public buildings and places of employment.
Commerce must consider incorporating into the energy conservation code design
requirements from the most current national energy efficiency design standards,
including the International Energy Conservation Code (IECC) or another energy
efficiency code that is generally accepted and used by engineers and the construction
industry. Current law requires that Commerce review the code on a regular basis,
including whenever there is a revision of the IECC, and update the code accordingly.

This bill requires Commerce to incorporate into the energy conservation code
a standard that is based upon a specific standard of the American Society of Heating,
Refrigerating and Air Conditioning Engineers (ASHRAE) and eliminates the
requirement to use other standards specified under current law. As with the revision
requirements under current law, the bill requires Commerce to update the code
whenever the ASHRAE standard is revised.

Current law also requires Commerce to promulgate rules for ventilation
systems in public buildings and places of employment. This bill requires Commerce
to incorporate a specific ASHRAE standard into those rules and to update the rules
when the standard is revised.

Under current law, a city, village, town, or county may exercise jurisdiction over
the construction of new dwellings by passing an ordinance, provided that the
ordinance meets the requirements of the one- and two-family dwelling code under
current law, this bill provides that such an ordinance may exceed the requirements
of that code as they relate to energy conservation in the construction of new
dwellings.

This bill authorizes Commerce to promulgate rules that establish standards for
the installation of graywater and rainwater systems and that authorize the reuse of
graywater and rainwater within the building, or on the property surrounding the
building, from which the graywater or rainwater was generated. Under the bill,
graywater is defined as wastewater generated from the use of a clothes washer, sink,
shower, or bathtub. )
or further information see the state and local fiscal estimate, which will be
printed as an appendix to this bill.

The people of the state of Wisconsin, represented in senate and assembly, do
enact as follows:

SECTION 1. 13.48 (2) (jm) of the statutes is created to read:
13.48 (2) m) 1. In this paragraph, “conditioned space” means space that is

designed to have controlled environmental conditions.




2009 - 2010 Legislature -5- STRERNE/POMES e

SECTION 1

1 2. The building commission shall not approve the design or construction of any
2 project for the construction of any building, structure, or facility for a board, agency,
3 officer, department, commission, or body corporate, if the building, structure, or
4 facility after construction will contain at leést 10,000 gross square feet of conditioned
5 space for occupancy by any such entity, or of any project for the repair, renewal,
6 renovation, or expansion of any existing building, structure, or facility for occupancy
7 by any such entity if the building, structure, or facility contains at least 10,000 gross
8 square feet of conditioned space and the project affects more than 50 percent of the
9 existing gross square feet of conditioned space in the building, structure, or facility,
10 regardless of the funding source of the project, unless the department of
11 administration verifies and certifies to the commission, after reviewing the plans
1/2/ - and speciﬁcations, all of the following: 9\_/

// 1/3 a. That the@%}\g}f/ﬁnnfémw&oo/&ﬂ.)roject conforms at a minimum to the
7 . - G B dine R ting .
requirements under the LEED greengulldmg rating system at the silver level, as
= = =

15 defined in s. 16.856 (1) (f), for construction projects.

16 b. That the energy performance for the project is at least 30 percent better than

17 the performance standard prescribed by the department of commerce under s.

18 101.028 based upon standard 90.1-2007 of the American Society of Heating,

19 Refrigerating and Air Conditioning Engineers or its most current equivalent, as

20 documented by energy modeling and certified in writing by the chief engineer for the ~
project. ConFrechny Meterials delivered +o 1 p ’03;.‘57‘3;

c. That at least 75 percent of theldemolition materials from any demolition but

K
vecycle e
required to undertake the project are&@@ in the project or transferred to a 3rd

Y écye 6? . .
party for as & part of another construction project for an agency, as defined i

s. 16.70 (1e), or a local governmental unit, as defined in s. 19.42 (7u).




10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

21

22

23

24

2009 - 2010 Legislature -6 - LRB-3485/P7
JTK/RNK/PG/MES:cjs:md

SECTION 1
d. That the ventilation components for the project are strictly in conformity
with standards prescribed by the department of commerce under s. 101.028 based
upon standard 62.1-2004 of the American Society of Heating, Refrigerating, and Air
Conditioning Engineers, and the chief engineer for the project certifies in writing
that no exemptions from strict conformity with that standard have been authorized.
e. That the project has an indoor air quality management plan that addresses
adherence to the heating, ventilation, and air conditioning performance standards
for the project, source control that ensures use of low emission materials and
finishes, pathway interruption to prevent migration of contaminants during the
construction process, housekeeping procedures to prevent the spread and growth of
contaminants during the construction process, and construction activity scheduling
to prevent cross contamination of materials used in the project during the
construction process. The plan shall be consistent at a minimum with standards
promulgated by the department of commerce under s. 101.028 based upon indoor air
quality guidelines for occupied building of the Sheet Metal and Air Conditioning
Contractors’ National Association, 2nd edition, 2007.
f. That the project upon completion will attain a level of interior water use no
greater than 30 percent below the interior water use baseline, as determined by the

R

department of administration in accordance with the LEED E}'een gllilding éating
%stem, as defined in s. 16.856 (1) (e) assuming that 100 I;rcent of the indoor
plumbing fixtures used in the project are in compliance with standards promulgated
by the department of commerce under s. 101.028 based upon the strictest applicable
standard under the Uniform Plumbing Codes-2006 promulgated by the

International Association of Plumbing and Mechanical Officials or the International




10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

23

24

LRB-3485/P7
JTK/RNK/PG/MES:cjs:md
SECTION 1

2009 - 2010 Legislature -T7-

Plumbing Codes-2006 fixture and fitting performance requirements promulgated
by the International Code Council.

3. The building commission shall not enter into an agreement for the purchase
of or for the lease of, or renewal of a lease of, with option to purchase, any building,
structure, or facility that is constructed or to be constructed for occupancy by any
board, agency, officer, department, commission, or body corporate, if the building,
structure, or facility after construction will contain at least 10,000 gross square feet
of conditioned space for occupancy by any such entity, or any building, structure, or
facility that is to be repaired, renewed, renovated, or expanded for occupancy by any
such entity if the building, structure, or facility contains at least 10,000 gross square
feet of conditioned space and the repair, renewal, renovation, or expansion affects
more than 50 percent of the existing gross square feet of conditioned space in the
building, structure, or facility, regardless of the funding source of the agreement,
unless the department of administration verifies and certifies that the building,
structure, or facility conforms or will after construction, repair, renewal, renovation
or expansion conform to all of the standards specified in subd. 2.

4. The building commission shall apply all moneys available for its use under
the authorized state building program to achieve certification as of January 1, 2015,

by the U.S. Green Building Council for not less than 15 percent of the total gross

square footage of conditioned space in buildings, structures, and facilities that are

owned or leased by agencies on that date, as determined by the department of
administration under s. 16.856 (3), for meeting the minimum LEED performance
requirements for the operation and maintenance of existing buildings, as defined in

s. 16.856 (1) (h).



10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24

25

2009 - 2010 Legislature -8 - LRB-3485/P7
JTK/RNK/PG/MES:cjs:md

SECTION 1

5. The building commission shall apply all moneys available for its use under
the authorized state building program to achieve certification by the dates specified
by rule of the department of administration under s. 16.856 (6) by the U.S. Green
Building Council for not less than the percentages specified by that rule of the total
gross square footage of conditioned space in buildings, structures, and facilities that
are owned or leased by agencies on the dates specified by that rule, as determined
by the department of administration under s. 16.856 (3), for meeting the minimum
LEED performance requirements for the operation and maintenance of existing
buildings, as defined in s. 16.856 (1) (h).

SECTION 2. 13.48 (15) of the statutes is renumbered 13.48 (15) (a) and amended
to read:

13.48 (15) (a) Subject to the requirements of par. (b) and s. 20.924 (1) (i), the
building commission shall have the authority to acquire leasehold interests in land
and buildings where such authority is not otherwise provided to an agency by law.

SECTION 3. 13.48 (15) (b) of the statutes is created to read:

13.48 (15) (b) The building commission shall not approve the leasing of, or the
renewal or extension of any lease for, property for use by this state unless the
department of administration has certified to the commission that the energy use
intensity for the total property and the annual energy usage for the total property
conform to standards promulgated by the department of commerce under s. 101.028
based upon Energy Star standards consistent with the minimum LEED performance
requirements for the operation and maintenance of existing buildings. The
commission shall also require other agencies, as defined in s. 16.70 (1e), that have
authority to lease improved real property, to certify to the commission, before

entering into, or renewing or extending, any lease of real property, that the energy



© w =N O

10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24

25

2009 - 2010 Legislature -9 - JTK/RNIQP(EJ/EI{VIBEES?S/:;Z

SECTION 3

use intensity for the total property and the annual energy usage for the total property
conform to the same standards.

SECTION 4. 16.84 (5) of the statutes is amended to read:

16.84 (5) Have responsibility, subject to approval of the governor, for all
functions relating to the leasing, acquisition, allocation and utilization of all real
property by the state, except where such responsibility is otherwise provided by the

statutes. In-this-connection;—the Prior to entering into any lease, or renewing or

extending any lease, for property to be used by this state, the department shall

require the prospective lessor to disclose the energy use intensity for the total

roperty, m r n are fi asis, and the annual ener for the total

roper lculated in rdan ith standards promulgated h men

of commerce under s. 101.028 based upon Energy Star standards, as defined in s.
13.48 (15) (b), consistent with the minimum LEED performance requirements for the
operation and maintenance of existing buildings, as defined in s. 16.856 (1) (h). The
department shall verify and certify this information to the building commission
before the commission considers approval of the lease, or the renewal or extension

of the lease. The department shall also require other agencies, as definedin s. 16.70

(1e), that have authority to enter into leases for real property to obtain, verify, and

certify the same information to the commission before entering into anv lease, or

renewing or extending any lease, for property to be used by those agencies. The

department shall, with the governor’s approval, require physical consolidation of
office space utilized by any executive branch agency having fewer than 50 authorized
full-time equivalent positions with office space utilized by another executive branch
agency, whenever feasible. The department shall lease or acquire office space for

legislative offices or legislative service agencies at the direction of the joint



10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
)
22
23

24

2009 - 2010 Legislature -10 - LRB-3485/P7
JTK/RNK/PG/MES:cjs:md

SECTION 4
committee on legislative organization. In this subsection, “executive branch agency”
has the meaning given in s. 16.70 (4).

SECTION 5. 16.85 (3m) of the statutes is created to read:

16.85 (3m) To appoint or approve the appointment of a chief engineer for each
major construction project, as defined in s. 16.856 (1) (g).

SECTION 6. 16.856 of the statutes is created to read:

16.856 Energy and environmental design standards for certain state
buildings, structures, and facilities. (1) In this section:

(a) “Agency” has the meaning given in s. 16.70 (1e).

(b) “ASHRAE standard” means the standard promulgated by the department
of commerce under s. 101.028 based upon standard 90.1-2007 of the American
Society of Heating, Refrigerating and Air Conditioning Engineers of its current °
equivalent as determined by the department of commerce under s. 101.028.

(¢c) “Conditioned space” means space that is designed to have controlled
environmental conditions.

(d “IECC standards” means the energy efficiency design standards
promulgated by the department of commerce under s. 101.028 based upon the
national energy efficiency design standards of the International Energy
Conservation Code or their current equivalents as determined by the department of
commerce under s. 101.028. |

(e) “LEED green _I_)I;Building %ating _Sgystem” means the green ’building rating
system of the U.S. Green Building Council designated as the leadership in energy
and environmental design system or its current equivalent as determined by the

department of commerce under s. 101.028.



LRB-3485/P7

2009 - 2010 Legislature -11 - JTK/RNK/PG/MES:cjs:md
SECTION 6
1 (f) “LEED silver level” means the performance level designated as the silver

ﬁ level under the LEED green %uilding %ting;%ystem or its current equivalent as

— - poss
3 determined by the department of commerce under s. 101.028.
4 (g) “Major construction project” means a project for the construction of a state
5 building, structure, or facility that will, upon completion, contain at least 10,000

6 gross square feet of conditioned space, or for the repair, renewal, renovation@}’
)

9,
7 of an existing state building, structure, or facility containing at least

gru)

11 maintenance of existing buildings” means the performance requirements so

Sopdiene
Ci} designated under the LEED green %gil&ng %ating %ystem, as prescribed by the U.S. . 5f

: e
13 Green Building Council, or it:s current equivalent as determined by the departmen i};{' &’h
e
14 of commerce under s. 101.028. >
15 (1) “Zero net energy” means an energy consumption level under which a
16 building, structure, or facility produces as much energy for electricity, heating, and
17 cooling from renewable sources in any calendar year as the building, structure, or
18 facility consumes during the same period.
19 (2) The department shall ensure that the plans and specifications for each
20 major construction project conform at a minimum to the requirements for
21 certification at the LEED silver level. The department shall also ens re that the
‘ eyt aumdd dear sl iom
@ energy performance, @ [d@; of constructlongr;aterlals ventilation
23 components, indoor air quality performance, and water usage level for each major

24 construction project conform to the standards specified s. 13.48 (2) Gm) 2.



10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

23

24

2009 - 2010 Legislature -12 - LRB-3485/P7
JTK/RNK/PG/MES:cjs:md

SECTION 6

(8) The department shall maintain a current inventory of the location and
gross square footage of the conditioned space in all buildings, structures, and
facilities that are owned or leased by any agency for its use or the use of another
agency. The inventory shall include for each building, structure, or facility
information concerning the conditioned space in the building, structure, or facility
and whether the building, structure, or facility or any portion thereof is certified or
eligible for certification by the U.S. Green Building Council as meeting the minimum
LEED performance requirements for the operation and maintenance of existing
buildings.

(4) Except as provided in sub. (5), the department shall ensure that each
building, structure, or facility constructed, repaired, renewed, renovated, or
expanded by or for the state that is a major construction project conforms to
whichever of the following energy performance standards applies, based upon the
year in which construction, repair, renewal, renovation, or expansion of the building,
structure, or facility begins:

(a) For a building, structure, or facility the construction, repair, renewal,
renovation, or expansion of which begins on or after the first day of the 7th month
beginning after the effective date of this paragraph .... [LRB inserts date], but before
January 1, 2015, the energy performance shall be at least 30 percent better than the
energy performance under the ASHRAE standard or the IECC standards, whichever
is the most stringent.

(b) For a building, structure, or facility the construction, repair, renewal,
renovation, or expansion of which begins after December 31, 2014, but before

January 1, 2020, the energy performance shall be at least 70 percent better than the



10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24
25

2009 - 2010 Legislature 13- ITKRNK/POMES o

SECTION 6

performance under the ASHRAE standard or the IECC standards, whichever is the
most stringent.

(c) For a building, structure, or facility the construction, repair, renewal,
renovation, or expansion of which begins after December 31, 2019, but before
January 1, 2025, the energy performance shall be at least 80 percent better than the
energy performance under the ASHRAE standard or the IECC standards, whichever
is the most stringent.

(d) For a building, structure, or facility the construction, repair, renewal,
renovation, or expansion of which begins after December 31, 2024, but before
January 1, 2030, the energy performance shall be at least 90 percent better than the
energy performance under the ASHRAE standard or the IECC standards, whichever
is the most stringent.

(e) For a building, structure, or facility the construction, repair, renewal,
renovation, or expansion of which begins after December 31, 2029, the energy
performance shall be 100 percent better than the energy performance under the
ASHRAE standard or the IECC standards, whichever is more stringent, and the
building, structure, or facility shall consume zero net energy.

(5) Subsection (4) does not apply to the gross square footage of enclosed space A
of any building, structure, or facility that is dedicated for laboratory usage if the
ventilation requirements for that gross square footage do not permit compliance with
sub. (4) in that area.

(6) The department shall assess the feasibility of achieving certification by the
U.S. Green Building Council for greater than 15 percent of the total gross square
footage of conditioned space in buildings, structures, and facilities that are owned or

leased by agencies, as determined under sub. (3), for meeting the minimum LEED



2009 - 2010 Legislature -14 - LRB-3485/P7

JTK/RNK/PG/MES:cjs:md
SECTION 6
1 performance requirements for the operation and maintenance of existing buildings
2 and shall, by rule, specify, for purposes of s. 13.48 (2) (jm) 5., increased levels of
3 certification and dates during the period from January 1, 2015, to January 1, 2030,
4 by which those increased levels are to be achieved.
5 (7) Annually no later than March 31, the department shall report to the
6 governor and the building commission concerning the percentage level of adherence
7 as of the preceding December 31 to each of the requirements under s. 13.48 (2) Gm)
8 and this section that become effective on a date following that December 31 and the
9 percentage level of adherence as of the preceding December 31 to the applicable
10 requirement under s. 13.48 (2) jm) 4. or 5.
11 SECTION 7. 66.0902 of the statutes is created to read:
12 66.0902 Energy and environmental design standards for political
13 subdivision facilities. (1) In this section: controlied 2n vironmtal

Cov\/{l‘tt'Oh@

Mnln@ﬂlmmgk% e

3{”“CQ\PMQ/%“$ space that 15&(35,;@3’ ty Nhave
s D)

@ ( b) (g’ “LEED silver level” has the meaning given in s. 16.856 (1) (f).

14

15

(6) @"‘Major construction project” means a project for the construction of a public

18 building by or for a political subdivision that will, upon completion of the project,

- % cond € omned
19 contain at least 10,000 gross square feet of @ @space or for the repair,

g
20 renewal, enovationﬁmf an existing public building by or for a pohtlcal

subdivision containing at least 10,000 gross square feet of énicidset @ space that
C&hpllléflﬂhﬂﬂl
affects more than 50 percent of the existing gross square feet of énclosad @space
A

in that building

( ﬂl >é¢‘ﬁdinority group member” has the meaning given in s. 560.036 (1) (f).

by o Qr
[} pahhco‘,l
Subd.v‘uon

y city, village, town, or county.

C “Political subdivision” means
)

c for He bxpa/\m‘of\

of an Q/xushf\g pvblic bu;)dmﬂ o add
L least 1O, 00D sSs Sqvare Feet oF Cond! hmei s\mce




2009 - 2010 Legislature - 15 - ITKRNKPGME S

SECTION 7

(2) A political subdivision shall ensure that a person to whom it éwards a
contract for a major construction project agrees, as a condition to receiving the
contract, that his or her goal shall be to ensure that at least 25 percent of the
employees hired because of the contract will be minority group members and at least

5 percent of the employees hired because of the contract will be women.

subdivision shall also ensure that a contract for a major construction project requires
the project to meet one of the standards in sub. (3), based on the year in which the
project begins. For purposes of this section, a major construction project begins with

the issuance of a request for proposal by the political subdivision.

(a) For a project that begins on or after the first day of the 7thi month afte

he effective date of this paragraph .... [LRB inserts date], but before January 1, 2015,
the energy performance for the project shall be at least 30 percent better than the
performance under the ASHRAE standards or the IECC standards, whichever is the
most stringent.

(b) For a project that begins after Deéember 31, 2014, but before January 1,
2020, the energy performance for the project shall be at least 70 percent better than

the performance under the ASHRAE standards or the IECC standards, whichever

is the most stringent.

(¢c) For a project that begins after December 31, 2019, but before January 1,
025, the energy performance for the project shall be at least 80 percent better than
Lhe performance under the ASHRAE standards or the IECC standards, whichever

is the most stringent.

(d) For a project that begins after December 31, 2024, but before January 1,

nce for the project shall be at least 90 percent better than

4




2009 - 2010 Legislature -16 - LRB-3485/P7
JTK/RNK/PG/MES:cjs:md

SECTION 7

e T

the performance under the ASHRAE standards or the IECC standards, whichever

is the most stringent.
(e) For a project that begins after December 31, 2029, the energy performance
for the project shall be 100 percent better than the performance under the ASHRAE

standards or the IECC standards, whichever is more stringent, and the project shall

consume zero net energy. i

O @A political subdivision shall ensure that the plans and specifications for

10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23

24

each major construction project conform at a minimum to the requirements for

certification at the LEED silver level. The political subdivision shall also ensure that
thevgy PerLojmanc ey aWpII(QW'OIf, oM

the/use and disposal of COI‘lStI'uCtIOI{ materials, ventilation components, indoor air

quality performance, and water usage level for each major construction project

conform to the standards specified s. 13.48 (2) (jm) 2.

SEcTION 8. 101.02 (23) of the statutes is created to read:

101.02 (23) The department may promulgate rules that establish building and
design requirements for public buildings and places of employment that are based
upon standard 189.1-2009 developed by the American Society of Heating,
Refrigerating and Air-Conditioning Engineers in conjunction with the U.S. Green
Building Council and the Illuminating Engineering Society or that are based upon
the current equivalent of that standard. If the department promulgates rules under
this subsection, the department shall review the rules whenever a revision of
standard 189.1-2009, or its current equivalent, is published. The department shall
complete its review of the rules and submit to the legislature proposed rules

changing the requirements no later than 18 months after the date on which the

revision of the standard is published.




< o v e~ W

©

10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24
25

SECTION 9

SECTION 9. 101.025 (4) (intro.) of the statutes is renumbered 101.025 (4) (ag),
and 101.025 (4) (ag) (intro.), as renumbered, is amended to read:

101.025 (4) (ag) (intro.) For ventilation systems in public buildings and places

of employment, the department shall adept promulgate rules setting that

incorporate standard 62.1-2007, or its current equivalent, of the American Society

SEcTION 10. 101.025 (4) (ar) of the statutes is created to read:

101.025 (4) (ar) The department shall review the rules promulgated under par.
(ag) whenever a revision of standard 62.1-2007, or its current equivalent, of the
American Society of Heating, Refrigerating and Air Conditioning Engineers, 1is
published. The department shall complete its review of the rules and submit to the
legislature a proposed rule changing the rules no later than 18 months after the date
on which the revision of the standard is published.

SEcTION 11. 101.027 (2) of the statutes is amended to read:

101.027 (2) The department shall review the energy conservation code and
shall promulgate rules that change the requirements of the energy conservation code
to improve energy conservation. No rule may be promulgated that has not taken into
account the cost of the energy conservation code requirement, as changed by the rule,
in relationship to the benefits derived from that requirement, including the
reasonably foreseeable economic and environmental benefits to the state from any
reduction in the use of imported fossil fuel. The proposed rules changing the energy
conservation code shall be submitted to the legislature in the manner provided under

s. 227.19. In conducting a review under this subsection, the department shall

consider—incorporating incorporate, into the energy conservation code, design



10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

23

24

2009 - 2010 Legislature -18 - LRB-3485/P7
JTK/RNK/PG/MES:¢js:md

SecTioN 11

requirementsfrom standard 90.1-2007, or its current equivalent, of the mest-eurrent

Heatin fricerating and Air Conditioning Engineers.

SECTION 12. 101.027 (3) (a) 1. of the statutes is amended to read:
101.027 (3) (a) 1. A revision of standard 90.1-2007, or its current equivalent,
of the International -Energy Conservation—Gode American Society of Heating,

Refrigerating and Air Conditioning Engineers is published.
SEcTION 13. 101.027 (3) (b) 1. of the statutes is amended to read:

101.027 (3) (b) 1. If the department begins a review under sub. (2) because a

revision of standard 90.1-2007. or its current equivalent, of the International

Energy-Conservation—Code American Society of Heating, Refrigerating and Air

Conditioning Engineers is published, the department shall complete its review of the
energy conservation code, as defined in sub. (1), and submit to the legislature
proposed rules changing the energy conservation code, as defined in sub. (1), no later

than 18 months after the date on which the revision of standard 90.1-2007, or its

current equivalent, of the International-Energy Conservation—Code American
Society of Heating, Refrigerating and Air Conditioning Engineers is published.

SECTION 14. 101.028 of the statutes is created to read:

101.028 Energy performance and environmental design standards for

certain public buildings, structures and facilities. (1) In this section:



1
2
4
5
6
7

)

9
10
11
13
14
15
16
17

18

2009 - 2010 Legislature -19 - LRB-3485/P7

JTK/RNK/PG/MES:cjs:md
SECTION 14

(a) “Energy Star standards” means the standards prescribed by the U.S.
Environmental Protection Agency under 42 USC 7403 (g) for energy use in buildings.

(b) “LEED %een ﬁlilding g\gting %gtem” means the green building rating
system of the U.S. Green Building Council designated as the leadership in energy
and environ;nental design system or its current equivalent as determined by the
department.

(¢) “LEED silver level” means the performance level designated as the silver
level under the LEED gégen g:(qilding gtinggystem or its current equivalent as
determined by the department.

(d) “Minimum LEED performance requirements for the operation and
maintenance of existing buildings” means the performance requirements so
designated under the LEEDgreen ‘Izyﬂdingf%ltingfgsystem, as prescribed by the U.S.
Green Building Council, or its current equivalent as determined by the department.

(e) “U.S. Green Building Council” means the United States Green Building
Council or any successor organization that is substantially the same organization,
as determined by the department.

(2) The department shall prescribe, by rule, standards for energy performance
and environmental design in buildings, structures, and facilities which shall apply
to the extent required under ss. 13.48 (2) and (15), 16.84 (5), 16.856, 66.0902, and
120.24. The standards shall be based upofl the following standards or, if they are

updated, their current equivalents:

(a) The LEED silver level He wpfor new building construction.
() Minimum LEED performance requirements for the operation and
maintenance of existing buildings.

(c) Energy Star standards.




W

10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22

23

2009 - 2010 Legislature -20 - LRB-3485/P7
' JTK/RNK/PG/MES:c¢js:md

SECTION 14

(d) Energy performance standard 90.1-2007 of the American Society of
Hearing, Refrigerating, and Air Conditioning Engineers.

(e) Standard 62.1-2004 of the American Society of Heating, Refrigerating, and
Air Conditioning Engineers.

(f) National energy efficiency design standards of the International Energy
Conservation Code adopted the the International Code Council-2006.

(g) The Uniform Plumbing Codes-2006 promulgated by the International
Association of Plumbing and Mechanical Officials.

(i) Indoor air quality guidelines for occupied buildings promulgated by the
Sheet Metal and Air Conditioning Contractors’ National Association, 2nd edition,
2007.

() The International Plumbing Codes-2006 fixture and fitting performance
requirements promulgated by the International Code Council.

(8) The department shall review a rule promulgated under sub. (2) whenever
a revision of a standard on which the rule is based is published. The department
shall complete its review of the rule and submit to the legislature a proposed rule
changing the standard no later than 18 months after the date on which the revision
of the standard is published.

SEcTION 15. 101.05 (1) and (3) of the statutes are amended to read:

101.05 (1) Ne Except for rules promulgated under s. 101.028, no building code
adopted by the department under this chapter shall affect buildings located on
research or laboratory farms of public universities or other state institutions and

used primarily for housing livestock or other agricultural purposes.



10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22

25

2009 - 2010 Legislature -21- nmNmé&Bﬁgﬁggg

SECTION 15

(3) No Except for rules promulgated under s. 101.028, no standard, rule, code

or regulation of the department under this subchapter applies to construction
undertaken by the state for the purpose of renovation of the state capitol building.
SECTION 16. 101.65 (1) (a) (intro.) of the statutes is amended to read:
101.65 (1) (a) (intro.) Exercise jurisdiction over the construction and inspection
of new dwellings by passage of ordinances, provided such ordinances meet the

requirements of the one- and 2-family dwelling code adopted in accordance with this

subchapter. An ordinance under this paragraph may exceed the requirements of the

one- and 2-family dwelling code that relate to energy conservation in the
construction of new dwellings. Except as provided by s. 101.651, a county ordinance
shall apply in any city, village or town which has not enacted such ordinance.

SECTION 17. 119.04 (1) of the statutes, as affected by 2009 Wisconsin Acts 60
aﬁd 96, is amended to read:

119.04 (1) Subchapters IV, V and VII of ch. 115, ch. 121 and ss. 66.0235 (3) (¢),
66.0603 (1m) to (3), 115.01 (1) and (2), 115.28, 115.31, 115.33, 115.34, 115.343,
115.345,115.361, 115.365 (3), 115.38 (2), 115.445, 115.45, 118.001 to 118.04, 118.045,
118.06, 118.07, 118.075, 118.10, 118.12, 118.125 to 118.14, 118.145 (4), 118.15,
118.153, 118.16, 118.162, 118.163, 118.164, 118.18, 118.19, 118.20, 118.225, 118.24
(1), (2) (¢) to (D, (6) and (8), 118.255, 118.258, 118.291, 118.30 to 118.43, 118.51,
118.52, 118.55, 120.12 (5) and (15) to (25), 120.125, 120.13 (1), (2) (b) to (), (3), (14),
(17) to (19), (26), (34), (35), (37), (37Tm), and (38), 120.14, 120.21 (3), 120.24, and
120.25 are applicable to a 1st class city school district and board.

SECTION 18. 120.24 of the statutes is created to read:

%

- ®
120.24 Energ)ia.nd environmental design standards for school district

facilities. (1) In this section:



2009 - 2010 Legislature -22 - LRB-3485/P7
JTK/RNK/PG/MES:¢js:md

SECTION 18
\'Vgshé, thowred Seacg\”/ ( c)
o /

(a) has the meaning given in s. 16.856 (1)

(b) \%‘LEED silver level” has the meaning given in s. 16.856 (1) ().

A

building that will, upon completion, contain at least 10,000 gross square feet of
mdf"\‘bh"}’ 'y @

r for the repair, renewal,(novationm_gf an existing

adna{*\‘“u(
space that affects

more than 50 percent of the existing gross square feet of @yclaggpl(space in that
buildi /,\av FW \'f\; rxpam{m« DG on e,u‘shh}; buwd ;,\% ;tf a&‘/ ot L:a st
W 1n{ 12, 00 3@55 sclb\an. Feet u‘( cond tigw e d spie(l)

10 (2) Each school board shall ensure that the plans and specifications for each

®
2

©)

@ (C) @ “Major construction project” means a project for the construction of a
5

€%

building containing at least 10,000 gross square feet of gaflffed)

11 major construction project conform at a minimum to the requirements for

endv (VMG 2 o
@ certification at the LEED silver level. The school board shall also ensure that t%nt;i:(se

and demolihim
@ and disposal of construction/materials, ventilation components, indoor air quality
14 performance, and water usage level for each major construction project conform to

15 the standards specified s. 13.48 (2) jm) 2.

16 (3) Each school board shall ensure that each buildifigcorrstr uptud,%epaimd,,__\

17 reném renovated, or expanded by or for the school district that yrajor
e . é

18 construction project conforms to one of the following energy performdnce standards, !

4

19 based upon the year in whteh construction, repair, renewat; renovation, or expansion

20 of the building begins:

21 (a) For a building for - Cor Ton, repair, renewal, renovation, or

22 expansion begins on or gf €+ the first day of the 7th I suth beginning after the

23 effective date of t& saragraph .... [LRB inserts date], but before January 1, 2015,

24 the energy performance shall be at least 30 percent better than the energy:

S



10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24

25

froee

LRB-3485/P7
JTK/RNK/PG/MES:¢js:md
SECTION 18

2009 - 2010 Legislature -23 -

performance under the ASHRAE standard or the IECC standards, whichever ist ne

m}s&stringent.

(%)\ For a building for which construction, repair, renewal, refovation, or

o

expansion\fj“agins after December 31, 2014, but before January 1,2020, the energy
performance shal] be at least 70 percent better than the pe formance under the
ASHRAE standard or¢he IECC standards, whichever ig” ; most stringent.

(¢) For a building fex which construction, renewal, renovation, or
expansion begins after Decembeg 31, 2019, buy fore January 1, 2025, the energy
performance shall be at least 80 perdent than the energy performance under
the ASHRAE standard or the IECC - qrds, whichever is the most stringent.

(d) For a building for constructlepn, repair, renewal, renovation, or
expansion begins after Dece ___s-i. 31, 2024, but before January 1, 2030, the energy

v
performance shall be at lggst 90 percent better than the éxergy performance under

‘”j

percent pétter than the energy performance under the ASHRAE standard™or the
IEC( standards, whichever is more stringent, and the building shall consume zexo

nét energy, as defined in s. 16.856 (1) (i).

SECTION 19. 145.133 of the statutes is created to read:

145.133 Graywater systems. (1) In this section:

(a) “Graywater” means wastewater generated from the use of a clothes washer,
sink, shower, or bathtub.

(b) “Graywater system” means a system for the collection and reuse of

graywater.

E——




= W

%)

10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18

20
21
22

2009 - 2010 Legislature -24 - LRB-3485/P7
JTK/RNK/PG/MES:¢js:md

SECTION 19

(¢) “Rainwater system” means a system for the collection and reuse of
rainwater generated from building roofs.

(2) The department shall promulgate rules that establish standards for the
installation of graywater and rainwater systems. The standards shall authorize the
reuse of graywater and rainwater within the building, or on the property
surrounding the building, from which the graywater or rainwater was generated.

SECTION 20. Initial applicability.

(1) The treatment of section 13.48 (2) (jm) 2. and 3. of the statutes first applies
with respect to projects approved and agreements entered into on the effective date
of this subsection.

(2) The treatment of section 16.856 (2) of the statutes first applies with respect
to projects for which design is commenced on the effective date of this subsection.

(3) The treatment of section 16.84 (5) of the statutes, the renumbering and
amendment of section 13.48 (15) of the statutes, and the creation of section 13.48 (15)
(b) of the statutes first apply with respect to leases of real property by the state that
are entered into, renewed, or extended on the effective date of this subsection.

(4) The treatment of section 120.24 (2) of the statutes first applies with respect
to projects for which design is commenced on the effective date of this subsection.

(5) The treatment of section 66.0902 (4)) of the statutes first applies with respect
to projects for which a request for proposal is issued by a political subdivision on the
effective date of this subsection.

(END)



2009-2010 DRAFTING INSERT LRB-3485/P7insMES
FROM THE JTK/RNK/PG/MES:cjs:
LEGISLATIVE REFERENCE BUREAU

INS ANL-MES

‘ ),[ major construction project means a proj public bulldmg
s7e by or for a political subdivision that wj i oss square feet of

a political subdivision under the bill afe based on"the requirements that the bill
imposes on DOA and the Building Commigsion for a major state construction project.
The bill requires a political subdivision to lensure that the plans and
specifications for each major construction project conform at a minimum to the
requirements for certification at the {BELY silver{levely and that the energy A<
performance, use and disposal of construction and demolitiory materials, ventilation
components, indoor air quality performance, and water usgge level for each major
construction project conform to the standards that -apply to a major state
construction project of DOA and the B}tfildjng C ission. In addition, a political
subdivision must ensure that a person om it awards a contract for a major
construction project agrees tha or goal will be to ensure that at least 25 percent
of the employees hire ause of the contract will be minority group members and
the employees hired because of the contract will be women.




STATE OF WISCONSIN - LEGISLATIVE REFERENCE BUREAU

L RB Research (608-266—0341) Library (608-266-7040) Legal (608-266-3561) L RB

N /7 % b I _aumpPoses S ] “’“l ar . MLJ_?‘»L/‘LLhm&&f& R
( ﬁ g pill impsses  similan re jalremnt s

; ,M%Q( M(;,QQST“ vetion lDf U'j CCA_S —— Q£ . C{’\Q(Zl T,
F v rvm o Lk (v cbion [pM&'C ch "l[ (‘(/L«s /

dls*( cts. ou St NS WS

dvetn cto. M@/u/\ ru{u{ boeld  musT gnpunt M.ur

) l @wnS - 3P‘$&L tan’[ﬂd& Coir i wla r ol

%, n/AN “““““““““““ Al &Pﬁ@tw,;j«&‘.i‘ld‘ﬁ:f 'éw teh MG e

P(OJQQ‘.‘

um_rh’w/ﬁuh ‘n,u\}ear oﬂ\;;\/m A/T o MAE Mg,

/
/ ‘

/

/

TS
/ N




STATE OF WISCONSIN - LEGISLATIVE REFERENCE BUREAU

L R B Research (608-266-0341) Wl (608-266-3561)
. . /

AR ~
| 47V A"l ol & - amm—

fff,r f. / . ; wR  speet c&ﬁmu

zm‘fa/ T leasT IV OBY s f‘iuw ?Z
/ R f‘{

pana

M%& §ﬂa<,<. . v /[(/v CLPC Iy /VWVM
i / 7

/('f-@va,f”fé}h ; W /)ﬁnm\mm 071\ K( (y;'f‘f’lh‘dr

Lwii/zh‘a‘ (cﬂj&u‘nw’r ed /1&!{ w(,m %M/m :7%%

[ , /
| tur ot ik rek ;“pm/ ff\c, r attfeets ﬂfug/xs/
/ /

- |
l [(5‘«’\ SU  pe(end” //f] //ﬁk lgrTine  awes A&zu‘
-/ ¢ 0 /1

|
/ #41’1 a GW Sﬂaoe) /m'[/vm &[/ M e

N
/ R fg» /eCm/emcmfAWmaf f{\

p&\» v &M-{_,

ks S/IV&[Z’VJ ?M /J/ff'C“L(AQ 51 Ccﬂ«,’“faQ(@

bx[ ff# (Eéfb Gfdk ﬁw d’(h& kﬁft né Sq f7cm




STATE OF WISCONSIN - LEGISLATIVE REFERENCE BUREAU

LRB Research (608-266-0341)  Library (608-266-7040)  Legal (608-266-3561) LRB
N S J((QC@ X schonl bfm\ré
{/ﬁm ﬂ// ’fﬂL lni/ u[sx direds  tacd fwﬁd A L 4l (T

ik e

y - e\ mevee, )

Cov\ST(dc;{’

AAAAAAAAAAAAAAAAAAA awizfimiaos o i Jz;;k/ peateccols .

\l/!xj,]hﬁd‘h ufwm«xem‘hr Athm Qur qu@ét‘hf

: /u/p./ /1}
{/D&c@m\&\na& Nk odEr umaxg,t &,fc?
+ ‘f\ nrn‘ Oom e o éfm
caw quor TOmETY IOy \' oyt
e ma\}iw o D o {D«uxecﬂ“ Copa | avim

&f’am Clcu’({S

3] Jéﬂl%é:wm»ﬁf)ww/ ed 4;4 Lo mtaca /fé/

CL?/W t/&d @fom \/amop&s nr‘f‘oha[ ao-d

Grt.. doiiick AJ‘»\ s na howe X  qus

/hfkhﬂfwka A“/aéma aoc[e!ﬂ

——p % IRt
N i hnaﬂ, — Ty Qodpilt

] <‘/’£’/3 o —MW

s ddd] M 1o tntune /’K.af any (/WM?';
\

Mfuf

(nslvaded %ﬂvf&// M panded WW A

7. v
| WJW /Mlm&’fi \,M(, %m[wms 1

MWUJMZ[/ Mfwﬂ' bvels by

mid,u (ﬂ [JLYMA k(f

bt o rﬂ.& bl ey ”‘“ 1h




Parisi, Lori

From: Van de Bogert, Abigail

Sent: Monday, February 22, 2010 3:32 PM

To: LRB.Legal

Subject: Draft Review: LRB 09-3485/1 Topic: Energy-efficient and environmental design for buildings

Please Jacket LRB 09-3485/1 for the ASSEMBLY.



sl-\f

—

o r TS L B

10
11

State of Wisconsin 2

2009 - 2010 LEGISLATURE LRB-3485/
JTK/RNK/PG/MES:cjq:rs
+nwn

R
2009 BILL

N -
AN ACT to rertumber and amend 13.48 (15) and 101.025 (4) (intro.); fo amend

16.84 (5), 101.027 (2), 101.027 (3) (a) 1., 101.027 (3) (b) 1., 101.05 (1) and (3),
101.65 (1) (a) (intro.) and 119.04 (1); and to create 13.48 (2) (jm), 13.48 (15) (b),
16.85 (3m), 16.856, 66.0902, 101.02 (23), 101.025 (4) (ar), 101.028, 120.24 and
145.133 of the statutes; relating to: energy conservation standards for the
construction of certain buildings, energy and environmental design standards
for state buildings, structures, and facilities, energy and environmental design
standards for school district facilities and other local government buildings,
leasing of state buildings, structures, and facilities, standards for the

construction and use of graywater systems, @Zl’anting rule-making

authori?./ A o "“‘(C”"‘@ G Lpprarpeis how

" Analysis by the Legislative Reference Bureau

Currently, with certain exceptions, the Department of Administration (DOA)
must ensure that the specifications for each state construction project require the use
of recovered and recycled materials to the extent that such use is technically and
economically feasible. With certain exceptions, DOA must also prescribe and enforce



2009 - 2010 Legislature -2~ LRB-3485/1
JTK/RNK/PG/MES:¢js:rs
BILL

energy efficiency standards for energy consuming equipment that is installed in
connection with state construction projects. The standards must meet or exceed
specified statutory standards. The Building Commission must also apply these
standards when entering into certain leases on behalf of the state. Current law also
requires the commission to employ a design for cogeneration of steam and electricity
in state-owned central steam generating facilities unless the commission
determines that such a design is not cost-effective and technically feasible.
Currently, the commission must also ensure that state-operated steam generating
facilities are designed to allow the use of biomass fuels and refuse-derived fuels to
the greatest extent cost-effective and technically feasible. In addition, under
current law, the commission is prohibited from approving the construction or major
remodeling of or addition to any state building or structure unless the building or
structure makes maximum practical use of passive solar energy system design
elements and, unless not technically or economically feasible, incorporates an active
solar energy system or photovoltaic solar energy system or other renewable energy
system. ‘

This bill directs DOA and the Building Commission to ensure that the plans
and specifications for each major state construction project (each project for the
construction of any new state building, structure, or facility containing at least
10,000 gross square feet of conditioned space, or for the repair, renewal, or
renovation, of any existing building, structure, or facility for occupancy by any state
entity if the building, structure, or facility contains at least 10,000 gross square feet
of conditioned space and the project affects more than 50 percent of the existing gross
square feet of conditioned space in the building, structure, or facility, or for the
expansion of an existing state building, structure, or facility to add at least 10,000
gross square feet of conditioned space) conform at a minimum to the requirements
under the LEED Green Building Rating System at the silver performance level, as
prescribed by the Department of Commerce (Commerce) based upon the standards
of the U.S. Green Building Council. The bill also directs DOA and the Building
Commission to ensure that each such building, structure, or facility conforms to
specific standards specified by Commerce that are derived from various national and
international building codes for energy performance, ventilation components, indoor

“air quality performance, and water usage level. The bill also directs DOA and the
commission to ensure that each project to construct such a building, structure, or
facility for the state shall conform to specified requirements for recycling of
construction waste and demolition materials. In addition, the bill directs the
commission to enforce compliance with the bill’s requirements with respect to all
major construction projects whenever the buildings, structures, or facilities being
constructed are purchased by the state under a purchase agreement or whenever
construction, repair, renewal, renovation, or expansion of a building, structure, or
facility is performed for the state under a lease agreement with option to purchase.

The bill also directs the Building Commission to apply all moneys available for
its use under the Authorized State Building Program to achieve certification as of
January 1, 2015, by the U.S. Green Building Council for not less than 15 percent of
the gross square footage of conditioned space owned or leased by state agencies, as



5. LRB-3485/1

2009 - 2010 Legislature JTK/RNK/PG/MES:¢js:rs

BILL

determined by DOA, as meeting minimum LEED energy performance requirements
for the operation and maintenance of existing buildings. In addition, the bill directs
DOA to promulgate rules that require the Building Commission to continue to apply
all moneys available for its use under the Authorized State Building Program during
the period from January 1, 2015, to January 1, 2030, to achieve certification by the
U.S. Green Building Council for greater percentages of the gross square footage of
conditioned space owned or leased by state agencies as meeting minimum LEED
performance requirements for the operation and maintenance of existing buildings
by specified dates.

Currently, DOA has responsibility for the negotiation and administration of
leases of real property by this state, except as otherwise provided by law. The
Building Commission has authority to approve leases of real property by the state,
except as otherwise provided by law. This bill directs DOA, before entering into any
lease, or renewing or extending any lease, for improved real property to be used by
a state agency, to require the prospective lessor to disclose the energy use intensity
for the total property and the annual energy usage for the total property, calculated
in accordance with Energy Star standards, as determined by Commerce, and to
verify and forward that information to the Building Commission. The bill directs
DOA to require other state agencies that have authority to enter into leases for
improved real property to obtain and forward the same information to the Building
Commission before entering into, or renewing or extending, any lease for real
property. The bill then prohibits the Building Commission from approving any lease
for improved real property to be used by this state unless DOA certifies to the
commission that the energy use intensity for the total property and the annual
energy usage for the total property conform to Energy Star standards at a level
sufficient to meet the minimum threshold for compliance with the LEED Green
Building Rating System for existing buildings-operation and maintenance
performance requirements, as determined by Commerce. The bill directs the
Building Commission to require other state agencies that have authority to enter
into leases for improved real property, to certify to the commission, before entering
into, or renewing or extending, any lease for real property to be used by this state,
that the energy use intensity for the total property and the annual energy usage for
the total property conform to the same standards.

The bill also requires DOA, with limited exceptions, to ensure that major state
buildings, structures, and facilities that are constructed by or for the state conform
to specified energy performance standards at increasingly stringent levels by
specified dates beginning on the first day of the 7th month beginning after the day
the act resulting from the bill becomes law and ending on January 1, 2030, by which
date all major state buildings, structures, and facilities that are constructed by or for
the state must achieve a zero net energy level of energy performance. In addition,
the bill directs DOA to report annually to the governor and the Building Commission
concerning the percentage level of adherence to the requirements imposed upon
DOA under the bill that become effective on a date later than the end of the preceding
year and the percentage level of adherence to the requirement imposed upon the
Building Commission to apply all moneys available to the commission to achieve



2009 - 2010 Legislature -4 - LRB-3485/1
JTK/RNK/PG/MES:¢js:rs
BILL

certification for at least 15 percent of conditioned space in existing owned or leased
state buildings, structures, or facilities as meeting the LEED energy performance
standards specified in the bill.

Under current law, Commerce is required to promulgate an energy
conservation code that sets design requirements for construction and equipment for
the purpose of energy conservation in public buildings and places of employment.
Commerce must consider incorporating into the energy conservation code design
requirements from the most current national energy efficiency design standards,
including the International Energy Conservation Code (IECC) or another energy
efficiency code that is generally accepted and used by engineers and the construction
industry. Current law requires that Commerce review the code on a regular basis,
including whenever there is a revision of the IECC, and update the code accordingly.

This bill requires Commerce to incorporate into the energy conservation code
a standard that is based upon a specific standard of the American Society of Heating,
Refrigerating and Air Conditioning Engineers (ASHRAE) and eliminates the
requirement to use other standards specified under current law. As with the revision
requirements under current law, the bill requires Commerce to update the code
whenever the ASHRAE standard is revised.

Current law also requires Commerce to promulgate rules for ventilation
systems in public buildings and places of employment. This bill requires Commerce
to incorporate a specific ASHRAE standard into those rules and to update the rules
when the standard is revised.

Under current law, a city, village, town, or county may exercise jurisdiction over
the construction of new dwellings by passing an ordinance, provided that the
ordinance meets the requirements of the one- and two-family dwelling code under
current law, this bill provides that such an ordinance may exceed the requirements
of that code as they relate to energy conservation in the construction of new
dwellings.

This bill authorizes Commerce to promulgate rules that establish standards for
the installation of graywater and rainwater systems and that authorize the reuse of
graywater and rainwater within the building, or on the property surrounding the
building, from which the graywater or rainwater was generated. Under the bill,
graywater is defined as wastewater generated from the use of a clothes washer, sink,
shower, or bathtub.

This bill also imposes on a political subdivision (any city, village, town, or
county) certain requirements for a major construction project. Under the bill, a
major construction project means a project for the construction of a public building
by or for a political subdivision that will contain at least 10,000 gross square feet of
office space, or for the repair, renewal, or renovation of an existing public building
that contains such space if the repair, renewal, renovation, or expansion affects more
than 50 percent of the existing building, or for the expansion of an existing public
building that adds at least 10,000 gross square feet of such space. The requirements
imposed on a political subdivision under the bill are based on the requirements that
the bill imposes on DOA and the Building Commission for a major state construction
project. :




LRB-3485/1

2009 - 2010 Legislature -5- JTK/RNK/PG/MES:cjs:rs

BILL

The bill requires a political subdivision to ensure that the plans and
specifications for each major construction project conform at a minimum to the
requirements for certification at the silver performance level under the LEED Green
Building Rating System, as prescribed by Commerce and based on the standards of
the U.S. Green Building Council, and that the energy performance, use and disposal
of construction and demolition materials, ventilation components, indoor air quality
performance, and water usage level for each major construction project conform to
the standards that apply to a major state construction project of DOA and the

>

- wards-a-senitract for a major construction project agrees that his or goa
Wlll be to ensure that at least 25 percent of the employees h1red because of the

This blll 1mposes 51m11ar requlrements for major construction projects of school
districts. Each school board must ensure that the plans and specifications for each
major construction project conform at a minimum to the requirements of the LEED
G uilding Rating System at the silver performance level, as prescribed by
> The bill also directs each school board to ensure that the energy
performance, use and disposal of construction and demolition materials, ventilation
components, indoor air quality performance, and water usage level for each major
construction project conform to standards specified by Commerce that are derived

from various national and international building codes.
{ For further information see the state and local fiscal estimate, which will be
printed as an appendix to this bill.

The people of the state of Wisconsin, represented in senate and assembly, do
enact as follows:

1 SEcTION 1. 13.48 (2) (jm) of the statutes is created to read:

2 13.48 (2) (jm) 1. In this paragraph, “conditioned space” means space that is
3 designed to have controlled environmental conditions.

4 2. The building commission shall not approve the design or construction of any
5 project for the construction of any building, structure, or facility for a board, agency,
6 officer, department, commission, or body corporate, if the building, structure, or
7 facility after construction will contain at least 10,000 gross square feet of conditioned
8 space for occupancy by any such entity, or of any project for the repair, renewal,
9 renovation or expansion of any existing building, structure, or facility for occupancy

S_Jemxl(a/e vl G€ e 54\,\5 Ay €l /\{{« ke st pqy al masfa,\y
LEED \”L%’\ﬂ\"\hﬂ\ evd ce«n‘\{\c&ﬁdw Fos’ o behetl of e <dhosl dichn cf

4../--



<3 O ot -~ W

©

10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24

25

2009 - 2010 Legislature -6 - LRB-3485/1
JTK/RNK/PG/MES:¢js:rs

BILL SECTION 1
by any such entity if the building, structure, or facility contains at least 10,000 gross
square‘feet of conditioned space and the project affects more than 50 percent of the
existing gross square feet of conditioned space in the building, structure, or facility,
regardless of the funding source of the project, unless the department of
administration verifies and certifies to the commission, after reviewing the plans
and specifications, all of the following:

a. That the project conforms at a minimum to the requirements under the
LEED Green Building Rating System at the silver level, as defined in s. 16.856 (1)
(f), for construction projects.

b. That the energy performance for the project is at least 30 percent better than
the performance standard prescribed by the department of commerce under s.
101.028 based upon standard 90.1-2007 of the American Society of Heating,
Refrigerating and Air Conditioning Engineers or its most current equivalent, as
documented by energy modeling and certified in writing by the chief engineer for the
project.

c. That at least 75 percent of the construction materials delivered to the project
site but not used in the project and the demolition materials from any demolition
required to undertake the project are recycled in the project or transferred to a 3rd
party for recycling as a part of another construction project for an agency, as defined
in s. 16.70 (1e), or a local governmental unit, as defined in s. 19.42 (7u).

d. That the ventilation components for the project are strictly in conformity
with standards prescribed by the department of commerce under s. 101.028 based
upon standard 62.1-2004 of the American Society of Heating, Refrigerating, and Air
Conditioning Engineers, and the chief engineer for the project certifies in writing

that no exemptions from strict conformity with that standard have been authorized.



(%2 B N

© 00 2 o

10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24

25

2009 - 2010 Legislature -7- TTRRNK/PC MBS e

BILL SEcCTION 1

e. That the project has an indoor air quality managemént plan that addresses
adherence to the heating, ventilation, and air conditioning performance standards
for the project, source control that ensures use of low emission materials and
finishes, pathway interruption to prevent migration of contaminants during the
construction procesé, housekeeping procedures to prevent the spread and growth of
contaminants during the construction process, and construction activity scheduling
to prevent cross contamination of materials used in the project during the
construction process. The plan shall be consistent at a minimum with standards
promulgated by the department of commerce under s. 101.028 based upon indoor air
quality guidelines for occupied building of the Sheet Metal and Air Conditioning
Contractors’ National Association, 2nd edition, 2007.

f. That the project upon completion will attain a level of interior water use no
greater than 30 percent below the interior water use baseline, as determined by the
department of administration in accordance with the LEED Green Building Rating
System, as defined in s. 16.856 (1) (e) assuming that 100 percent of the indoor
plumbing fixtures used in the project are in compliance with standards pl;omulgated
by the department of commerce under s. 101.028 based upon the strictest applicable
standard under the Uniform Plumbing Codes-2006 promulgated by the
International Association of Plumbing and Mechanical Officials or the International
Plumbing Codes-2006 fixture and fitting performance requirements promulgated
by the International Code Council.

3. The building commission shall not enter into an agreement for the purchase
of or for the lease of, or renewal of a lease of, with option to purchase, any building,
structure, or facility that is constructed or to be constructed for occupancy by any

board, agency, officer, department, commission, or body corporate, if the building,



10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24

25

2009 - 2010 Legislature -8- LRB-3485/1
JTK/RNK/PG/MES:¢js:rs

BILL SEcTION 1
structure, or facility after construction will contain at least 10,000 gross square feet
of conditioned space for occupancy by any such entity, or any building, structure, or
facility that is to be repaired, renewed, renovated, or expanded for occupancy by any
such entity if the building, structure, or facility contains at least 10,000 gross square
feet of conditioned space and the repair, renewal, renovation, or expansion affects
more than 50 percent of the existing gross square feet of conditioned space in the
building, structure, or facility, regardless of the funding source of the agreement,
unless the department of administration verifies and certifies that the building,
structure, or facility conforms or will after construction, repair, renewal, renovation
or expansion conform to all of the standards specified in subd. 2.

4. The building commission shall apply all moneys available for its use under
the authorized state building program to achieve certification as of January 1, 2015,
by the U.S. Green Building Council for not less than 15 percent of the total gross
square footage of conditioned space in buildings, structures, and facilities that are
owned or leased by agencies on that date, as determined by the department of
administration under s. 16.856 (3), for meeting the minimum LEED performance
requirements for the operation and maintenance of existing buildings, as defined in
s. 16.856 (1) (h).

5. The building commission shall apply all moneys available for its use under
the authorized state building program to achieve certification by the dates specified
by rule of the department of administration under s. 16.856 (6) by the U.S. Green
Building Council for not less than the percentages specified by that rule of the total
gross square footage of conditioned space in buildings, structures, and facilities that
are owned or leased by agencies on the dates specified by that rule, as determined

by the department of administration under s. 16.856 (3), for meeting the minimum



10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24
25

2009 - 2010 Legislature -9- JTK/RNK/p(‘I;/%/[BE;S?’;?s?g

BILL SEcCTION 1

LEED performance requirements for the operation and maintenance of existing
buildings, as defined in s. 16.856 (1) (h).

SECTION 2. 13.48 (15) of the statutes is renumbered 13.48 (15) (a) and amended
to read:

13.48 (15) (a) Subject to the requirements of par. (b) and s. 20.924 (1) (i), the
building commission shall have the authority to acquire leasehold interests in land
and buildings where such authority is not otherwise provided to an agency by law.

SECTION 3. 13.48 (15) (b) of the statutes is created to read:

13.48 (15) (b) The building commission shall not approve the leasing of, or the
renewal or extension of any lease for, property for use by this state unless the
department of administration has certified to the commission that the energy use
intensity for the total property and the annual energy usage for the total property
conform to standards promulgated by the department of commerce under s. 101.028
based upon Energy Star standards consistent with the minimum LEED performance
requirements for the operation and maintenance of existing buildings. The
commission shall also require other agencies, as defined in s. 16.70 (1e), that have
authority to lease improved real property, to certify to the commission, before
entering into, or renewing or extending, any lease of real property, that the energy
use intensity for the total property and the annual energy usage for the total property
conform to the same standards.

SECTION 4. 16.84 (5) of the statutes is amended to read:

16.84 (5) Have responsibility, subject to approval of the governor, for all
functions relating to the leasing, acquisition, allocation and utilization of all real
property by the state, except where such responsibility is otherwise provided by the

statutes. In-this-connection,—the Prior to entering into any lease, or renewing or




10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23

24

2009 - 2010 Legislature -10 - LRB-3485/1

JTK/RNK/PG/MES:¢js:rs
BILL SECTION 4
extendin lease, for proper e this he d nt shall
require the pr ctive 1 r iscl h r intensity for 1

property, measured on a square foot basis, and the annual energy usage for the total

of commerce under s. 101.028 based upon Energy Star standards, as defined in s.
13.48 (15) (b), consistent with the minimum LEED performance requirements for the

department shall verify and certify this information to the building commission

before the commission considers approval of the lease, or the renewal or extension

of thel . Th rtment shall also require other agencie finedins. 16.7
1le), that have authority to enter into leases for real property to obtain, verify, and

certify the same information to the commission before entering into any lease, or
renewing or extending any 1 for property to be ho ncies. Th
department shall, with the governor’s approval, require physical consolidation of
office space utilized by any executive branch agency having fewer than 50 authorized
full-time equivalent positions with office space utilized by another executive branch
agency, whenever feasible. The department shall lease or acquire office space for
legislative ofﬁées or legislative service agencies at the direction of the joint
committee on legislative organization. In this subsection, “executive branch agency”
has the meaning given in s. 16.70 (4).

SECTION 5. 16.85 (3m) of the statutes is created to read:

16.85 (3m) To appoint or approve the appointment of a chief engineer for each
major construction project, as defined in s. 16.856 (1) (g).

SECTION 6. 16.856 of the statutes is created to read:



10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24

25

2009 - 2010 Legislature S11- STKENK/PGALES oo

BILL SECTION 6

16.856 Energy and environmental design standards for certain state
buildings, structures, and facilities. (1) In this section:

(a) “Agency” has the meaning given in s. 16.70 (1e).

(b) “ASHRAE standard” means the standard promulgated by the department
of commerce under s. 101.028 based upon standard 90.1-2007 of the American
Society of Heating, Refrigerating and Air Conditioning Engineers or its current
equivalent as determined by the department of commerce under s. 101.028.

(¢) “Conditioned space” means space that is designed to have controlled
environmental conditions.

(d) “IECC standards” means the energy efficiency design standards
promulgated by the department of commerce under s. 101.028 based upon the
national energy efficiency design standards of the International Energy
Conservation Code or their current equivalents as determined by the department of
commerce under s. 101.028.

(e) “LEED Gfeen Building Rating System” means the green building rating
system of the U.S. Green Building Counéil designated as the leadership in energy
and environmental design system br its current equivalent as determined by the
department of commerce under s. 101.028.

() “LEED silver level” means the performance level designated as the silver
level under the LEED Green Building Rating System or its current equivalent as
determined by the department of commerce under s. 101.028.

(g) “Major construction project” means a project for the construction of a state
building, structure, or facility that will, upon completion, contain at least 10,000
gross square feet of conditioned space, or for the repair, renewal, or renovation of an

existing state building, structure, or facility containing at least 10,000 gross square



v o W N

© 00 2 O

10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24
25

2009 - 2010 Legislature -12 - LRB-3485/1
JTK/RNK/PG/MES:¢js:rs

BILL SECTION 6
feet of conditioned space that affects more than 50 percent of the existing gross
square feet of conditioned space in that building, structure, or facility, or for the
expansion of an existing state building, structure, or facility to add at least 10,000
gross square feet of conditioned space.

(h) “Minimum LEED performance requirements for the operation and
maintenance of existing buildings” means the performance requirements so
designated under the LEED Green Building Rating System, as prescribed by the
U.S. Green Building Council, or its current equivalent as determined by the
department of commerce under s. 101.028.

(1) “Zero net energy” means an energy consumption level under which a
building, structure, or facility produces as much energy for electricity, heating, and
cooling from renewable sources in any calendar year as the building, structure, or
facility consumes during the same period.

(2) The department shall ensure that the plans and specifications for each
major construction project conform at a minimum to the requirements for
certification at the LEED silver level. The department shall also ensure that the
energy performance, recycling of construction and demolition materials, ventilation
components, indoor air quality performance, and water usage level for each major
construction project conform to the standards specified s. 13.48 (2) jm) 2.

(3) The department shall maintain a current inventory of the location and
gross square footage of the conditioned space in all buildings, structures, and
facilities that are owned or leased by any agency for its use or the use of another
agency. The inventory shall include for each building, structure, or facility
information concerning the conditioned space in the building, structure, or facility

and whether the building, structure, or facility or any portion thereof is certified or



(o2 TG L " o

10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24
25

2009 - 2010 Legislature ~13 - JTKRNK/PG M e

BILL SECTION 6

eligible for certification by the U.S. Green Building Council as meeting the minimum
LEED performance requirements for the operation and maintenance of existing
buildings.

(4) Except as provided in sub. (5), the department shall ensure that each
building, structure, or facility constructed, repaired, renewed, renovated, or
expanded by or for the state that is a major construction project conforms to
whichever of the following energy performance standards applies, based upon the
year in which construction, repair, renewal, renovation, or expansion of the building,
structure, or facility begins:

(a) For a building, structure, or facility the construction, repair, renewal,
renovation, or expansion of which begins on or after the first day of the 7th month
beginning after the effective date of this paragraph .... [LRB inserts date], but before
January 1, 2015, the energy performance shall be at least 30 percent better than the
energy performance under the ASHRAE standard or the IECC standards, whichever
is the most stringent.

(b) For a building, structure, or facility the construction, repair, renewal,
renovation, or expansion of which begins after December 31, 2014, but before
January 1, 2020, the energy performance shall be at least 70 percent better than the
performance under the ASHRAE standard or the IECC standards, whichever is the
most stringent.

(¢) For a building, structure, or facility the construction, repair, renewal,
renovation, or expansion of which begins after December 31, 2019, but before
January 1, 2025, the energy performance shall be at least 80 percent better than the
energy performance under the ASHRAE standard or the IECC standards, whichever

is the most stringent.



10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24

25

2009 - 2010 Legislature -14 - LRB-3485/1
JTK/RNK/PG/MES:¢js:rs

BILL SECTION 6
(d) For a building, structure, or facility the construction, repair, renewal,
renovation, or expansion of which begins after December 31, 2024, but before
January 1, 2030, the energy performance shall be at least 90 percent better than the
energy performance under the ASHRAE standard or the IECC standards, whichever
is the most stringent.

(e) For a building, structure, or facility the construction, repair, renewal,
renovation, or expansion of which begins after December 31, 2029, the energy
performance shall be 100 percent better than the energy performance under the
ASHRAE standard or the IECC standards, whichever is more stringent, and the
building, structure, or facility shall consume zero net energy.

(5) Subsection (4) does not apply to the gross square footage of enclosed space
of any building, structure, or facility that is dedicated for laboratory usage if the
ventilation requirements for that gross square footage do not permit compliance with
sub. (4) in that area.

(6) The department shall assess the feasibility of achieving certification by the
U.S. Green Building Council for greater than 15 percent of the total gross square
footage of conditioned space in buildings, structures, and facilities that are owned or
leased by agencies, as determined under sub. (3), for meeting the minimum LEED
performance requirements for the operation and maintenance of existing buildings
and shall, by rule, specify, for purposes of s. 13.48 (2) m) 5., increased levels of
certification and dates during the period from January 1, 2015, to January 1, 2030,
by which those increased levels are to be achieved.

(7) Annually no later than March 31, the department shall report to the
governor and the building commission concerning the percentage level of adherence

as of the preceding December 31 to each of the requirements under s. 13.48 (2) (jm)



LRB-3485/1

2009 - 2010 Legislature -15- v JTK/RNK/PG/MES:cjsirs
BILL SECTION 6
1 and this section that become effective on a date following that December 31 and the

percentage level of adherence as of the preceding December 31 to the applicable
requirement under s. 13.48 (2) Jm) 4. or 5.

SECTION 7. 66.0902 of the statutes is created to read:

66.0902 Energy and environmental design standards for political

6 subdivision facilities. (1) In this section:

7 (a) “Conditioned space” means space that is designated to have controlled

8 environmental conditions.

9 (b) “LEED silver level” has the meaning given in s. 16.856 (1) (f).
10 (c) “Major construction project” means a project for the construction of a public
11 building by or for a political subdivision that will, upon completion of the project,
12 contain at least 10,000 gross square feet of conditioned space, or for the repair,
13 renewal, or renovation of an existing public building by or for a political subdivision
14 containing at least 10,000 gross square feet of conditioned space that affects more
15 than 50 percent of the existing gross square feet of conditioned space in that building,
16 or for the expansion of an existing public building by or for a political subdivision to

17 add at least 10,000 gross square feet of conditioned space. J
@ d) “Minority gronp member” has the meaning given in s. 560.036 .

@ C 00 @ “Political subdivision” means any city, village, town, or county.\/

20 (2) A political subdivision shall ensure that a person to whom it awards a
21 contract for a major construction project agrees, as a condition to receiving the
22 contract, that his or her goal shall be to ensure that at least 25 percent of th

23 employees hired because of the contract will be minority group members and at leas

24 5 percent of the employees hired because of the contract will be women.




o &

10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
'23

24

2009 - 2010 Legislature -16 - LRB-3485/1
JTK/RNK/PG/MES:¢js:rs

BILL SECTION 7

C}) @1 political subdivision shall ensure that the plans and specifications for

each major construction project conform at a minimum to the requirements for
certification at the LEED silver level. The political subdivision shall also ensure that
the energy performance, use and disposal of construction and demolition materials,
ventilation components, indoor air quality performance, and water usage level for
each major construction project conform to the standards specified s. 13.48 (2) jm)
2y

SECTION 8. 101.02 (23) of the statutes is created to read:

101.02 (23) The department may promulgate rules that establish building and
design requirements for public buildings and places of employment that are based
upon standard 189.1-2009 developed by the American Society of Heating,
Refrigerating and Air-Conditioning Engineers in conjunction with the U.S. Green
Building Council and the Illuminating Engineering Society or that are based upon
the current equivalent of that standard. If the department promulgates rules under
this subsection, the department shall review the rules whenever a revision of
standard 189.1-2009, or its current equivalent, is published. The department shall
complete its review of the rules and submit to the legislature proposed rules
changing the requirements no later than 18 months after the date on which the
revision of the standard is published. :

SECTION 9. 101.025 (4) (intro.) of the statutes is renumbered 101.025 (4) (ag),
and 101.025 (4) (ag) (intro.), as renumbered, is amended to read:

101.025 (4) (ag) (intro.) For ventilation systems in public buildings and places
of employment, the department shall adept promulgate rules setting that

incorporate standard 62.1-2007. or its current equivalent, of the American Society




10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18

19

20

21
22
23
24

25

2009 - 2010 Legislature -17 - LRB-3485/1

JTK/RNK/PG/MES:¢js:rs
BILL SECTION 9
f Heatin frigerating and Air Conditioning Engineers and th 11 of
following:

SECTION 10. 101.025 (4) (ar) of the statutes is created to read:

101.025 (4) (ar) The department shall review the rules promulgated under par.
(ag) whenever a revision of standard 62.1-2007, or its current equivalent, of the
American Society of Heating, Refrigerating and Air Conditioning Engineers, is
published. The department shall complete its review of the rules and submit to the
legislature a proposed rule changing the rules no later than 18 months after the date
on which the revision of the standard is published.

SECTION 11. 101.027 (2) of the statutes is amended to read:

101.027 (2) The department shall review the energy conservation code and
shall promulgate rules that change the requirements of the energy conservation code
toimprove energy conservation. No rule may be promulgated that has not taken into
account the cost of the energy conservation code requirement, as changed by the rule,
in relationship to the benefits derived from that requirement, including the
reasonably foreseeable economic and environmental benefits to the state from any
reduction in the use of imported fossil fuel. The proposed rules changing the energy

conservation code shall be submitted to the legislature in the manner provided under

s. 227.19. In conducting a review under this subsection, the department shall

consider—inecorperating incorporate, into the energy conservation code, design
requirementsfrom standard 90.1-2007, or its current equivalent, of the mosteurrent




10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24

25

2009 - 2010 Legislature -18 - LRB-3485/1
' JTK/RNK/PG/MES:¢js:rs

BILL SEcCTION 11

American Society of

Heating, Refrigerating and Air Conditioning Engineers.
SEcCTION 12. 101.027 (3) (a) 1. of the statutes is amended to read:

101.027 (3) (a) 1. A revision of standar .1-2007, or it rrent equivalent

of the International Energy Conservation—Code American Society of Heating,
Refrigerating and Air Conditioning Engineers is published.
SECTION 13. 101.027 (3) (b) 1. of the statutes is amended to read:

101.027 (3) (b) 1. If the department begins a review under sub. (2) because a
revision of standard 90.1-2007, or its current equivalent, of the International
Energy-Conservation-Code American i f Heatin frigerating and
Conditioning Engineers is published, the department shall complete its review of the

energy conservation code, as defined in sub. (1), and submit to the legislature
proposed rules changing the energy conservation code, as defined in sub. (1), no later
than 18 months after the date on which the revision of standard 90.1-2007, or its
current equivalent, of the International Energy ConservationCode American

Society of Heating, Refrigerating and Air Conditioning Engineers is published.

SECTION 14. 101.028 of the statutes is created to read:

101.028 Energy performance and environmental design standards for
certain public buildings, structures and facilities. (1) In this section:

(a) “Energy Star standards” means the standards prescribed by the U.S.
Environmental Protection Agency under 42 USC 7403 (g) for energy use in buildings.

(b) “LEED Green Building Rating System” means the green building rating
system of the U.S. Green Building Council designated as the leadership in energy
and environmental design system or its current equivalent as determined by the

department.



10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23

24

2009 - 2010 Legislature ~19- ITRRNKPOME s

BILL SECTION 14

(¢) “LEED silver level” means the performance level designated as the silver
level under the LEED Green Building Rating System or its current equivalent as
determined by the department.

(d) “Minimum LEED performance requirements for the operation and
maintenance of existing buildings” means the performance requirements so
designated under the LEED Green Building Rating System, as prescribed by the
U.S. Green Building Council, or its current equivalent as determined by the
department.

(e) “U.S. Green Building Council” means the United States Green Building
Council or any successor organization that is substantially the same organization,
as determined by the department.

(2) The department shall prescribe, by rule, standards for energy performance
and environmental design in buildings, structures, and facilities which shall apply
to the extent required under ss. 13.48 (2) and (15), 16.84 (5), 16.856, 66.0902, and
120.24. The standards shall be based upon the following standards or, if they are
updated, their current equivalents:

(a) The LEED silver level for new building construction.

(b) Minimum LEED performance requirements for the operation and
maintenance of existing buildings.

(¢) Energy Star standards.

(d) Energy performance standard 90.1-2007 of the American Society of
Hearing, Refrigerating, and Air Conditioning Engineers.

(e) Standard 62.1-2004 of the American Society of Heating, Refrigerating, and

Air Conditioning Engineers.



10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24

25

2009 - 2010 Legislature -20 - LRB-3485/1
JTK/RNK/PG/MES:¢js:rs

BILL | SECTION 14

(f) National energy efficiency design standards of the International Energy
Conservation Code adopted the the International Code Council-2006.

(g0 The Uniform Plumbing Codes-2006 promulgated by the International
Association of Plumbing and Mechanical Officials.

(1) Indoor air quality guidelines for occupied buildings promulgated by the
Sheet Metal and Air Conditioning Contractors’ National Association, 2nd edition,
2007.

() The International Plumbing Codes-2006 fixture and fitting performance
requirements promulgated by the International Code Council.

(8) The department shall review a rule promulgated under sub. (2) whenever
a revision of a standard on which the rule is based is published. The department
shall complete its review of the rule and submit to the legislature a proposed rule
changing the standard no later than 18 months after the date on which the revision
of the standard is published.

SEcTION 15. 101.05 (1) and (3) of the statutes are amended to read:

101.05 (1) Ne Except for rules promulgated under s. 101.028, no building code

adopted by the department under this chapter shall affect buildings located on
research or laboratory farms of public universities or other state institutions and
used primarily for housing livestock or other agricultural purposes.

(3) No Except for rules promulgated under s. 101.028, no standard, rule, code
or regulation of the department under this subchapter applies to construction
undertaken by the state for the purpose of renovation of the state capitol building.

SECTION 16. 101.65 (1) (a) (intro.) of the statutes is amended to read:

101.65 (1) (a) (intro.) Exercise jurisdiction over the construction and inspection

of new dwellings by passage of ordinances, provided such ordinances meet the



[ 1 B N - B )

»

10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24
25

2009 - 2010 Legislature -91- FTRRNK/PG M e

BILL | SECTION 16

requirements of the one- and 2-family dwelling code adopted in accordance with this

subchapter. An ordinance under this paragraph may exceed the requirements of the

one- and 2-family dwelling code that relate to energy conservation in the
construction of new dwellings. Except as provided by s. 101.651, a county ordinance
shall apply in any city, village or town which has not enacted such ordinance.

SECTION 17. 119.04 (1) of the statutes, as affected by 2009 Wisconsin Acts 60
and 96, is amended to read:

119.04 (1) Subchapters IV, V and VII of ch. 115, ch. 121 and ss. 66.0235 (3) (¢),
66.0603 (1m) to (3), 115.01 (1) and (2), 115.28, 115.31, 115.33, 115.34, 115.343,
115.345,‘ 115.361, 115.365 (3), 115.38 (2), 115.445,115.45, 118.001 to 118.04, 118.045,
118.06, 118.07, 118.075, 118.10, 118.12, 118.125 to 118.14, 118.145 (4), 118.15,
118.153, 118.16, 118.162, 118.163, 118.164, 118.18, 118.19, 118.20, 118.225, 118.24
(1), (2) (¢) to (f), (6) and (8), 118.255, 118.258, 118.291, 118.30 to 118.43, 118.51,
118.52, 118.55, 120.12 (5) and (15) to (25), 120.125, 120.13 (1), (2) (b) to (g), (3), (14),
(17) to (19), (26), (34), (35), (37), (37m), and (38), 120.14, 120.21 (3), 120.24, and
120.25 are applicable to a 1st class city school district and board.

SECTION 18. 120.24 of the statutes is created to read:

120.24 Energy performance and environmental design standards for
school district facilities. (1) In this section:

(a) “Conditioned space” has the meaning given in s. 16.856 (1) (¢).

(b) “LEED silver level” has the meaning given in s. 16.856 (1) (f).

(¢) “Major construction project” means a project for the construction of a
building that will, upon completion, contain at least 10,000 gross square feet of
conditioned space, or for the repair, renewal, or renovation of an existing building

containing at least 10,000 gross square feet of conditioned space that affects more



2009 - 2010 Legislature -22 - LRB-3485/1

JTK/RNK/PG/MES:cjs:rs
BILL SECTION 18
1 than 50 percent of the existing gross square feet of conditioned space in that building,
2 or for the expansion of an existing building to add at least 10,000 gross square feet
3 of conditioned space.
4 (2) Each school board shall ensure that the plans and specifications for each
5 major construction project conform at a minimum to the requirements for
6 certification at the LEED silver level. The school board shall also ensure that the
7 energy performance, use and disposal of construction and demolition materials,
8 ventilation components, indoor air quality performance, and water usage level for
9 each major construction project conform to the standards specified s. 13.48 (2) (jm)
0 2.
1 7 SECTION 19. 145.133 of the statutes is created to read:
12 145.133 Graywater systems. (1) In this section:
13 (a) “Graywater” means wastewater generated from the use of a clothes washer,
14 sink, shower, or bathtub.
15 (b) “Graywater system” means a system for the collection and reuse of
16 graywater.
17 (¢) “Rainwater system” means a system for the collection and reuse of
18 rainwater generated from building roofs.
19 (2) The department shall promulgate rules that establish standards for the
20 installation of graywater and rainwater systems. The standards shall authorize the
21 reuse of graywater and rainwater within the building, or on the property |
22 surrounding the building, from which the graywater or rainwater was generated.

23 SEcTION 20. Initial applicability.



10

11

13
14

15

2009 - 2010 Legislature _93 - STR/RNK/POMES s

BILL SECTION 20

(1) The treatment of section 13.48 (2) jm) 2. and 3. of the statutes first applies
with respect to projects approved and agreements entered into on the effective date
of this subsection.

(2) The treatment of section 16.856 (2) of the statutes first applies with respect
to projects for which design is commenced on the effective date of this subsection.

(3) The treatment of section 16.84 (55 of the statutes, the renumbering and
amendment of section 13.48 (15) of the statutes, and the creation of section 13.48 (15)
(b) of the statutes first apply with respect to leases of real property by the state that
are entered into, renewed, or extended on the effective date of this subsection.

(4) The treatment of section 120.24 (2) of the statutes first applies with respect
to prbjects for which design is commenced on the effc\aﬁtive date of this subsection.

(5) The treatment of section 66.0902@}0} the statutes first applies with respect
to projects for which a request for proposal is issued by a political subdivision on the
effective date of this subsection.

(END)



LLRB-3485/P6

JTK/RNK/PG/MES:cjs:ph
SECTION 6
1 verititation requirements for that gross square footage do not permit compliance with
\ ‘N“M\W'“"*'w«. {:
i . T, i
2 | sub. (4) in that area. - et
E \\ MW_M,,_M» g}
3 (6) Annually no later than March™3+-the departmer ~st1all report to the [1
4 | governor and the building commission concermirig the percefitage level of adherence

5 \ as of the preceding Decembe{g&%f each of the requirements under s. 13.48 (2) (jm)
o

and this section tpa{’ﬁézome effective on a date following that December 31 and the
o

o
7 ?e}(zg'e’ level of adherence as of the preceding December 31 to the requirement

8 nders. 13.48 (2) (m) 4.

9 SECTION 7. 2(3{255 (2) (ed) of the statutes is created to read:
10 20.255 (2) (ed) LEED fees. A sum sufficient to pay LEED registration and
11 certification fees on behalf of school districts under s. 120.24.
IZWON 8. 66.0902 of the statutes is created to read: -
13 | 66.0902 Energy and environmental design standards for political
14 subdi\{?sion facilities. (1) In this section:
15 | (a) ASQRAE standards” means standard 90.1-2007 of theA erican Society F
16 | of Heating, Re??f‘gqating and Air Conditioning Engineers ;
17 | (b) “IECC stanr s means the most current pational energy efficiency designgéE

18

/
19
20

21

y

22 {lding by or for a political




2009 - 2010 Legislature
JTK/RNK/PG/MES tjs:ph

SECTION 1 o
1 (17)/ o (19), (26), (34), (35), (37), (37m), and (38), 120.14, 120.21 (3), 120.24 and
2 152\(55.25 are applicable to a 1st class city school district and board. //
3 { ZKSECTION 19. 120.24 of the statutes is created to read: // ’
4 120.24“Epergy and environmental design standar/(}s" for school district
,»’f
5 facilities. (1) In this section: f/
\k'“"\“ _/‘r
6 (a) “LEED buildiné“ra{ing system” means the pating system of the U.S. Green

7 Building Council designated éé\tke leadership i energy and environmental design
N

8 system or its successor system as determiried by the department.

pa
9 (b) “LEED silver standard” meaﬁs the

f,.

10 designated by the U.S. Green Buifdmg Council as t

ED building rating system standard

silver standard in effect on the

11 effective date of this paragraph . [LRB inserts date], o< its successor standard as

12 determined by the department.

13 (c) “Major construction project” means a project for the sgnstruction of a

14 building contammg at least 10,000 square feet of enclosed space.

15 , 2 Each school board shall ensure that the plans and specifications each

16 | mgjor construction project conform at a minimum to the LEED silver standard of

17 construction. .
18 / (3) Upon request, the department shall pay necessary LEED registration and

19 certification fees for a major construction project on behalf of a school district. The

20 department shall pay the fees from the appropriation under s. 20.255 (2) (ed).

21 4 SECTION 20. 145.133 of the statutes is created to read: :—r/"{
22 | 145 I33-Graywater systems. (1) In this sectipns—"_ \
: [ e '

, e E

|

23 f (a) “Graywater” means waste WETTE u erated from the use of a clothes washer,

24! sink, shower, or bathtub,

e
e



Co-sponsor request: Energy efficient and environmental design for buildings

Kuesel, Jeffery

Page 1 of 4

From: Van de Bogert, Abigail

Sent:  Wednesday, March 03, 2010 1:18 PM
To: Kuesel, Jeffery

Subject: FW: FW: bill language

From: Sherrie Gruder [mailto:gruder@epd.engr.wisc.edu]
Sent: Wednesday, March 03, 2010 11:38 AM

To: Van de Bogert, Abigail

Cc: Rep.Molepske; 'Sherrie Gruder'

Subject: RE: FW: bill language

There is a simple language fix to consider to capture new buildings for certification:

At completion, the project shall be third party certified by the US Green Building Council. Add this sentence to p 7 line 16 and

p 11line 24. (It already says that for existing buildings on p7, Ine 19.)
Ultimately it is Louis' call of course. I'm just providing the analysis.

Sherrie

Sherrie Gruder, LEED Accredited Professional

Sustainable Design Specialist, Distinguished Lecturer
Energy Program Coordinator

UW-Extension Solid & Hazardous Waste Education Center
610 Langdon St., Rm 322

Madison, W1 53703

Phone: 608 262-0398; Fax: 608 262-6250

email: gruder@engr.wisc.edu

www.shwec.uwm.edu

www.focusonenergy.com

An MPowering Madison Partner. Take the pledge by visiting www.MpoweringMadison.com

From: Van de Bogert, Abigail [mailto:Abigail.VandeBogert@legis.wisconsin.gov]
Sent: Wednesday, March 03, 2010 10:38 AM

To: Sherrie Gruder; Rep.Molepske

Subject: RE: FW: bill language

Hi Sherrie,

It looks like Garrick is correct; the bill requires that buildings be built to LEED silver standards but does not require the builder to
acquire official LEED certification. Somehow we missed this subtlety. | checked with Jeff Kuesel and he said that it is still
enforceable law; if a state building is not built to meet LEED silver requirements (for example) then that would be breaking the law.

DOA must certify that these buildings are built to the right level.

At this point, Louis has said he doesn’t want to do any more drafts. The current draft may also result in a lower fiscal impact

03/03/2010



Co-sponsor request: Energy efficient and environmental design for buildings Page 2 of 4

because we are not requiring organizations to pay for certification, and having a low fiscal estimate is critical right now.
What are your thoughts?
Abby

Abby Van de Bogert

Office of Rep. Louis Molepske, Jr.

214 N, State Capitol

(608) 267-9649
abigail.vandebogert@legis.wisconsin.gov

From: Sherrie Gruder [mailto:gruder@epd.engr.wisc.edu]
Sent: Wednesday, March 03, 2010 10:09 AM

To: Rep.Molepske; Van de Bogert, Abigail

Subject: FW: FW: bill language

Importance: High

Rep. Molepske,

The concern stated below from Flad & Associates' primary LEED architect was discussed at our face to face meeting with the
drafters given that your intent was that the buildings be third party certified to LEED. The language states that the DOA verifies
and certifies that the building conforms or will after construction...(p7 Ine 14; pg 11 Ine 20). While | commented to the drafters
that it is USGBC that is the ultimate certification body, and that the DOA would need to verify design evidence up front that the
project is on the path toward LEED certification with W! thresholds to allow the project to go forward (given that LEED
certification is after project completion), the language seems to reflect the DOA role without including the ultimate third party
certification. Would you be willing to reconnect with them to clarify that this does not create a run around the third party
certification?

Sherrie

Sherrie Gruder, LEED Accredited Professional

Sustainable Design Specialist, Distinguished Lecturer
Energy Program Coordinator

UW-Extension Solid & Hazardous Waste Education Center
610 Langdon St., Rm 322

Madison, WI 53703

Phone: 608 262-0398; Fax: 608 262-6250

email: gruder@engr.wisc.edu

www.shwec.uwm.edu

www.focusonenergy.com

An MPowering Madison Partner. Take the pledge by visiting www.MpoweringMadison.com

From: Garrick Maine [mailto:gmaine@flad.com]
Sent: Wednesday, March 03, 2010 9:18 AM
To: Sherrie Gruder

Subject: Re: FW: green building bill

Sherrie,

One question. In scanning the bill's language I note that it states: '

"That the project conforms at a minimum to the requirements (my emphasis) under the LEED Green Building Rating
System at the silver level, as defined in s. 16.856 (1) (f), for construction projects."

03/03/2010



Co-sponsor request: Energy efficient and environmental design for buildings Page 3 of 4

but doesn't seem to actually require certification. Only later, in reference to total building stock, does it explicitly
required certification, and then only as money allows:

"The building commission shall apply all moneys available for its use under the authorized state building program to
achieve certification ...by the U.S. Green Building Council for not less than 15 percent of the total gross square footage
of conditioned space in buildings, structures, and facilities that are owned or leased by agencies..."

The accompanying summary from Representative Molepske states that buildings bound by this bill will require
certification. I've seen similar language like this before. The U.S. Army is a case in point. They require that all of
their projects meet LEED requirements but don't require actual project certification. Request for LEED certification is
made and must be approved on an individual project basis by the local base or project team. Am I right to voice some
concern here?

- Qarrick

On 3/2/2010 4:25 PM, Sherrie Gruder wrote:

Garrick,

For your review is a green building bill that addresses state, local government and school projects.

Please contact Rep. Molepske's office with support, comments or concerns at 267-96439. It is in process to be heard this floor
session that ends in April.

Sherrie

Sherrie Gruder, LEED Accredited Professional

Sustainable Design Specialist, Distinguished Lecturer
Energy Program Coordinator

UW-Extension Solid & Hazardous Waste Education Center
610 Langdon St., Rm 322

Madison, W| 53703

Phone: 608 262-0398; Fax: 608 262-6250

email: gruder@engr.wisc.edu

www.shwec.uwm.edu

www.focusonenergy.com

An MPowering Madison Partner. Take the pledge by visiting www.MpoweringMadison.com

From: Rep.Molepske [mailto:Rep.Molepske@legis.wisconsin.gov]

High Performance Green Building Bill

The High Performance Green Building Bill sets the bar for saving both energy and water in public buildings in
Wisconsin, saving tax dollars, energy, and water and reducing our dependence on foreign energy sources. The High
Performance Green Building Bill will ensure that the Wisconsin government leads by example by reducing energy use
of its new and existing buildings and by creating healthy and resource efficient spaces for workers and students. This
bill codifies and builds upon the Governor's High Performance Green Building and Energy Conservation Executive

03/03/2010



Co-sponsor request: Energy efficient and environmental design for buildings Page 4 of 4
Order (EO145) of 2006.

Features

o New state, municipal and school buildings (including renovations and leaseholds of the state) will be
required to certify to LEED at the silver level.

o There are additional Wisconsin-specific thresholds for these buildings relating to energy, water
conservation, construction/demolition materials recycling, and indoor air quality.

o The bill requires that the state upgrade 15 percent of the gross square footage of existing state buildings to
LEED EB:O&M standards.

e State leaseholds must measure and disclose their energy use and meet Energy Star standards.
o New state buildings, on a progressive time table, will be designed to achieve zero net energy by 2030.
o) Gray water and rainwater systems that reuse the water within the building will be authorized through rules

to be developed by Department of Commerce.

Green buildings lessen the huge environmental impacts and operational costs of buildings to taxpayers. Green buildings
typically achieve 26% reduced energy consumption, 13% lower maintenance costs ($2.88/SF vs. $3.30/SF), 27%
higher occupant satisfaction and 33% reduction in carbon dioxide emissions compared to the national average (as
measured by the US General Services Administration). The move toward sustainable, high performance design is
addressed nationwide by applying the LEED Green Building Rating System (www.usgbc.org) — Leadership in Energy
and Environmental Design- and ENERGY STAR (www.energystar.gov/).

A copy of the bill is attached.

<<(09-34851.pdf>>

03/03/2010



