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Gary, Aaron

From: McGinn, Reed - DOT <Reed.McGinn@dot.wi.gov>

Sent: Wednesday, August 22, 2012 11:30 AM

To: Gary, Aaron

Subject: FW: LBR 4296/P2Topic: Development costs for special plates
Attachments: 11-4296P2 pdf

Hi Aaron, | met briefly with OPBF today and they have some concerns regarding how the deposits are structured in the
draft. OPBF suggested a conference call with you. Is that okay? Do I need to ask Tricia if that is okay with Sen. Lazich’s
office?

From: McGinn, Reed - DOT

Sent: Monday, August 06, 2012 12:49 PM

To: Warren, Mitchell - DOT; Stanczyk, Gerri - DOT; Richter, Anna - DOT; Yee, Ramona - DOT
Cc: McGinn, Reed - DOT

Subject: FW: LBR 4296/P2Topic: Development costs for special plates

Here is version 2.0 of the Lions/Harley draft, t have not had time to review this yet. See Aaron’s comments below in this

emal chain | q//p 4/(, {,J/ R,Q{’A 0\“{& ‘{}V\’\ﬂ 0""}

Anna, do we need to set up another meeting to discuss? y
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Subject: FW: LBR 4296/P2Topic: Development costs for special plates {
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/P2 needs review. Please advise Trish (with cc to me) once reviewed. Thanks!
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Reed,

Aﬁached above is the p2 draft of that Development costs for special plates bill. Aaron Gary over at
LRB sent the reasons why he drafted the bill the way he did below. Please take a look at the bill and
at Aaron's thoughts and let me know what you think.

Thank you again for looking all of this over.

Tricia
Senator Lazich's office

From: Gary, Aaron

Sent: Tuesday, July 31, 2012 3:18 PM

To: Sieg, Tricia

Subject: RE: LRB 11-4296/P1 Topic: Development costs for special plates

[ should have mentioned that the /P2 draft assumes that DOT will hit the $23,700 mark in Lions plate fees by June 30,
2016. Given the calculation below of 20 plates per month, this seems like a safe assumption.

Aaron

From: Gary, Aaron

Sent: Tuesday, July 31, 2012 3:08 PM

To: Sieg, Tricia

Subject: RE: LRB 11-4296/P1 Topic: Development costs for special plates

Hi Tricia,
[ redrafted this as a /P2. After talking this over with Jon Dyck and considering the DOT comments below, | believe that
the approach taken in the /P1 draft is appropriate but | did tweak the provisions somewhat.

On the Lions plates, the funding mechanism makes this more complicated than what might appear at first blush. When
DOT receives the Lions plate fees, it deposits them into the transportation fund until it receives $23,700, then they are
deposited into the general fund. On page 3, line 1 of the /P1 draft, DOT has already deposited $9,025 into the
transportation fund, so | cannot revise this number back to $6,580 and pretend that the extra $2 445 actually got
deposited into the general fund, because that is water under the bridge and that did not happen. The draft has to be
structured to accurately reflect to which fund moneys were deposited and to ensure that repayments are coming from the
proper fund. I also see no need to amend the (eg) and (eh) appropriations.

You should have a /P2 draft shortly. I'm hoping that it will satisfy DOT and everybody else.

As I've said before, it is impossible to perfectly correct the funding mechanism at this point. DOT was appropriated the
money to pay for plate development costs in the 2009 session, and that money has either been spent or tapsed. Drafting
a bill for 2013, two biennia later, is not a technically effective way of having DOT "repay" the excess money it received, but
itis the best we can do and fortunately the sums here are relatively small (for DOT that is, perhaps not for the charitable
organizations).

I did not include a d-note on the /P2. Feel free to forward this email to DOT if you'd like.

Aaron




Aaron R..Gary

Attorney, Legislative Reference Bureau
608.261.6926 (voice)

608.264.6948 (fax)
aaron.gary@legis.state.wi.us

From: Sieg, Tricia

Sent: Thursday, July 26, 2012 1:21 PM

To: Gary, Aaron

Subject: LRB 11-4296/P1 Topic: Development costs for special plates

Aaron,

Happy July! Hope all is well and your keeping cool over at LRB.

| sent the P-draft to DOT and they came back with a couple of changes.

If you don't see any problems could we get a P2 with the changes they suggested drafted?

Thank you again for your help

Tricia

From: McGinn, Reed - DOT [mailto:Reed.McGinn@dot.wi.gov]

Sent: Thursday, July 26, 2012 1:13 PM

To: Sieg, Tricia

Subject: FW: LRB 11-4296/P1 Topic: Development costs for special plates

Hi Tricia, below are some changes we identified on our end. Please call me at your convenience if you'd like to
discuss.

Thanks much,

Reed MeGinn

Legislative Liaison

Division of Motor Vehicles

Wisconsin Department of Transportation
608-266-7857

Section 2
+ Line 1: Change plate development costs to $6,580 (59,025 was the amount collected for Lions as of the end of
May)
Section 3
¢ Line 8: Update the appropriation to 20.395(5)(eh) per Anna Richter and Mona Yee (OPBF).
e line 14: Update the appropriation to 20.395(5)(eg) per Anna and Mona
e Line 15: DMV issues about 20 Lions plates a month, so the refund to Lions will be a difficult moving target to
pin down. In lieu of assigning the amount of money to refund to Lions, we want to calculate that amount when
the bill becomes effective. The Department will make a payment of any monies collected in excess of $6,580 as
of the effective date of the bill.
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From: LRB.Legal

Sent: Monday, July 16, 2012 12:20 PM

To: Sen.Lazich

Subject: Draft review: LRB 11-4296/P1 Topic: Development costs for special plates

Following is the PDF version of draft LRB 11-4296/P1 and drafter's note.




Gary, Aaron

From: Richter, Anna - DOT <Anna.Richter@dot.wi.gov>

Sent: Monday, September 17, 2012 9:58 AM

To: Gary, Aaron

Subject: RE: LBR 4296/P2Topic: Development costs for special plates
Hi Aaron,

Sorry for delay getting back to you-trying to get our biennial budget together for today.

But yes, that's correct, all the revenues have been deposited and credited to the appropriation under s.20.395(5)(eg).

From: Gary, Aaron [mailto:Aaron.Gary@legis.wisconsin.govl
Sent: Tuesday, September 11, 2012 9:54 AM

To: Richter, Anna - DOT

Subject: RE: LBR 4296/P2Topic: Development costs for special plates

Hi Anna,

A follow up question on this.

For the Lions Club plates, you and Mona said all the plate fee collections have been deposited in the general
fund and are still there. (I realize a portion will be transferred back to the transportation fund later.) Were all of these
moneys deposited and credited to the appropriation under s. 20.395 (5) (eg)? Or were they deposited but not yet
credited to any appropriation?

Thanks. Aaron

Aaron R. Gary

Attorney, Legislative Reference Bureau

608.261.6926 (voice)

608.264.6948 (fax)

aaron.gary@leqgis. state. wi.us J
From: Richter, Anna - DOT [mailto:Anna.Richter@dot.wi.gov]
Sent: Tuesday, September 04, 2012 2:21 PM

To: Gary, Aaron
Subject: RE: LBR 4296/P2Topic: Development costs for special plates

Hi Aaron,

Any time tomorrow work for you to discuss this?
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AN AcT ,/, relating to: the Department of Transportation’s initial costs of

production for special registration plates supporting the Lions Clubs of

Wisconsin and supporting motorcycle safety.

Analysis by the Legislative Reference Bureau

Under current law, as created in 2009 Wisconsin Acts 224 and 226, persons
interested in supporting the Lions Clubs of Wisconsin or motorcycle safety may
obtain special registration plates for certain vehicles, including automobiles. These
special plates must, respectively, display a logo or image of the lion associated with
the Lions Clubs International or display a bar and shield logo associated with
Harley-Davidson, Inc., and the words “share the road.” An applicant for these
special plates must pay a $25 annual fee in addition to the regular vehicle
registration fees. The $25 annual fee provides funds to the Wisconsin Lions
Foundation, Inc., or for certain motorcycle safety activities, respectively. However,
the Department of Transportation (DOT) may not provide funds to the Wisconsin
Lions Foundation, Inc., or for these safety activities, until DOT has received $23,700
for the initial costs of productlon of each of these special plates.

This bill decreases the amount of revenues retained by DOT for the initial costs
of production of these special plates, from $23,700 to $6,580 for Lions Club plates and
from $23,700 to $16,100 for motorcycle safety plates.
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For further information see the state fiscal estimate, which will be printed as
an appendix to this bill.

The people of the state of Wisconsin, represented in senate and assembly, do
enact as follows:

X
SECTION 1. 341.14 (6r) (b) 14. of the statutes is amended to read:

341.14 (6r) (b) 14. Subject to sub. (9) (d), a fee of $25 that is in addition to the
fee under subd. 2. shall be charged for the issuance or renewal of a plate issued on
an annual basis for the special group specified under par. (f) 61m. Subject to sub. (9)
(d), a fee of $50 that is in addition to the fee under subd. 2. shall be charged for the
issuance or renewal of a plate issued on the biennial basis for the special group
specified under par. (f) 61m. if the plate is issued or renewed during the first year of
the biennial registration period or $25 for the issuance or renewal if the plate is
issued or renewed during the 2nd year of the biennial registration period. All moneys
received under this subdivision, in excess of $23,700 $6.,580 for the initial costs of
production of the special group plate under par. (f) 61m., shall be deposited into the
general fund and credited to the appropriation under s. 20.395 (5) (eg). To the extent
permitted under ch. 71, the fee under this subdivision is deductible as a charitable

contribution for purposes of the taxes under ch. 71.

History: 1971 c. 164 5. 83; 1971 ¢. 299; 1975 ¢. 384, 417; 1977 c. 16; 1977 c. 29 ss. 1417, 1418, 1654 (7) (a). (¢); 1977 c. 43, 183,292, 418, 447; 1979 . 236; 1981 c. 255;
1983 a. 227, 430, S11; 1985 a. 29, 55; 1985 a. 87 ss. 1, 5; 1985 a. 124, 202; 1985 a. 332 ss. 191, 251 (4; 1987 a. 19, 64, 112, 145, 315, 399, 403: 1989 a. 31, 54,56, 137,302,
304,312, 359; 1991 a. 2, 39, 100, 240; 1993 a. 16,291, 303, 415, 491; 1995 a. 147, 253, 255, 445; 1997 a. 27, 67.252, 255; 1999 a. 9, 32, 80, 92, 167, 186; 2001 a. 16, 38, 103,
109; 2003 a. 83, 184; 2005 a. 22, 25, 109, 199, 260, 319, 472; 2007 a. 38, 97, 'IX% 120, 160, 194, 2009 a. 28, 135, 159, 182, 195, 224, 226, 230, 246, 340: 2011 a. 32; 2011 a.
260 ss. 50 to 52, 80.

SECTION 2. 341.14 (6r) (b) 14m. of the statutes is amended to read:

341.14 (6r) (b) 14m. An additional fee of $25 that is in addition to the fee under
subd. 2. shall be charged for the issuance or renewal of a plate issued on an annual
basis for the special group specified under par. (f) 61r. An additional fee of $50 that

is in addition to the fee under subd. 2. shall be charged for the issuance or renewal
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of a plate issued on the biennial basis for the special group specified under par. () 61r.

if the plate is issued or renewed during the first year of the biennial registration

period or $25 for the issuance or renewal if the plate is issued or renewed during the

2nd year of the biennial registration period. All moneys received under this

subdivision, in excess of $23;700 $16,100 for the initial costs of production of the

special group plate under par. (f) 61r., shall be deposited into the general fund and

credited to the appropriation account under s. 20.395 (5) (eh).

History: 1971 c. 164 5. 83; 1971 ¢. 299; 1975 ¢. 384, 417; 1977 ¢. 16; 1977 ¢. 29 s5. 1417, 1418, 1654 (7} (@), (e); 1977 ¢, 43, 183,292, 418, 447; 1979 ¢. 236; 1981 ¢. 255;
» 35 1985 a. 124, 202; 1985 a. 332 55, 191, 251 (4); 1987 a. 19, 64, 112, 145, 315, 399, 403; 1989 a. 31, 54, 56, 137, 302,
, 303,415,491, 1995 a. 147,253,255, 445, 1997 a. 27, 67, 252, 255; 1999 a. 9, 32, 80, 92, 167, 186; 2001 a. 16, 38, 103,
109; 2003 a. 83, 184; 2005 a. 22, 25, 109, 199, 260, 319, 472; 2007 a. 38, 97, 107, 120, 160, 194; 2009 a. 28, 135, 159, 182, 195, 224, 226, 230, 246, 340; 2011 a. 32; 2011 a.

1983 a. 227, 430, 511; 1985 a. 29, 55; 1985 a. 87 ss. |
304, 312, 359; 1991 a. 2, 39, 100, 240; 1993 a. 16, 291

260 ss. 50 to 52, 80.

(END)
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ATTN: Tricia Sieg

Please review the attached draft carefully to ensure that it is consistent with your
intent. According to DOT, DOT has not yet taken its share of the plate revenues, so
it is not too late to make this simple change.

Please let me know if you would like any changes made to the attached draft or if you
have any questions. If the attached draft meets with your approval, let me know and
I will convert it to an introducible “/1” draft.

Aaron R. Gary

Legislative Attorney

Phone: (608) 261-6926

E-mail: aaron.gary@legis.state.wi.us




DRAFTER’S NOTE LRB-0035/Pldn
FROM THE ARG:sac:ph
LEGISLATIVE REFERENCE BUREAU

September 18, 2012

ATTN: Tricia Sieg

Please review the attached draft carefully to ensure that it is consistent with your
intent. According to DOT, DOT has not yet taken its share of the plate revenues, so
it 1s not too late to make this simple change.

Please let me know if you would like any changes made to the attached draft or if you
have any questions. If the attached draft meets with your approval, let me know and
I will convert it to an introducible “/1” draft.

Aaron R. Gary

Legislative Attorney

Phone: (608) 261-6926

E-mail: aaron.gary@legis.state.wi.us




Gary, Aaron

From: Sieg, Tricia

Sent: Friday, January 18, 2013 1:13 PM
To: Gary, Aaron

Subiject: LRB-0035/P1

Attachments: 13-0035_P1 pdf

Aaron,

Attached is a P Draft we had done earlier. Can | get this drafted as a regular draft.
Thank you

Tricia
Senator Lazich’s office
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PRELIMINARY DRAFT - NoT READY FOR INTRODUCTION

1 AN ACT to amend 341.14 (6r) (b) 14. and 341.14 (6r) (b) 14m. of the statutes;

2 relating to: the Department of Transportation’s initial costs of production for
3 special registration plates supporting the Lions Clubs of Wisconsin and
4 supporting motorcycle safety.

Analysis by the Legislative Reference Bureau

Under current law, as created in 2009 Wisconsin Acts 224 and 226, persons
interested in supporting the Lions Clubs of Wisconsin or motorcycle safety may
obtain special registration plates for certain vehicles, including automobiles. These
special plates must, respectively, display a logo or image of the lion associated with
the Lions Clubs International or display a bar and shield logo associated with
Harley-Davidson, Inc., and the words “share the road.” An applicant for these
special plates must pay a $25 annual fee in addition to the regular vehicle
registration fees. The $25 annual fee provides funds to the Wisconsin Lions
Foundation, Inc., or for certain motorcycle safety activities, respectively. However,
the Department of Transportation (DOT) may not provide funds to the Wisconsin
Lions Foundation, Inc., or for these safety activities, until DOT has received $23,700
for the initial costs of production of each of these special plates.

This bill decreases the amount of revenues retained by DOT for the initial costs
of production of these special plates, from $23,700 to $6,580 for Lions Club plates and
from $23,700 to $16,100 for motorcycle safety plates.
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For further information see the state fiscal estimate, which will be printed as
an appendix to this bill.

The people of the state of Wisconsin, represented in senate and assembly, do
enact as follows:

SECTION 1. 341.14 (6r) (b) 14. of the statutes is amended to read:

341.14 (6r) (b) 14. Subject to sub. (9) (d), a fee of $25 that is in addition to the
fee under subd. 2. shall be charged for the issuance or renewal of a plate issued on
an annual basis for the special group specified under par. (f) 61m. Subject to sub. (9)
(d), a fee of $50 that is in addition to the fee under subd. 2. shall be charged for the
issuance or renewal of a plate issued on the biennial basis for the special group
speciﬁed under par. (f) 61m. if the plate is issued or renewed during the first year of
the biennial registration period or $25 for the issuance or renewal if the plate is
issued or renewed during the 2nd year of the biennial registration period. All moneys
received under this subdivision, in excess of $23,700 $6.580 for the initial costs of
production of the special group plate under par. (f) 61m., shall be deposited into the
general fund and credited to the appropriation under s. 20.395 (5) (eg). To the extent
permitted under ch. 71, the fee under this subdivision is deductible as a charitable
contribution for purposes of the taxes under ch. 71.

SECTION 2. 341.14 (6r) (b) 14m. of the statutes is amended to read:

341.14 (6r) (b) 14m. An additional fee of $25 that is in addition to the fee under
subd. 2. shall be charged for the issuance or renewal of a plate issued on an annual
basis for the special group specified under par. (f) 61r. An additional fee of $50 that
is in addition to the fee under subd. 2. shall be charged for the issuance or renewal
of a plate issued on the biennial basis for the special group specified under par. (f) 61r.

if the plate is issued or renewed during the first year of the biennial registration
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SECTION 2

period or $25 for the issuance or renewal if the plate is issued or renewed during the
2nd year of the biennial registration period. All moneys received under this
subdivision, in excess of $23,700 $16,100 for the initial costs of production of the
special group plate under par. (f) 61r., shall be deposited into the general fund and
credited to the appropriation account under s. 20.395 (5) (eh).

(END)



Rose, Stefanie

From: Sen.Lazich

Sent: Friday, January 18, 2013 3:02 PM

To: LRB.Legal

Subject: Draft Review: LRB -0035/1 Topic: Development costs for special plates associated with

Lions Club and with motorcycle safety

Please Jacket LRB -0035/1 for the SENATE.




