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board or body having charge and control of the public schools of 
such city of the first class, however incorporated, and when such 
payments are made the interest on the contract shall cease. 
Within five years the board of school directors or other board or 
body having charge and control of the public schools of any such 
city of the first class, however incorporated, shall pay for the in-
stallments out of any funds available for school purposes or out 
of any bond issues expressly authorized according to law for the 
purchase of sites and erection of buildings. No such contract 
shall be entered into until the same shall have been authorized 
by resolution of the board of school directors or other board or 
body having charge and control of the schools of such city, which 
resolution shall specify the terms of purchase, and shall have 
been adopted by at least three-fourths of all members of such 
school hoard or other board or body having charge and control of 
the schools of such city. All such contracts shall be in the name 
of the city and shall be signed, in behalf of such city, by the presi-
dent and secretary of the board of school directors or other offi-
cers of the board or body having charge and control of the schools 
of such city, and countersigned by the comptroller of such city. 
The amount of contracts entered into under this section shall not 
exceed the sum of fifty thousand dollars in any one year. 

SECTION 2. This act shall take effect upon passage and pub-
lication. 

Approved June 10, 1915. 

No. 484, A.] 
	

[Published June 12, 1915. 

CHAPTER 202. 
AN ACT to create subsection 6 of section 1684in-35 of the stat-

utes, relating to right of action for damages accruing from a 
sale under a warehouseman's lien. 

The people of the Stole of Wisconsin, represenhd in Senate and 
Assembly, do enact as follows: 

SECTION 1. There is added to section 1684m-35 of the stat-
utes a new subsection to read : (Seetion 1684m-35) 6. If 
any sale of pAsanal property had under the provisions of this 
section, shall be rendered invalid by reason of a failure to comply 
with any of the terms of this section, no action at law for dam-
ages for the conversion of said goods or otherwise, or in equity 
for an accounting of the proceeds of any such sale, which shall 
accrue thereby to the owner of said goods or his or its assigns, 
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shall be maintained unless the same shall be commenced within 
one year from the date of any such sale. 

SECTION 2. This act shall take effect upon passage and pub-
lication. 

Approved June 10, 1915. 

No. 500, A.] 	 [Published June 12, 1915. 

CHAPTER 203. 
AN ACT to create section 959-35h of the statutes, relating to 

the assessment of special assessments, in cities of the first 
class. 

The people of the State of Wisconsin, represented in Senate and 
Assembly, do enact as follows: 

SECTION 1. There is added to the statutes a new section to 
read : Section 959-35h. Hereafter in any city of the first class, 
however incorporated, when any street improvement of any kind 
is made in any such city and any portion of the cost thereof is as-
sessable as benefits upon the abutting property, in assessing for 
street work, the center line of the roadway shall be the dividing 
line between abutting properties on the opposite sides of streets, 
regardless of whether or not the center line of any such roadway 
is on the center line of the street. 

SECTION 2. This act shall take effect upon passage and pub-
lication. 

Approved June 10, 1915. 

No. 501, A.] 
	

[Published June 12, 1915. 

CHAPTER 204. 
AN ACT to amend subsection I of section 435e of the statutes, 

relating to the authority of the board of school directors in 
cities of the first, second and third classes, to establish and 
maintain evening schools, vacation schools, gymnasiums, and 
other similar activities. 

The people of the State of Wisconsin, represented in Senate and 
Assembly, do enact as follows: 
SECTION 1. Subsection 1 of section 435e of the statutes is 

amended to read: (Section 435e) 1. Boards of school directors 
in cities of the first, second or third class are hereby authorized 
to establish and maintain for children and adult persons, in .the 
school buildings and on the school grounds, under the custody 
and management of such boards, evening schools, vacation schools, 


