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shall apportion and district anew the members of the Senate 
and Assembly, according to the number of inhabitants, ex-
cluding Indians not taxed, soldiers, and officers of the United 
States Army and Navy." 

Resolved by the senate, the assembly concurring. That th ,.. 
foregoing proposed amendment to the Constitution of the • 
State of Wisconsin be and the same is agreed to by this legis-
lature. 

[No. 85, S.]. 

JOINT RESOLUTION NO. 56. 

To provide for a joint committee of the legislature to investi- 
gate the subject of supervision and inspection of schools. 

Resolved by the se sulk, the mssembly concurring, That bill 
No. 720, A., go over until the special session of the legislature 
to be held in January, 1910, and that the same be referred to 
a joint committee of three senators and five assemblymen to 
be appointed in the same manner and under the same con-
ditions as the other special committees; that to the same com-
mittee be also referred. all other bills now before the legislature 
and relating to the supervision and inspection of schools; that 
the same committee is also empowered to investigate and re-
port upon th,  advisability of reorganizing the educational vs-
•tem of the state and placing the state University, the normal 
schools. time high schools, and all other nublic schools, and the 
state superintendent's department under the general super-
vision of one board or commission ; tied that the governor be 
reques±ed to include tbese sub,; cots -in the rail for a special 
session. 

[No. 86, S 

JOINT RESOLUTION NO. 57. 

Relating to a statue of a Union soldier of the Civil War to be 
included in the plans for the deyoration of the new capitol 
building or in the designs or stl'uos to be plaeed in the 
interior thereof. 

Reycl d by the yelled ,  • luass( tebly concurring. That tit:,  
capitol eammis s ion he arid are hereby directed. by and with 
the adviee of the Commander of the Wisconsin Department of 


