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209 .03 Nonpayment of judgment, bar to
business. No insurance company or mutual
benefit society, order or association against
which a,judgment as an insurer has been recov-
eied in this state shall, after 60 days .s from the
rendition of such judgment and while the same
remains unpaid, issue any policy in this state . . If
an appeal is taken the 60 days shall not begin to
run until after the case has been remitted to the
trial court .

209.04 Licensing of agents other than
life . (1) "AGENT" DEFINED .. The term "agent",
as used in this section, means any natural per-
son who acts as an agent as defined in s .
209 ..047 . I t is unlawful for any person to act as
an agent unless he holds an agent's license and
a certificate of registration issued by the com-
missioner except as hereinafter provided . .
(2) APPLICATION; EXAMINATION; CERTIFI-

CATE of REGISTRATION (a) Application.Every
natural person desiring to act as an agent for an
authorized insurer inthis state on or after June.
1, 1962, shalll apply to the commissioner for a
certificate' of registration as hereinafter pre-
scribed . The applicant for such certificate shall
submit to the commissioner his written applica-
tion therefor and shall make a sworn statement
on forms to be prepared by the commissioner
giving his name, marital status, birth date, iesi-
dence, p lace of business and occupation for the
5-,yearr period immediately preceding the date of
such application; and his contemplated insur-
ance business address for thee year to follow if a
certificate is granted ; whether he will devote all
or" part of his efforts to acting as an insurance
agent, and, if"part only, how much time he will
devote to such work and in what business he is
engaged- or employed; whether he intends to
comply, with s. 201 .53 (3) with reference to
compensation` for effecting insurance upon his
own property or other risk ; whether he has been
refused or has had suspended or revoked a li-
cense to solicit insurance applications by the
commissioner or other proper supervising offi-
cials of any state ; what instruction in insurance,
if any, he has had or expects to have ; what in-

surance experience, if any, he has had ; whether
anyy insurer or general agent plaims he is in-
debted to it or him under any agency contract
or otherwise, and, if ' so, the name of the claim-
ant, the nature of the claimm and his defense
thereto, if any; whether he has had an agency
contract canceled and, if so, when, by what in-
surer or general agent andd the reason for such
action; whether , if applicant is married, his or
her spouse has ever applied for or held a license
to solicit insurance in this state and whether
any such license has been refused, suspended or
revoked ; and such other information and refer-
ences as the commissioner in his discretion re-
quires, Each agentt shall promptly report to the
commissioner any change in his business ad-
dress .

(b) Examination. . Each applicant for a certifi-
cate of registration or agent's license (if no such
certificate is required) shall pay an examination
fee as required by s . 601 .31 (17) and submit to
a personal written examination to determine his
competence with respect to the kind of insur-
ance contracts he intends to solicit, negotiate or
effect and his familiarity with the pertinent laws
of this state and passes the same to the satisfac-
tion of the commissioner ; except that no such
examination or, fee therefor shall be required of
any person who makes application to solicit ex-
clusively insurance for domestic windstorm, cy-
clone and tornado insurance companies operat-
ing on an assessment plan or by any person who
makes application to solicit, exclusively, the
kind of insurance for which he held a license as
a resident agent within the 5 years immediately
preceding the date of filing his application un-
less during that period, renewal of hiss license
was denied for cause. The commissioner may,
upon showing just cause, require any applicant
having previously heldd a certificate of registra-
tion - to submit to a written examination and
pass the same for any certificate before effecting
the renewal of such certificate . The commis-
sioner shall require further examination of- ' a
certificate holder whenever such person indi-
cates intent to solicit, negotiate or effect kinds
of insurance for which he has not been licensed
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for any insurer within the last 5 ,years.. The com-
missioner shall establish rules with respect to the
scope, frequency, grading of papers, announce-
ments of the results of such written examina-
tions and the times and places within the state
where they shall be held . The commissioner
shall cause examinations to be conducted
throughout the state at places reasonably acces-
sible to applicants at no less frequency than once
each month.. In advance of such examinations
the commissioner shall cause notice to be given
to all applicants . . The commissioner is author-
ized to appoint representatives deemed compe-
tent who shall conduct the examination and to
pay a fee to each person conducting the exami-
nations as his deputy. .

(c) Issuance or refusal of certificate of regls-
tration, fee. If the commissioner is satisfied that
the applicant for a certificate of ` registration is
intending in good faith to act as an insurance
agent, is trustworthy and worthy of a certifi-
cate, the annual fee required by s . 601,31 (16m)
for such certificate has been paid or tendered
with the application, and the applicant, if re-
quired, has passed a written examination, 'a cer-
tificate of registration shall be issued .. If the ap-
plicant has not passed his wri tten examination,
the commissioner shall notify the applicant in
writing that a certificate will not be issued for
that reason ,

(d) Expiration and renewalofcerhficate. The
certificate of registration shall remain in force
for one year or until the deathh of the holder
thereof, or until revocation in accordance with
this section, whichever occurs first . The com-
missioner may promulgate rules permitting the
issuance of certificates for periods other than
annually for the purpose . of assigning the appli-
cant to a group of certificate . holders having a
common renewal date ,. Certificatess may be re -
newed annually on the filing of an application
containing such information as the commis-
sioner deems necessary and payment of the fee
required by s, 601 .31 (16m) .

(3) APPLICATION AND FEE FOR AGENT'S LI-
CENSE, (a) Application . Every natural person
desiring to act as an agent for an authorized
insurer in this state shall apply to the commis-
sioner through the insurer forr a license to do so
as hereinafter prescribed . Thee applicant for
such license shall submit to the commissioner
through the insurer his written application
therefor on forms preparedd by the commis-
sioner, which application shall include a nota-
rized certificate signed by an officer or properly
authorized representative of each insurer stat-
ing thatt the respective insurer has investigated
the character andd background of the applicant
and is satisfied that he is trustworthy and quali-

fied to act as its agent and tends to hold himself'
out in good faith to the general public as an
insurance agent and that the respective insurer
desires that the applicant be licensed as an
agent to represent it in this state . . The applica-
tion for a license to act as an agent after June 1,
1962, shall include a sworn statement by the
applicant that he holds a currently valid certifi-
cate of registration as required by this section
unless exempt from such requirement by par .
(c)

(b) Issuance of licensed fee.. If ' the commis-
sioner is satisfied that the applicant is intending
in good faith to act as an insurance agent, is
trustworthy and worthy of a license and is a
resident of this state, unless application is for a
nonresident agent's license, the annual fee re-
quired by s . 601 .31 (15) for such license has
been paid or tendered with the application and
the applicant, if' required, has passed a written
examination and holds a currently valid certifi-
cate of registration, a license shall be issued
forthwith, limited to the insurer by whom the
agent is to be appointed.

(c) Nonresident agents. 1 . A person not a res-
ident in this state may be licensed as an agent
upon compliance with this section if the state in
which such person resides will accord the same
privilege to a resident of ' this state .

2 . . The commissioner may enter into recipro-
cal agreements with the appropriate official of
any other state waiving the written examination,
certificate of registration and fees therefor of ' any
applicant resident in such other state, provided
that if a written examination is required for the
kind of insurance for which the applicant wishes
to be licensed in this state, such other state also
requiies , a written examination as a prerequisite
for a license for the same kind of insurance and
that such other state does not require a certifi-
cate of registration or similar form from resi-
dents of this state and that the appropriate offi-
cial of such other state certifies on a form pie-
pared by the commissioner that the applicant
holds a currently valid license in such other state
for the kind of insurance for which he makes
application to be licensed in this state andd either
passed such written examination or was a holder
of a license to act as an agent for such kindd of
insurance prior to the time such written exami-
nation was required.,

(d) Kinds oflicenses. The commissioner shall
promulgate rules establishing thee kinds of li-
censes which may be issued which shall be lim-
ited in scope to thee kind of insurance defined by
any subsection of s . : 201 .044 or any combination
or division thereof.

(e) Possession of licenses.: Each insurer shall
forward the original copy of every license to the
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agent named thereon to act for such insurer ' and
each agent shall retain possession of such license
while it is in effect and shall return same to the
company for which it was issued at such time as
his appointment is terminated by that company
for the line of insurance shown on such license .

(f) License term . . The fee shall continue the
license in force until the following November 1
unless sooner revoked or terminated or until . the
holder thereof fails to maintain in force a certif-
icate of " registration as required herein.

(g) Lists of agents.. . License renewals mayy be
effected from year to year without further aa•
tion on the part of the agent provided that an-
nually, prior to November, 1 of each year, the
insurer submits to the commissioner a list of all
agentss appointed by it to act within the state
together with the required annual license fees as
provided in s . 200. 13 (15) [601 : .31 - (i5)] . Such
list shall show the name, license numbers, kinds
of licenses and birth date for- eachh agent whose
license is to remain in effect : The commissioner
may require such list to include the residence
address and business address of each agent.. No
license shall be renewed after June , 1, 1961 for
any agent who does not hold a currently valid
certificate of registration at the time said re-
newal is to. be effected

(4) TEMPORARY LICENSES, (a) Deceased or
disabled agent . The commissioner may issue a
temporary agent's license without requiring the
applicantt to pass a written examination, to ob-
tain a certificate of registration or to satisfy the
requirements of subs , (2) and (3) except as to
trustworthiness, to the surviving spouse or next
of kin or to the administrator or executor of 'a
deceased licensed agent or to the spouse, next of
kin, employe or legal guardian of a licensed
agent becoming disabled because of ' sickness, in-
sanity or injury, if in the commissioner's opin-
ion such temporary license is necessary for the
continuation - of the business of the agent
thereby : affected. . Such license may be issuedd for
a term not exceeding 3 months andd the commis-
sioner may, in his discretion renew such license
f'or additional terms of 3 months each, not ex-
ceeding in the, aggregate 9 months.

(b) Military service. The commissioner may
issue a temporary registration and agent's li-
cense without requiring the applicant to pass a
written examination, to obtain a certificate of
registration or to satisfy the requirements of'
subs . (2) and (3) except as to trustworthiness to
the designee of a licensed , agent where such
agent has entered active duty ; in the aimed
forces of the United States, for such period - of
time as in the opinion of the commissioner may
be necessary for the continuation of the busi-
ness of the agent thereby affected .

(c) Study and training . The commissioner
shall issue a temporary license without requir-
ing a certificate of registration and examination
to an applicant for a license as agent of an in-
surer whilee taking a preparatory course of
study, instruction and field training for written
examinationn under the supervision of his in-
surer who shall be responsible during such pe-
riod of temporary license for all acts or omis-
sions of such agent withinn the scope of his
agency .appointment., Such temporary license
shall be valid until the last scheduled examina-
tion"occurring within 60 days after the date of
temporary license and for a period of 15 days
following such examination or until he is ad-
vised of his failure of such examination, which-
ever' is sooner .

(d) Fee. The fee for a temporary license shall
be as required in s . 601 .31 (16) .

(5) AUTHORITY UNDER LICENSE; STATE-
MENT ON TERMINATION, Any license issued to
an agent shall authorize him to act as such
agent during the time for which the company
appointing him is authorized to do an insurance
business in this state and during the time for,
which thee agent's license fee has been paid, a
certificate of registration is maintained in force
(if such certificate is required) and such agent is
a bona fide resident of this state (if the license is
for a resident agent) . . Every insurer shall, upon
termination of the appointment of any insur-
ance agent, promptly return such license, if
available to such insurer, to the commissioner
and immediately file with the commissioner a
statement of the facts relative to the termina-
tion of the appointment and the date.. The com-
missioner, shall thereupon terminate the license
of such agent to represent such insurer in this
state. .
(6) CORPORATIONS AND PARTNERSHIPS EX-

CLUDED AS AGENTS. No corporation or part-
nership shall be licensed as an agent of any in-
surance company .. ..

(8) EXCHANGE OF BUSINESS. Nothing in t his
section shall be construed to prevent the proper
exchange of business between lawfully licensed
resident agents of this state ..

(9) REFUSAL, SUSPENSION OR REVOCATION
OF LICENSE OR CERT I F ICATE OF REGISTRA-
TION. (a) Grounds. A certificate of registration
or license may be refused, suspended or revoked
or the renewal thereof refused by the commis-
sioner, if he findss that the applicant for, or
holder

1 . Has wilfully violated any provision of the
insurance laws of this state;.. or -,
2. Has intentionally made a materiall misstate-

ment in the application for such certificate .or,
license; or
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and upon his refusal to permit such inspection
the commissioner shall revoke his license .,

(c) Application subsequent to revocation, re-
fusal of renewal or suspension. 1 . No person
whose certificate or license has been revoked or
the renewal thereof refused hereunder shall be
entitled to file another application for a license
within 2 years from the effective date of such
revocation or refused renewal or if' judicial re-
view of such revocation or refused renewal is
sought, within 2 years from the date of final
court order or decree affirming such revocation
or refusal of renewal . Such application, when
filed, may be refused by thee commissioner un-
less the applicant shows good cause why the
revocation or refused renewal of his license
shall not be deemed a bar to the issuance of a
new license. .

2. No agent whose license has been suspended
shall be entitled to file another application for a
license during such period of suspension . .

(10) EXCLUSION FROM PROVIS IONS.. The pro-
visions of this sectionn requiring certificates of
registration and licenses shall not apply to per-
sons engagedd in the following activities :

(a) Town mutuals, Except as otherwise pro-
vided in s. 202:06 (7), persons engaged in the
business of soliciting insurance exclusively for
town mutual insurance companies . .

(b) Clerical help A person employed by an
insurance agent or insurer solely for the per-
formance of clerical, stenographic or similar of-
fice duties who incidentally takes insurance ap-
plications and receives premiums if his compen-
sation is not related to the volume of such
applications, insurance or premiums..

(c) Incidental transportation insurance The
ticket-selling agent of a railroad or steamship
company, carrier by air or public bus carrier;
who acts as agent in the sale of accident insur-
ance tickets to individuals, insurance on per-
sonal effects against loss or damages while be-
ing'caxiied as baggage incident to the sale of a
passenger's transportation ticket .. .

(d) Fur storeys. Persons engaged in the busi-
ness of fur storage who deliver' to their storage
customers certificates or policies providing in-
surance on specified' furs, garments trimmed
with fur or other garments accepted for storage
and who collect the premium therefor, provided
they receive no compensation for such service .

(e) Newspaper' accident insurance . Newsboys
and managers of newspaper distribution offices
who incidentally take applications for so-called
"Newspaper Accident Insurance" and receive
premiums in connection therewith :

(f) Retail jewelers . Retail,jewelers who inci-
dentally and occasionally take applications for
insurance on their merchandise as it is sold pro-

3 . Has obtained, or attempted to obtain, such
certificate or, license by fraud or misrepresen-
tation ; or,

4.. Has misappropr iated or converted to his
own use or illegally withheld money belonging
to an insurer or an insured or beneficiary ; or

'S : Has otherwise demonstrated lack of trust-
worthiness or competence to act as an insurance
agent; or,

6 . Has been guiltyy of fraudulent or dishonest
practices; or'

7 : Has materially; misrepresented the terms
and conditions of insurance policies or con-
tracts or

8 .. Has made or issued, or caused to be made
or issued, any statement misrepresenting or
makingg misleading comparisons regarding the
terms or conditions of any insurance or annuity
contract legally issued by any insurer, for the
purpose of inducing or attempting to induce the
owner of such contract to forfeit or surrender
such contract or allow it to lapse for the purpose
of replacing such contract with another ; or

9 . Has obtained or attempted to obtain such
ce r tificate or license, not for the pu r pose of hold-
ing himself out to the general public as an insur-
ance agent, but primarily for the purpose of so-
liciting, negotiating or procuring insurance con-
tracts under which he or members of his family
are insured, or under which are insured the offi-
cers, directors, stockholders, partner's or em-
ployes of a partnership, association or corpora-
tion of which he or a member of his family is an
officer ; ' director, stockholder, partner or em-
ploye except that the soliciting of credit accident
and health insurance by an officer or employe of
a bank organized under ch . 221, a permittee
under s . 138,07 (4), a licensee under s . 138 . . 09' or
218..01, or a national bank shall not constitute
grounds under this section for refusal of such
license ; or

10, Has discounted a note taken in payment of
a premium before the issuance and delivery of
the policy to the insured ; or

11 Has misrepresented the financial or other
condition of the company; or
12 .. Has violated any of the provisions of s , .

134.10 or 134 11
(aa) Suspension for unauthorized act The

certificate of registration or license of any agent
who does any unauthor ized act of an insurance
business as set forth in s . 201 .42 (2) shall be
suspended for a period of not less than 90 days
and suchh agent shall not be permitted to do
business until all liability for such violation is
discharged. Whenever the commissioner re-
ceives notice of an unauthorized act of an insur-
ance business he shall forthwith make an in-
spection of the books and records of such agent
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vided,they receive e no compensation for such ser-
vice. ;

(11) NONPROFIT SICKNESS CARE, HOSPITAL,
SERVICE, DENIAL CARE PLANS AND PREPAID
PRESCRIPTION AN D. OPTOMETRIC PLANS . For'
thee purpose of regulating agents of' nonprofit
sickness care plans as organized underr ch . 148,
hospital service plans as organized under s .
182,032, or dental care plans as organized un-
der, s . 447.13, or prepaid prescription plans as
'organized under s .. 450 13, or optometric ser-
vice plans as organized under s . 449 .15 :

(a) "Agents" as used in this section includes
any sales representative soliciting, negotiating or
effecting such contracts or sickness care as per-
mitted by ch 148 or hospital service as permit-
ted by s. 182 .032 but excludes any regular, sala-
ried officer or employe, who does not solicit,
negotiate or effect such contracts . A regular sal-
aried officer oi .employe of'an authorized organi-
zation or' corporation offering such contracts
shall not be deemed to be an agent by reason of
rendering assistancee to, or on behalf' of an agent,
provided thatt such salaried : officer ., or employe
devotes substantially all of his .: time to activities
other than the solicitation of applications for
such contracts and receives no commission or
other compensation directly dependent upon the
amount of business obtained,

(b) "Insurer" as used in this section includes
any organization or corporation established pur-
suant to ch . 148 or s . 182 .0.32.

209 .045 Insurance advisers.. No person
acting in the capacity of an insurance adviser,
counselor or, analyst and as such serving any
person not engaged . : in the insurance business
for compensation paid or to be paid by the pet-
son served, shall directly, or indirectly receive
any part of commission orcompensation paid
by any insurer or agent of any insurer in con-
nection with the sale or writing of any insur-
ance which is within the subject matter of any
such service .

209 .047 Agent defined. Every person who
solicits, negotiates or effects insurance of' any
kind, including annuities, on behalf' of any in-
suiance :company, nonprofit service plan as de-
fined by s„ 200..26, or person desiring insurance,
or transmits an application for a policy of insur-
ance or an annuity contract, other, than for him-
self, to and from any such company, or who
makes or- proposes to make any contract for in-
surance or annuities, or who collects any pre-
mium, assessment, fees or dues for insurance or
annuities or in any manner; aids or assists: in
doing either; or in transacting any business of
like nature for any insurance company, or non-
profit service plan as defined by s, 200,26 or

advertises to do any such thing, or who makes
or proposes :to make, as guarantors or surety,
any contract of guaranty or suietyship as a vo-•
cation andd not merely incidental to any other
legitimate business, or activity of the guarantor
or, surety shall be held to be an agent of such
insurer to all intents and purposes, unless it can
be shown that he receives no compensation for
such services. The term "agent" shall not in-
clude any regular- salaried officer or employe of
a licensed insurer or of 'a licensed insurance
agent who does not solicit or-accept applica-
tions from the public for any such contract : A
regular salaried officer, or, employe of an insurer
authorized to do business in thiss state shall not
be deemed to be an "agent" by reason of ten-
dering assistance to or on behalf of a licensed
agent, .provided that such salaried officer or, em-
ploye devotes substantially all of his time to ac-
tivities `other than the solicitation of applica-
tions for-insurance or annuity contracts and re-
ceives no commission or other compensation
directly dependent upon the amount of business
obtained . .- The term "agent" shall not include
the attorney in fact of a reciprocal or inteiinsur-
ance exchange, nor the traveling salaried home
office representatives of such an exchange oper-
ating on a salary basis and receiving no com-
missions, but shall include every' person who
solicits, negotiates or effects insurance on behalf
of such an exchange as an appointed agent on a
commission basis..

209 .05 Vending mach ines for sale of in-
surance . (1) No insurance shall be offered for
sale, issued or sold by or from any vending ma-
chine'or appliance or any other medium, device
or object designed- or usedd for vending pur-
poses, herein called a device, except as provided
in this section ..

(2) Resident insurance agents licensed under
s. 209 .04' to solicit applications for and to sell
policies of personal travel accident insurance
providing benefits for accidental bodily injury or
accidental death may also solicit applications for
and issue or, sell such insurance by means of
devices supervised by them- and placed in loca-
tions for convenience of the traveling public,
upon the following conditions only :

(a) That each policy to be sold by or from a
device is reasonably suited fox sale and issuance
through a device, and that the use of"suchh device
therefor in a particular proposed location would
be of material convenience to the travelingg pub-
lic.

(b) That the type of' device proposed to be
used is reasonably suitable and practical for the
purpose
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shall specify the name and address of the agent,
the name and home office address of the insuring
company, the name or other identifyingg infor-
mation of the policies to be sold, the serial num-
ber or other identification of the device and the
address, including the location on the premises,
where the device is to be in operation . A device
for which a license has been issued for operation
at a specific address may be transferred to a
different address during the license year upon
written notice : to the commissioner at the timee of
such transfer .: The license for each device shall
expire on September l of each year, but may be
renewed from year to year by the commissioner
upon- approval of the application by the agent
and the furnishing of such information as shall
be requested by the commissioner, and the pay-
ment of $3 for each license year or part thereof
for each device. Proof of the existence of a sub-
sisting licensee shall be displayed on or about
each such .device in use in such manner as the
commissioner requires.

(5) The license forr each device shall be subject
to expiration, suspension or revocation coinci-
dentally with that of the agent or the insuring
company The commissioner may also suspend
or revoke the license as:to any device concerning
which he finds any conditions upon .which the
device was licensed as referred to in sub . . (2) havee
been violated, or no longer exist, or that the
device is being used or operated by the agent in
violation of the laws of thiss state .. Before sus-
pending or revoking a license for a device, the
commissioner shall conductor hearing in the pre-
scribed manner and shall make his determina-
tion upon the basis of the standards, conditions
and requirements of this section .

209.06 Insurance ; appl ication ; effect . (1)
No oral or written statement, representation or
warranty made by the insured or in his behalf in
the negotiation of a contract of insurance shall
be deemed material ox defeat or avoid the pol-
icy, unless such statement, representation or
warranty was false and made with intent to de-
ceive, or unless the matter misrepresented' or
made a warranty increased the risk or contiib-
uted to the loss.:

(2) No breach of a warranty in a policy shall
defeat or avoid such policy unless the breach of
such warranty increased the risk at the time of
the loss, or contributed to the loss, or existed at
the time of the loss .

(3) This section applies to fraternal benefit
societies . .

209.07 Estoppel by report of medical ex-
aminer, effect of fraud . If'the medical exam-
iner of any life or disability insurance company
shall issue a certificate of health, or declare the

(c) That there is prominently displayed a copy
of suchh policy informing the prospective pur-
chaser of the benefits, limitations and exclusions
of the policy, the premium rates for such policy,
the name and add ress of the agent and the name
and home office address of the insuring com-
pany,

(d) That suchh device is so constructed and
operated that it retains or has a suitable place for
deposit and safee keeping of a: eopy of the applica-
tion, which shall show the date of the applica-
tion, name and address of " the applicant and the
beneficiary, and the amount of insurance .

(e) That no policy of insurance sold by or from
such a device shall be for a period of time longer
than the duration of a specifiedd one-way trip or
round trip of not to exceed 180 days .

(fl That such device has on it or immediately
adjacentt thereto, in a prominent location, ade-
quate envelopes for use of purchasers in mailing
policies vended through suchh device, or that the
policy itself, if designed to permit such proce-
dure, may be mailed without an envelope . . The
commissioner may by written notice to the
agent;ymodify : or waive these requirements .,

(g) That each such device is supervised, in-
spected andd tested by the agent with such fie-
quency as is reasonably necessary or' as required
by the commissioner, and if any device is not in
good working condition the agent shall
promptly cause a notice to be displayed thereon
that the same is out of` order, and cause said
device to be promptly removed from service un-
til it is in proper„ working order„

(h) That the agent promptly refunds to each
applicant or prospective applicant money depos-
ited in any defective device and for which no
insurance, or a less amount than paid for, is
actuallyy received .

(i) That the agent hold a speciall vending ma-
chine license for each such device ,

(3) The commissioner may establishh such
other rules for types and locations of devices
authorized heieundeY; their maintenance and
operation and the methods to be used by the
agent in the solicitation and sale of insurance by
means of such devices as is reasonable and neces-
sary

(4) The application forr a license for each de-
vice to be used shall be made by the agent in such
form and with such information as is prescr ibed
by the commissioner.: A fee of $3 for each device
shall be paid ` at the time of making application .
Upon approval of the application, the commis-
sioner shall issue to the agent a special vending
machine license. The license shall apply to a
specific device or , to any device of identical type
which, after written notice by the agent to the
commissioner, is substituted for it .. The license
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applicant a fit subject for insurance, or so report domestic insurance corporation, doing business
to the company or its agent under the rules and on June 20, 1909, such bylaws may be amended
regulations of such company, it shall thereby be in the manner provided in s . 20102 (3) (g).,
estopped from setting up in defense of an action . (2) Every such insurance corporation then do-
on a policy issued thereon that the insured was ing business is continued without any limitation
not in thee condition of" health required by the whatever upon the duration of its corporate ex-policy at the time of'the issue or delivery thereof,
unless the same was procured by or through the istence, notwithstanding any limitation thereto-
fraud or deceit of the insured This section shall fore imposed by law or incorporated into its axti-
apply to fraternal benefit societies .. ., cles of organization..

209.09 Percentages paid to agents. Ev- 209 . 14 False statements by insuran ce
eiy company shall at or prior to the filing of its companies. Any officer, director, attorney in
application for license or any renewal thereof fact, manager or employe of any insurance cor-
file a schedule of percentages or kinds of com- potation, Lloyd's association, interinsuxer, fra-
missions paid to its agents within this state; pro- ternal or mutual benefit society or other in-
vided, that the amount of any fixed salary need surer ; who shall wilfully and knowingly sub-
not be specified scribe to, make or cause to be made, any false
209 .12 Action to collect assessments, entry in the books thereof, or shall knowingly
limitation . No action shall be brought by a re- subscribe to or exhibit false papers, or shall
ceiver or trustee to recover any assessment knowingly make, state or publish any false re-
made by or on behalf of a foreign mutual fire, port or statement of any such insurance corpo-
life or accident insurance company, or for dues ration, Lloyd's association, interinsurer, fiater-
or fees on account of insurance therein, unless nal or mutual benefit society or other insurer,
begun within six months after such assessment shall be punished by a fine of not less than $100
is made or, the liability to pay such dues or fees nor more than $5,000 or by imprisonment in
accrued, the, state penitentiary nott less than one nor
209..13 Saving provisions relating to old more than 10 years, or by both such fine and
companies. (1)'When `no other, provision is imprisonment .,
made forr the amendment of the bylaws of any
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