03/08/2000 12:40:08 PM
Page 1

1999 DRAFTING REQUEST

Bill
Received:12/14/1999
Wanted: Astime permits
For: Cloyd Porter (608) 266-2530

This file may be shown to any legisator: NO

LRB-4078

Received By: rmarchan

Identical to LRB:

By/Representing: himself

Drafter: rmarchan

May Contact: John Lippet, Commerce Alt. Drafters:
Subject: Buildings/Safety - fire safety ExtraCopies: MES
Munis - miscellaneous
Pre Topic:
No specific pre topic given
Topic:
Fire department dues and fire safety program
Instructions:
See Attached
Drafting History:
Vers. Drafted Reviewed Typed Proofed Submitted Jacketed Reauired
/P1 rmarchan  chanaman jfrantze Irb-docadmin
01/21/2000 01/24/2000  01/24/2000 _____ 01/24/2000
rmarchan  chanaman
02/04/2000 02/04/2000
/1 rmarchan  chanaman jfrantze Irb-docadmin S&L
02/10/2000 02/14/2000 02/07/2000 02/07/2000
/2 jfrantze Irb-docadmin  lrb_docadminS&L
02/14/2000 02/14/2000 03/08/2000

FE Sent For:



02/14/2000 02:44:56 PM
Page 1

LRB-4078

1999 DRAFTING REQUEST

Bill

Received:12/14/1999
Wanted: As time permits

For: Cloyd Porter (608) 266-2530
Thisfile may be shown to any legislator: NO
May Contact: John Lippet, Commerce

Subject: Buildings/Safety - fire safety
Munis - miscellaneous

Received By: rmarchan
|dentical to LRB:
By/Representing: himself
Drafter: rmarchan

Alt. Dréfters:

ExtraCopies: MES

Pre Topic:

No specific pretopic given

Topic:

Fire department dues and fire safety program

Instructions:

See Attached

Drafting History:

Vers. Drafted Reviewed Typed

Proofed

o

Submitted Jacket

/P1 rmarchan  chanaman jfrantze
01/21/2000 01/24/2000 01/24/2000

rmarchan chanaman
02/04/2000 02/04/2000

/1 rmarchan  chanaman jfrantze
02/10/2000 02/14/2000 02/07/2000
2 jfrantze

02/14/2000

FE Sent For:

Irb-docadmin
01/24/2000

[rb-docadmin
02/07/2000

Irb-docadmin
02/14/2000

Reauired



02/07/2000 10:08:45 AM
Page 1

LRB-4078

1999 DRAFTING REQUEST

Bill
Received:12/14/1999
Wanted: As time permits

For: Cloyd Porter (608) 266-2530

This file may be shown to any legislator: NO

Received By: rmarchan
|dentical to LRB:
By/Representing: himself

Drafter: rmarchan

May Contact: John Lippet, Commerce Alt. Drafters:
Subject: Buildings/Safety - fire safety ExtraCopies: MES
Munis - miscellaneous

Pre Topic:
No specific pretopic given
Topic:
Fire department dues and fire safety program
Instructions:
See Attached
Drafting History:
Vers. Drafted Reviewed Typed Submitted Jacketed Resuired
/P1 rmarchan  chanaman jfrantze Irb-docadmin

01/21/2000 01/24/2000  01/24/2000 01/24/2000

rmarchan  chanaman

02/04/2000 02/04/2000
n m v jfrantze Irb-docadmin S&L.

v ’ [ 02/07/2000 02/07/2000

FE Sent For:

lV\//u %9//4 W



01/24/2000 02:27:52 PM
Paqe 1

LRB-4078

1999 DRAFTING REQUEST

Bill
Received: 12/14/1999
Wanted: As time permits
For: Cloyd Porter (608) 266-2530
This file may be shown to any legislator: NO
May Contact: John Lippet, Commerce

Subject: Buildings/Safety - fire safety
Munis - miscellaneous

Received By: rmarchan
Identical to LRB:
By/Representing: himself
Drafter: rmarchan

Alt. Drafters:

Extra Copies: MES

Pre Topic:

No specific pre topic given

Topic:

Fire department dues and fire safety program

Instructions:

See Attached

Drafting History:

Vers. Drafted Reviewed Typed

/P1 rmarchan chanaman j frantze
01/21/2000 01/24/2000 0 1/24/2000

%917 % A"
g

FE Sent For: C){y\\‘\”

A
20

Submitted Jacketed

Reouired

Irb_docadmin
0 1/24/2000






LRB-4078
12/14/1999 10:06:17 AM

Page 1
1999 DRAFTING REQUEST
Bill
Received:12/14/1999 Received By: rmarchan
Wanted: Astime permits |dentical to LRB:
For: Cloyd Porter (608) 266-2530 By/Representing: himself
Thisfile may be shown to any legislator: NO Drafter: rmarchan
May Contact: John Lippet, Commerce Alt. Drafters:
Subject: _ Buildings/Safety - fire safety Extra Copies: MES
Munis - miscellaneous \
Pre Topic:

No specific pretopic given

Topic:

Fire department dues and fire safety program

Instructions:

See Attached

Drafting History:

Vers. Drafted Reviewed Typed Proofims,ubnﬁtted Jacketed Required

1 rmarchan C)\{N“ %»L_b y QYL_ u/
T o
I

FE Sent For: \’,vv\

<END>



~

OFFICE:

Room 309 North, State Capitol
Post Office Box 8953

Madison, Wisconsin 53708-8953

(608) 266-2530
Toll-Free: (888) 534-0066
Fax: (608) 266-7038

December 7, 1999

Legislative Reference Bureau
Attn: Bill Drafting Department

5" Floor

100 North Hamilton

Wiscomsin State Wegislature

Cloyd A. Porter
State Representative « 66th District

28322

HOME:
Durand Avenue

Burlington, Wisconsin 53 105

Enclosed you find a request to amend the Wisconsin State Statutes relating to
Fire Department Dues. Could you please have this drafted into a bill? Please
call me if you-have any questions. Thank you for your time and consideration of

this matter:

LS

Enclosures:

CAP: sjs

tate/ Representative
66th Assembly District

(414) 763-6827

, STATE OF WISCONSIN
73 DEPARTMENT OF COMMERCE
ol

JOHN D. LIPPITT
FIRE SAFETY PROGRAM MANAGER
DIVISION OF SAFETY AND BUILDINGS
BUREAU OF PROGRAM DEVELOPMENT

201 W WASHINGTON AVE.
ATH BER B9
MADISON, WI 53701-2689

TELEPHONE (608) 266-1036 !

FAX (608) 264.6795
TTY-TEL/DEAF (608) 264.6777 *

E-MAIL [ippitt@commerce state.wt Us



M’M 0

Proposed revisions with new language underlined and strikethrough for deletions.,

: . o
waj’ﬂw "’ 1 (MQM 107
e 4 '
Section 101.14 Statu&/ ¢! L o A g"@
e : Sj,r»*
‘i01.14 Fire inspections, prevention, detection and suppression. ~ 5 ¢

101 .14 (1) (a) The department shall be the state authority having jurisdiction for fire inspections, P
prevention, detection and suppression in all buildings, structures and upon all premises. As the ‘ .
state authority having jurisdiction, the department may establish a fire safety program for the ‘4, ‘évfﬂ
\rv\ﬂ \%urpose of reducing the loss of life and property from unwanted fires. The department may Q’O
( ake r€asonable orders for the repair or removal of any building or other structure which for
) ~want of repair or by reason of age or dilapidated condition or for anv other cause is esbecially
éo”y liable to fire, and which is so situated as to endanger other building& or property and for the
W _61** repair or removal of any combustible or explosive material or inflammable conditions, dangerous
e \"\ T  to the safety of any building or premises or the occupants thereof or endangering or hindering

W‘ fire fighters in case of fire.

101 .14 (1) (b) The secretary and any deputy may at all reasonable haqurs enter into and upon
all buildings, premises and public thoroughfares excepting only the interior of private dwellings,
for the purpose of ascertaining and causing to be corrected any condition liable to cause fire, or
any violation of any law or order relating to the fire hazard or to the prevention of fire.

@ 101.14 (1) (bm) The secretary and any deputy may, at all reasonable hours, enter the interior of
/\\A“ o | private dwellings at the request of the owner or renter for the purpose of verifying proper

”,)' installation of fire suppression devices and s. 101.145 (6) or 101.645 (4). Q éd:&r]kfbﬂ

101 .14 (1) (c) The department is hereby empowered and directed to provide the form of a

course of study in fire prevention for use in the public schools, dealing with the protection of
lives and property against loss or damage as a result of preventable fires, and transmit the
same by the first day of August in each year to the state superintendent of public instruction.

101 .14 (1) (d) The department may prepare and provide suitable forms for distribution to the
school systems in the state, for the purpose of providing uniform reports on fire drills conducted
during the year in accordance with s. 118.07 (2).

101 .14 (2) (a) The chief of the fire department in every city, village or town, except cities of the
1st class, is constituted a deputy of the department, subject to the right of the department to
relieve any such chief from duties as such deputy for cause, and upon such suspension to
appoint some other person to perform the duty imposed upon such deputy. The department
may appoint either the chief of the fire department or the building inspector as its deputy in cities
of the 1st class.

101.14 (2) (b) The chief of every fire department shall provide for the inspection of every public
building and place of employment to determine and cause to be eliminated any fire hazard or
any violation of any law relating to fire hazards or to the prevention of fires.

101 .14 (2) (c) 1. Except as provided under subd. 2., the chief of every fire department shall

provide that the inspections required under par. (b) be made at least once in each non-
overlapping 6-month period per calendar year in all of the territory served by his or her fire

-1-



’,

department. The chief of a fire department may require more frequent inspections than required
under this subdivision. The department by rule shall provide for general exceptions, based on
the type of occupancy or use of the premises, where less frequent inspections are required.
Upon written request by the chief of-a fire department, the department by special order may
grant an exception to a city, village or town to conduct less frequent inspections than required
under this subdivision.

101.14 (2) (c) 2. In 1st class cities, the fire chief may establish the schedule of fire inspections
in that city. The fire chief shall base the frequency of the inspections on hazardous
classification, the proportion of public area, the record of fire code violations, the ratio of
occupancy to size and any other factor the chief deems significant. Property other than
residential property with 4 dwelling units or less shall be inspected at least once annually.

101 .14 (2) (cm) In addition to the requirements of pars. (b) and (c), a fire department shall
provide public fire education services.

101.14 (2) (d) The chief of every fire department, or, in 1 st class cities, the building inspector

appointed by the department under par. (a), shall designate a sufficient number of inspectors to
make the inspections required under pars. (b) and (c).

101.14 (2) (e) Written reports of inspection shall be made and kept on file by thie_local authority
having jurisdiction to conduct inspections, or its designee, in the manner and form requiréd by

the department.

~101.14 (2) (f) Every inspection requwed under pars. (b) and (c)is subject to the superV|S|on and
direction of the department phich-shall-s ' . 3= .

101 .14 (3) The department shall annually conduct training sessions and provide manuals and
other materials and services to assist deputies and mspectors in the fulfillment of their duties
under sub. (2).

o] ﬁuf M7 5 ﬁ J;P
/ ‘\Q’Sectlonm éu \ﬁ,)' (}&@Q
;,

¥
“ },L 101.140 Public fire education andr\rnjury prevention education fund.
/. 101.140 (1) (a) For the purpose of supporting public education, lncludlng but not limited to
\ » " injury prevention, fire prevention, fire detection and fire suppression devices, the department
— shall create a public fire education and. injury prevention education fund.

101 .140 (1) (b) The department by rule shall provide for the administration of the public fire
education and injury prevention education fund.

101 .140 (1) (c) The costs to the department for the administration of the public fire education
and injury prevention education fund may be charged by the department directly to the fund.

101 .140 (1) (d) The department has authority to distribute funds from the public fire education
and injury prevention education fund.

)



O3

Rold

Lo -

\)/\\}/Q,,(,(,

(%P _, department. Such records shall be open to public inspection, as specified in ch. 19

)

-

101.140 (2) (a) Monetary donations and allocations for the public fire education and injury

prevention education fund shall be accepted by the department.

101.140 (2) (b) All monetary donations and allocations received by the department under par.

(a) shall be appropriated to the public fire education and injury prevention education fund.

Section 101.141, St‘a};utes/

101 .141 Record keeplng of f|res J‘}
101.141 e ST OniN e i _Each fire frre

department shaII maintain a record of all fires occurrmg W|th|n the territory served by the fir¢ flre

<, ‘%&%

ring - v
normal business hours and shall be provided to the department as specified by ruIef?‘

M t

Section 101 .573, Statutes W 3\

101 .573 Fire dues distribution.
101.573 (1) The department shall include in the compilation and-ce+tificatien determlnatlon of ;\
fire department dues under sub. (3) 2% of the premiums paid to the state fire fund for the vﬂ

insurance of any pubhc property, other than state property The department shall-retify-the y’)\ (L

| charge

the amount to the state flre fund

department dues paid by all insurers under s. 601.93 and the dues paid by the state fire fund
under sub. (1) and funds remaining under par. (b), withhold 5% and
determine the proper amount to be paid from the appropriation under s. 20.143 (3) (L) to each \
city, village or town entitled to fire department dues under s. 101.575. Annually, on or before

August 1, the state-treasurer department shall pay the amounts- determined by the

department to the cities, villages and towns eligible under s. 101.575.

101.573 (3) (a) On or before May 1 in each year, the department shall compile the fire V@W

101.573 (3) (b) The amount withheld under par. (a) shall be disbursed to correct errors of the
department or the commissioner of insurance or for payments to cities, villages or towns which
are first determined to be eligible for payments under par. (a) after May 1. The department shall
certiiyiaibe-etatetroasurer determine, as near as is practical, the amount which would have
been payable to the municipality if payment had been properly disbursed under par. (a) on or
prior to May 1, except the amount payable to any municipality first eligible after May 1 shall be
reduced by 1.5% for each month or portion of a month which expires after May 1 and prior to
the eligibility determination. The state-treasurar department shall pay the amount-cestified
determined to the city, village or town. The balance of the amount withheld in a calendar year
under par. (a) which is not disbursed under this paragraph shall be included in the total

compiled by the department under par. (a) for the next calendar year. If errors in payments
exceed the amount set aside for error payments, adjustments shall be made in the distribution
for the next year. . V«
101.573 (4) The department shall transmit to the clerk o each C|ty, V|Hage and town
entitled to fire department dues, a statement of th s payable to it under this
section and the commissioner of insurance shall furnish to the-state-treasurer department, upon
request, a list of the insurers paying dues under s. 601.93 and the amount paid by each. \

-3



I Section 101.575, Statutes

101.575 Entitlement to dues.

101.575 (1) (a) Except as provided in par. (am), every city, village or town maintaining a fire

department that complies with this subsection and the requirements of subs. (3) to (6) is entitled

to a proportionate share of all fire department dues collected under ss. 101.573 and 601.93 after

deducting the administrative expenses of the department under s. 101.573, based on the

equalized valuation of real property improvements upon land within the city, village or town, but

not less than the amount the municipality received under s. 601.93 (3), 1977 stats., and chapter

26, laws of 1979, in calendar year 1979. &w

101.575 (I) (am) If the department determines that a fire department providing fire protection or >
fire prevention services to a city, village or town fire-department has failed to satisfy the rQ
requirements of this subsection or subs. (3) to (6), the department shall nonetheless pay dues
for that calendar year to that city, village or town. The department shall issue a notice of
noncompliance to the chief of the fire department, the governing body and the highest elected C};‘,L
official of the city, village or town. If the fire department cannot demonstrate to the department o
that the fire depa.rfme.ni has met, all requtrnmenfc Wthm Qane year after receipt of the notice-er

8 8 - ater the city, village or town shall not be
entltled to dues under par (a) for that year in WhICh the city: village or town becomes not entitled
to dues and for all subsequent calendar years until the requirements are met.

101.575 (1) (b) Every city, village or town that contracts for fire protection and fire prevention
services that comply with s. 101 .14 (2) from another city, village,-er town or fire department is
entitled to the dues specified in par. (a) if the department determines that the fire department
furnishing the protection can provide the agreed protection without endangering property within
its own limits and the fire prevention services comply witn s, 601:0_}4 @

Gogq O 28

101.575 (1) (c) Any city, village or town, not maimkining a fire department, that for the purpose
of obtaining fire protection and prevention services for itself enters into an agreement with
another city, village, @ town or fire department’is entitled to the dues specified in par. (a) if the
@ department determines that the fire prevention services comply with s. 101.14 (2). Two or more
(_L, municipalities that together have entered into a fire protection agreement in the manner
O\o prescribed in this paragraph shall each be entitled to dues under par. (a). ’p\{”
)

conducted within a city, village or town, that city, viIIage or town shall remain entitled to receive
100% of the determined annual dues distribution.

0
\ (,§101'575 (1) (d) Where at least 95% of the required inspections specified in s. 101 .14 (2) are
\

Y

@\:\?\\’ 101.575 (1) (e) The highest elected official and the governing body of each city, village or towni
O @’ shall ensure the fire protection services, as specified in sub. {3), and the fire prevention

%<j§){ services, as specified in s. 101 .14 (2), are provided for the city, village or town.

S "

101 575 (2) If a city or village contracts to provide fire protection and the services of its fire o \\\

\’O department outside of its boundaries, it is subject to the same liability for property damage and \*
w personal injury when responding to calls and providing services outside of its boundaries as \Q
‘,\\ when providing the same services within its boundaries.



101.575 (3) No city, village or town is entitled to receive dues under this section unless the city,
village or town complies with pars. (a) and (b).

101.575 (3) (a)/ ocity, village ortewn may receive fire department dues under this section (/
unless it mamtalns or contracts h a fire department which satisfies all of the following

requiremen J{ [oo o] { /;, Serags
(e}

101.575 (3) (a) 1. Is organized to provide continuous fire protection in that city, village or town
and has a designated chief.

101.575 (3) (a) 2. Singly, or in combination with another fire department under a contract or
mutual aid agreement, can ensure the response of at least 4 fire fighters, none of whom is the
chief, to a first alarm for a building.

101.575 (3) (a) 3. Provides a training program to firefighters and fire inspectors who are
engaged in providing tire suppression, public fire education or fire prevention inspections, as
prescribed by the department by rule.

101.575 (3) (a) 4. Provides facilities capable, without delay, of receiving an alarm and
dispatching fire fighters and apparatus.

101.575 (3) (b) Each city, village or town eligible for dues under this section shall maintain or
contract with either a velirtary volunteer fire department that holds a meeting at least once-
each month, or a paid or partly paid fire department with sufficient personnel ready for service at
all times.

101.575 (4) (a) The department may not pay any fire department dues for any year to a city,
village, or town e+fse-dapasmesrt unless all of the following conditions are satisfied:

101.575 (4) (a) he department determines that the city, village, town or fire department has
complied wit sub.@d s. 101.14 (2).

101.575 (4) (a) 2. The city, village or town has submitted a_self-certification audit form which is
signed by the clerk of the city, village or town and by the chief ofthe each fire department
providing fire protection and fire prevention services to that city, village or town, which is
provided by the department by rule and which certifies that-the _each flre department has
complled with this section and s. 101 . 14 (2

) W|thm that city,

V|Ilage or town.

101.575 (4) (b) If dues which would have been paid into any fire fighter's pension fund or other
special funds for the benefit of disabled or superannuated fire fighters are withheld under this
subsection, an amount equal to the fire department dues withheld shall be paid into the pension
fund from any available fund of the city, village or town, and, if no fund is available, an amount
equal to the amount withheld shall be included in and paid out of the next taxes levied and
collected for the city, village or town.

101.575 (5) No city, village or town which has contracted with another city, village or town or
any part thereof for fire protection may be paid any fire department dues unless the contract or
contracts are sufficient to provide fire protection to the entire city, village or town for which the
fire protection service is being provided.



101.575 (6) (a) No city, village or town [maintaining a fire department under this section may
use any dues received under s. 101.573 and this segtion for any purpose except the direct
provision of the following:
101.575 (6) (a) 1. The purchase of fire protection equipment.

101.575 (6) (a) 2. Fire inspection and public education.

101.575 (6) (a) 3. Training of fire fighters and fire inspectors performing duties under s. 101.14.

101.575 (6) (a) 4. To fund wholly or partially fire fighters’ pension funds or other special funds
for the benefit of disabled or superannuated fire fighters.

101.575 (6) (b) Any city, village or town that contracts for fire protection service shall give dues
received under s. 101.573 and this section to the fire department providing the fire protection
service. That fire department shall use those dues for any of the purposes specified in par. (a).



Fire Department Dues Briefing

Description and Background

¢ Under subsections 101.14, 101.573 and 101.575, Stats., Wisconsin municipalities are eligible
to receive moneys from what is known as the Fire Department Dues Fund.
The fund is supported by 2% of all premiums for fire insurance underwritten in the state.
¢ Annualy, the department determines if fire departments and municipalities have met the
requirements to be entitled to fire dues.
¢ Each entitled municipality receives a percentage of the fire fund based upon the equalized
valuation of real property improvements within the municipality.
Statutes require 100% compliance to qualify for funds.
¢ The department developed the statute change proposal with the input of an advisory task
group.
Proposal cleans-up language and issues in the current statutes.
« Proposa updates the applicable statutes to reflect the current structure of the state
agencies.
= Proposa alows municipalities to conduct 95% of their required fire inspections and yet
remain entitled to receive 100% of their annual fire dues payment.
« Proposa adds a new fund administered by the department for public fire education and
injury prevention education.

*

>

Objective,

¢ To obtain passage of the proposed legislation, this should:
Reaffirm and clarify the legidative intent to regulate the fire protection and fire
prevention services of the municipalities and the fire departments.
Encourage public education by creating a fund where donations may be made to the
department from the public.



OFFICE:

Room 309 North, State Capitol
Post Office Box 8953

Madison, Wisconsin 53708-8953

(608) 266-2530
Toll-Free: (888) 534-0066
Fax: (608) 266-7038

isongin State Legislature

Cloyd A. Porter
State Representative « 66th District

December 22, 1999

Legislative Reference Bureau
Attn: Rob

Bill Drafting Department

5% Floor

100 North Hamilton

Enclosed you find a request to amend the Wisconsin State Statutes relating to

changes in Multifamily Building Codes. Could you please amend the bill draft
relating to fire dues to incorporate these changes as well? Please call me if you
have any questions. Thank you for your time and consideration of this matter.

66th Assembly District

Enclosures:

CAP: sjs

HOME:

28322 Durand Avenue
Burlington, Wisconsin 53105

(262) 763-6827



DRAFT--NOT FOR DISTRIBUTION

- This is a draft document. It is subject to frequent changes based on additional information andfurther egiting.

Until issued as a final document by the Department of commerce, this document represents only the personal
opinion of its authors or contributors at this time (12/20/99 12:55 PM).

POSSIBLE STATUTORY REVISIONS
REGARDING MULTIFAMILY BUILDINGS

SECTION . 15.157 (12) (d) is amended to read:

15.157 (12) (d) Nine members of the council shall constitute a quorum. For the
purpose of conducting business a mgority vote of the council is required, except that at least 10
members of the council are required to vote affirmatively to recommend changes in the statutes
or administrative rules. The council may not make a recommendation to deviate from nationally
recognized standards for fire protection, building heights and areas, fire resistant materials and
construction, and means of egress, if more than one member of the council votes against the
deviation.

(This subsection of the statutes pertains to the multifamily council and thisparticularparagraph
provides direction for how the council conducts its business. The additional language, that
which is underlined is intended to reflect that a national building code, such as the /BC, is to be
utilized and anv devi atlons either more restrlctlve or Iees restrlctlve from that code need aI most

AT AR QWWI ¥ % G Voo
SECTTON S ; ae w»%%’i‘{?&%r»égad,,

‘1S:create:

)
.:Sw:.a RS TR F 054 Sttt o]

SECTION. 101.14 (1) (bm) is amended to read:

101.14 (1) (bm) The secretary and any deputy may, at all responsible hours, enter the

interior of private dwellings at the request of the owner or renter for the purpose of s—+04-145(6)
or101-6454) verifying proper installation of fire suppression and detection devices.

(This reflects the repeal of s. 101.145 and other statutory revisions under a different initiative.)

Page 1 of4 c:\temp\multifamilystatrevisions2.doc



DRAFT--NOT FOR DISTRIBUTION

. Thisis a draft document. It issubject to frequent changes based on additional information andfurther editing,
Until issued as a final document by the Department of commerce, this document represents only the personal
opinion of its authors or contributors at this time (12/20/99 12:55 PM).

SECTION. 10 1.14 (4m) is repeded.

(This action eliminates the triggers for providing automatic fire sprinkler systems or 2-hour fire
resistive construction. The current statutory triggers makes reference to classes of construction
for buildings which are not consistent with model building codes.)

SECTION . 101.145isrepealed.

(This action eliminates requirements for smoke detectors in public buildings, including
multifamily buildings, that are no longer consistent with national technical standards. Note.
Current statutory maintenance requirements and obligations for smoke detectors relating to the
relationship of tenants and landlords are also repeated in the administrative rules under s.
Comm 51.245 (3). These maintenance requirements and obligations would be continued as
administrative rules as a Wisconsin supplement to the IBC.)

SECTION. 101.645 (1) isrepealed and recreated to read:

10 1.645 (1) DEFINITION. “Smoke detector” means a device which detects particles or
products of combustion other than heat.

(Section of 701. 645 pertains to smoke detectors for all one- and 2-family dwellings, including
those builtprior to 1978. This revision reflects the elimination of s. 101.145. The current
statutory definition under s. 101.645 cross-referenced the definition that existed under s,
101.145(1), that definition is now found here. )

SECTION. 101.645 (2) isamended to read:

10 1.645 (2) APPROVAL- Asmokedetectorrequwedunderthls

section shall be apgres ’
independent testing Iaboratorv |ncI ud| ng but not I|m|ted to underwrlters Iaboratorv

Cavivwmei esewsver

(Section of 101.645 pertains to smoke detectors for all one- and 2-family dwellings, including
those built prior to 1978. This revision reflects the elimination of s. 101.145. The current
statutory provision under s. 101.645(2) cross-referenced that which existed under 101.145(2).
The statute has also been revised to be technically accurate and recognize other listing agencies
not just one.)

Page2 of 4 c:\temp\multifamilystatrevisions2.doc



DRAFT--NOT FOR DISTRIBUTION
. Thisis a draft document. It is subject to frequent changes based on additional information andfurther editing.
Until issued as a final document by the Department of commerce, this document represents only the personal
opinion of itsauthors or contributors at this time (12/20/99 12:55 PM).

SECTION. 101.645 (2m) is created to read:

101.645 (2m) INSTALLATION. The owner of a dwelling shall instal any smoke
detector required under this section according to the directions and specifications of the
manufacturer of the smoke detector.

(Section of 101.645 pertains to smoke detectors for all one- and 2-family dwellings, including
those built prior to 1978. This revision reflects the elimination of s. 101.145. The current
statutory provision under s. [01.645(2) cross-referenced that which existed under
101.145(3)(a).)

SECTION. 101.745 (1) and (2) are amended to read:

101.745 (1) DEFINITION. The definition of smoke detector under s. $64-345- ey
101.645 (1) aso appliesto this section.

(Section of 101.745 pertains to smoke detectors for all manufactured buildings, including those,
built prior to 1978. This revision reflects the elimination of s. 101.145. The current statutory
definition under s. 101.745 cross-referenced the definition that existed under s. 101.145(1); that
definition is now found under s. 101.64.5.)

(2) APPROVAL A smoke detector required under this section shall be appreved listed
by an independent testing laboratory, including but not limited to underwriters laboratory.

(The statute has been revised to be technically accurate and recognize other listing agencies not
just one.)

SECTION. 101.925(1) and (2) are amended to read:

101.925 (1) DEFINITION. The definition of smoke detector under s. +H-1+45-(€e}
101.645 (1) also appliesto this section.

(Section of 101.925 pertains to smoke detectors for all manufactured homes built on or after
1978. This revision reflects the elimination of s. 101.145. The current statutory definition under
s. 101.745 cross-referenced the definition that existed under s. 101.145(1); that definition is now
found under s. 101.645.)

(2) APPROVAL A smoke detector required under this section shall be appreved listed
by an independent testing laboratory. including but not limited to underwriters laboratory.

(The statute has been revised to be technically accurate and recognize other listing agencies not
just one.)

Page 3 of 4 c:\temp\multifamilystatrevisions2.doc



sy

-

DRAFT--NOT FOR DISTRIBUTION

. This is a draft document. It is subject to frequent changes based on additional information andfurther editing.

Until issued as a final document by the Department of commerce, this document represents only the personal
opinion of its authors or contributors at this time (12/20/99 12:55 PM).

SECTION. 101.972isamended to read:

101.972 Multifamily dwelling code council duties. The multifamily dwelling code
council shall review the rules for multifamily dwelling construction and recommend a uniform
multifamily dwelling code for promulgation by the department. Where feasible, the code
standards recommended bv the committee shall be those nationally recognized for fire
protection, building heights and areas, fire resistant materials and construction and means of
egress. The council shall consider and make recommendations to the department pertaining to
rules and any other matters related to this subchapter. The council shall identify, consider and
make recommendations to the department regarding variances in the rules for different climate
and soil conditions and the variable conditions created by building and population densities.

(This revision is coordinated with the revision proposed under s 15. 15 7(12) (d), Sats. The
additional language, that underlined, is intended to reflect that a national building code, such as
the IBC, isto be utilized.)

SECTION. 101.973 (1) is amended to read:

101.973 (1) Promulgate rules that establish standards for the construction of multifamily
dwellings and their components. The standards for the construction of multifamily dwellings
relative to fire protection, building heights and areas, fire resistant materials and construction,
and means of egress shall reflect nationally recognized standards unless the multifamily council
has recommended a deviation for those standards pursuant to s. 15.157 (12) (d).

(Thisrevision limits the department’ s ability to enact rules that deviate from a national building
code, such asthe IBC, unless there is recommendation from the multifamily council.)

Page 4 of 4 c\temp\multifamlystatrevisions2 doc



State of Wisconsin AL

1999 - 2000 LEGISLATURE LRB—4078/2

\ PRELIM Y DRAFT ANOT READY FOR NTROPUTHON

i3

1 AN ACT [.; relating to: the collection and distribution of fire department dues;
2 fire inspection, fire fighting and related services in cities, villages and towns;
3 creating a fire safety and injury prevention education program; repealing
4 provisions requiring smoke detectors in certain residential buildings; uniform
5 standards under the multifamily dwelling code; multifamily dwelling code

council duties @W and granting rule’making authority

e

. Analysis by the Legislative Reference Bureau
This is a preliminary draft. An analysis will be provided in a later version.

The people of the state of Wisconsin, represented in senate and assembly, do
enact as follows:

7 SecTioN 1. 15.157 (12) (d) of the statutes is renumbered 15.157 (12) (d) (intro.)
8 and amended to read:
Pates
@ 15.157 (12) (d)A ine members of the council shall constitute a quorum. For the
10 purpose of conducting business a majority vote of the council is required, except that

11 at as follows:



1999 - 2000 Legislature -2 - LRB-4078/?

RIM.......
Section 1
v4 _ _ : :
1 1. At least 10 members of the council are required to vote affirmatively to

2 recommend ehanges a change in the—statutes a statute or a change in an

3 administrative rules rule.

4 SECTION 2. 15.157 (12) (d) 2. and 3 of the statutes are created to read:

5 15.157 (12) (d) 2. The council may not recommend a change in a statute or a
6 change in an administrative rule if more than one member of the council votes
7 against recommending the change and if the change, if enacted or promulgated,
8 would make the statute or administrative rule inconsistent with nationally
9 recognized standards for building heights and areas, means of egress, fire protection

@ or the use of ﬁre;resistant materials and construction methods.

11 3. If the department of commerce, based upon a recommendation of the council,
12 promulgates an administrative rule that is inconsistent with nationally recognized
13 standards for building heights and areas, means of egress, fire protection or the use
@ of ﬁr{resistant materials and construction methods, the council may not recommend
15 a change in the administrative rule if more than one member of the council votes
16 against recommending the change.

17 SECTION 3. 20.005 (3) (schedule) ofthe statutes: at the appropriate place, insert
18 the following amounts for the purposes indicated:

20. 143 Commerce, depnTment PC

19 /ﬁ 1999-00  2000-01

21 (3) REGULATI ON  OF INDUSTRY, SAFETY AND BUILDINGS W
22 (e) Fire safety and injury prevention M
7 AW
@ education program GPR A -0~ -0~

24 SECTION 4. 20.143 (3) (e) of the statutes is created to read:



10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

23

24

25

1999 - 2000 Legislature ~3- el

SECTION 4

Vv
20.143 (3) (e) Fire safety and injury prevention education program. The

amounts in the schedule for the purpose of administering the fire safety and injury
v
prevention education program under s. 101.139.
SECTION 5. 20.143 (3) (L) of the statutes is amended to read: J

20.143 (3) (L) Fire dues distribution. All moneys received under ss. 103573
v

-and 601.93 and 604.04 (3) (b), less the amounts transferred to par. (La) and s.

20.292 (1) (gm) and (gr), for distribution under s. 101.573. The amount transferred
to par. (La) shall be the amount in the schedule under par. (La). The amount
transferred to s. 20.292 (1) (gm) shall be the amount in the schedule under s. 20.292
(1) (gm). The amount transferred to s. 20.292 (1) (gr) shall be the amount in the
schedule under s. 20.292 (1) (gr).

SECTION 6. 20.143 (3) (La) of the statutes is amended to read:

20.143 (3) (La) Fire prevention and fire dues administration. The amounts in
the schedule for administrative expenses under ss. 101.14,x1141-and 101.573. All
moneys transferred from par. (L) to this appropriation shall be credited to this
appropriation. Notwithstanding s. 20.001(8) (a), the unencumbered balance on June
30 of each year shall revert to the appropriation under par. (L).

SECTION 7. 20.145 (3) (v) of the statutes is amended to read:

20.145 (3) (v) Specified payments, fire dues and reinsurance. After deducting
the amounts appropriated under par. (u), the balance of moneys in the local
government property insurance fund, for the payment of insurance losses, payments
to the investment board under s. 20.536, payments to the general fund under s.

v v
101, 872(1) 604.04 (3) (b), loss adjustment expenses, fire rating bureau dues and the

cost to purchase reinsurance under s. 604.04 (6).

SEcTioN 8. 101.02 (15) (am) of the statutes is created to read:



10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

23

24

1999 - 2000 Legislature —4- LR'\'/'IV3I—4Q78/?

SECTION 8

101.02 (15) (am) The department has jurisdiction over and supervision of all
buildings, structures and premises in this state for the purpose of administering all
laws of this state relating to fire inspections, fire prevention, fire detection and fire
suppression.

SECTION 9. 101:{39 of the statutes is created to read:

101.139 Fire safety and injury prevention education program. The
department shall develop and administer a fire safety and injury prevention
education program, designed to educate the public regarding fire prevention, fire
detection, fire suppression, injury prevention and any other related subject matter.
The department may make grants to support the purposes of the program. The
department shall adopt rules to implement this section. v

SECTION 10. 101.14 (1) (title) of the statutes is created to read:

101.14 (1) (title) AUTHORI TYAND DUTIES OF DEPARTMENT; GENERALLY.

SECTION 11. 101.14 (1) (b) and (bm) of the statutes are amended to read:
v

101.14 (1) (b) The Except as otherwise provided in this paragraph? the

secretary and or any deputy may, at all any reasonable hours time, enter into-and

privebe~dwelErgs; anv building. nremises or public thoroughfare for the purpose of
ascertaining and causing to be corrected any condition liable to cause fire, or any
violation of any law or order relating to the a fire hazard or_relating to the prevention
of fire. M@JMMQ&DEMMMMW
to enter the interior of a nrivate dwelling.

(bm) The secretary and or any deputy may, at all any reasonable heurs time,

enter the interior of a private dwellings dwelling at the request of the owner or renter



10
11
12
13
14
15
16

17

19

20

@
@

24

LRB-4078/?

1999 - 2000 Legislature -5- M.
SecTion 11
v/ o . . .
for the purpose of s-101-145(6)er101.645{4) verifying the proper installation of fire
/

sunnression devices.

SECTION 12. 101.14 (1) (c) of the statutes is renumbered 101.14 (3) (b) and

amended to read:

101.14 (3) (b) The department is-herebyempollE directed-to shall

v
provide the form of a course of study in fire prevention for use in the public schools;

dealing, The course of studv shall deal with the protection of lives and property
against loss or damage as a result of preventable fires;-and, The department shall

transmit the sa

ear form of the course of study
to the state superintendent of public instruction na later than the first dav of August
v

of each vear.
v

SECTION 13. 101.14 (2) (title) of the statutes is created to read:

101.14 (2) (ti";e) AUTHORITY AND DUTIES OF LOCAL GOVERNMENTS AND THEI R
AGENTS.

SECTION 14. 101.14 (2) (a) of the statutes is renumbered 101.14 (2) (ar) and

amended to read: st dass

101.14 (2) (ar) The chief of the fire department in every each city, village or

town; ities) other than alcit @s constituted a deputy of the

department, subject to the right of the department to relieve anysuch the chief from

his or her duties as sueh a deputy for cause, and upon sueh the suspension to appoin*t' oss
\s

some other person to perform the duty imposed upon sueh the deputy. The In a!city

Mﬁmgﬁ%tzh_e department may appoint either the chief of the fire department
6 . . . .
or the building inspector as #s the denartment’s deputy%a-extxes—ef—the—ls&;—elass.
plaM/‘ S g

SECTION 15. 101.14 (2) (d) of the statutes is amended to read:



10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24

1999 - 2000 Legislature —-6- LRR]?/I_‘LWSP

SECTION 15

101.14 (2) (d) The chief of every fire department, or, in 1st class cities, the

v
building inspector appointed by the department under par. () (ar), shall designate

a sufficient number of inspectors to make the inspections required under pars. (b)
and (c).
v v
SECTION 16. 101.14 (2) (f) of the statutes is renumbered 101.14 (1) (cm) and

amended to read:
v/

101.14 (1) (cm) Every inspection required under pars- sub. (2) (b) and (c) is

subject to the supervision and direction of the department;which-shall,-after-audit;

V.
SECTION 17. 101.14 (3) (title) of the statutes is created to read:

101.14 (3) (title) EDUCATION AND TRAI NI NG.
SECTION 18. 101.14 (3) of the statutes is renumbered 101.14 (3) (a).

CTION 19. 10Lff 3) (c) of the statates is create,gl Tore T
'?v.ﬁ .

01.14 3) ( The department may e tal;l? a ﬁre safety p ‘ogram forfth

pugpose of reduting the loss @U{ and property-ds a result of ﬁres ,

SECTION 20. 101.14 (4) (title) of the statutes is created to read:

101.14 (4) (title) FIRE DETECTION, PREVENTION AND SUPPRESSION DEVICES IN PLACES
OFEVPLOYMENTANDPUBLI CBUI LDI NGS.

v
SECTION 21.-101.14 (4m) (title) of the statutes is created to read:

v
101.14 (4m) (title) AUTOVATIC FIRE SPRINKLER SYSTEMS AND FIRE RES| STANCE;

MULTI FAM LY DWELLI NGS.

v
SECTION 22. 101.14 (5) (title) of the statutes is created to read:

: )
PV



—t

W 0w I & v s W N

10

11

12

13

14

15

22

23

24

25

1999 - 2000 Legislature -7- LRR%I—ﬁwsp

SECTION 22

101.14 (5) (title) PLAN REVI EW FEES; FLAMVABLE, COVBUSTI BLE OR HAZARDOUS

MATERI ALS.

SECTION 23. 101.141 of the statutes is amended to read:

101.141 Record keeping and reporting of fires. Fhredepartment Each fire
department shall maintain reeerds Suehord of all fires occurring in-thisstate—

ours within the

record maintained under _this section.

SECTI ON 24. 101.145 of the statutes is repealed.

SECTION 25. 101.573 (title) of the statutes is repealed and recreated to read:

101.573 (title) Distribution of fire department dues.

SECTI ON 26. 101.573{1) of the statutes is repealed.

SECTION 27. 101.573 (3) of the statutes is amended to read:

101.573 (3) DETERM NATI ONANDDI STRI BUT| ONOFF| REDEPARTMENTDUES. (a) ©O=n
oer-before No later than May 1 in of each year, the department shall eempile compute

the total of all fire department dues paid by all insurers under s. 601.93 and-the dues
V4 toqether with any pslance PM 5,“}?(17

MMWMMMM

the amount to be paid

to each city, village or town entitled to fire department dues under s. 101.575.
Anrroeiys=an-or—before No later than August 1 of each year, the statetreasurer

at proper amount to the

denartment shall pay the a



15

16

17

18

25

Seeriond #,
(or.513 (1) (C‘fte)/('
@

1999 - 2000 Legislature -8 - Ll;ﬁ#qm/?

SECTION 27

cit

denartment dues under s. 101.575.

(b) The amount withheld under par. (a) shall be disbursed to correct errers any

error of the department or of the commissioner of insurance or for-payments-te-cities;

v
determined to be eligiblaforpeywertsaderpar(a) entitled to fire department dues

/
under s. 101.575 after May 1. The department shall eertifyrte-thestatetreasurer pay

to each applicable city, village or town, as near as is practical, the amount wh&eh:{

would have been payable to the munieipality city, village or town if payment had been

properly disbursed under par. (a) on or prierte_before May 1, except &&the amount
v
payable to any munieipality city. village or town that is first eligible entitled to fire

department dues after May 1 shall be reduced by 1.5% for each month or portion of
a month whieh that expires after May 1 and prier—te before the eligibility

determination.

oer-town: The department shall include any remaining balance of the amount

withheld in a calendar year under par. (a) swhich that is not disbursed under this
paragraph shedbesnelwded in the total compiled by the department under par. (a)

for the next calendar year. If mﬁpqmnfe&eﬁ;eed the amount that is necessary

to correct anv error of the denartment or of the commissioner of lnsurance exceeds

the available balance of the amount set-s ats Wit hheld nder par.

gag;!the denartment shall make adjustments shallbemade in the distribution for the

- Swore (omme—

next year to correct the error. / enompered | 51.513 WD

Gt 52O
V§ECTION 28, 101.573 (4) of the statutes 1sE:1mended to read:

WP
101.57 (4) ( REPORTING REQUIREMENTS; DEPARTMENT AND COMMISSIONER@

Vv

() and

INSURANCE. ’ The department shall transmit to the treasurer clerk of each city,

1o1.513 (4) Ct'tﬂe) s crented Ao recd

+hat

CO—hOA

—odd stridken

G



10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

1999 - 2000 Legislature —9- LRE e/

SECTION 28

v/
village and town that is entitled to fire department dues under s. 101.575, a

statement of the amount of dues payable to it the city, village or town under this

section and-the,
{he commissioner of insurance shall furrishtestillstatetressarer transmit
to the denartment, upon request, a list efthe containing the names of all insurers

paying fire department dues under s. 601.93 and the amount paid by each listed
insurer.

v

SECTION 29. 101.575 (title) of the statutes is amended to read:

101.575 (title) Entitlement to_and use of fire department dues.

subsection-and-the-requirements-of subs—(3)-to(6) that is eligible to receive fire

denartment dues under sub. (4) is entitled to a proportionate share of all fire

department dues collected under ss. 101.573-and 601.93 and 604.04 (3) (b), after

deducting the administrative expenses of the department under s. 101.573, based on
the equalized valuation of real property improvements upon land within the city,
village or town, but not less than the amount the municipality received under s.
601.93 (3), 1977 stats., and chapter 26, laws of 1979, in calendar year 1979.

SECTION 31. 101.575 (1) (am) of the statutes is renumbered 101.575 (7) and

. e . T
amended toread:  §4 (Geep a5 i wise provdad in His subosection, .

101.575 (7) NONCOVPLI ANCE  PROCEDURE. -I-FE]; ‘department determines that a

city, village or town

subseection-orsubs—{3)}to(B) is not eligible to receive fire denartment dues under sub.




1999 - 2000 Legislature —-10- LIFUB—‘IWS/?

SEcTIoN 31

v

1 (4), the department shall nonetheless pay fire department dues for-that-calendar

2 year to that the city, village or townfn

N Voo rirrw TRt Rl ap
/M—ﬂwﬁepm hall m issue a notice of noncompliance to thechief
no - the applicable governing body& the highest-elected
Vi —If mayor, village president or town chairperson,

as applicable! and to each fire department providing fire protection or fire prevention

rvices to the city, village or town. After th epartment_i a_noti f

noncompliance to a cityv. village or town. the city. village or town is not entitled to fire

'\
omﬂmmb@()

department dues until the

10

11

12

13

14

: v/
15 village or town is eligible to receive fire denartment dues under sub. (4).

16 SECTION 32. 101.575 (1) (b) of the statutes is renumbered 101.575 (4) (a) 3. and

17 amended to read:

18 101.575 (4) (a) 3. Every Ifthe city, village or town that contracts or agrees with

Hee meS'ﬁ/?
@ another city. village or town foAﬁre protection and fire prevention services that

fuiﬁmshmg—the—preteet}en—ean that provides services m@mﬁ le to provide the

23 agreed—protection services without endangering property within its the fire

department’'s own 4




15

16

18
19
20
21
22
23
24

25

?
1999 - 2000 Legislature - II- LRRlil_f/IMS/

SECTION 33

SECTION 33. 101.575 (1) (c) of the statutes is repealed.

: v

SECTION 34. 101.575 (2) of the statutes is renumbered 101.577.
.V .

SECTION 35. 101.575 (3) (intro.) of the statutes is repealed.

SECTION 36. 101.575 (3) (a) of the statutes is renumbered 101.14 (2) (ag) and

101.14 (2) (ag) (intro.), 2. and 3., as renumbered, are amended to read:
{nbro.)

101.14 (2) (ag / bfe Every city, village er and town maﬁeeewe—ﬁre-depaptmem

X‘\— R & LA A
department that holds a meeting at least once each month or& or partly paid

fir nartment with sufficient nersonnel r v for servi Il times. Every cit

receives services from a fire department whieh that satisfies all of the following

v
requirements:

2. Singly, or in combination with another fire department under a contract or

mutual aid agreement, can ensure the response of at least 4 fire fighters, none of

W
whom is the chief, to a first alarm for a building. ?"4?“}}/
3. Provides a training program, as prescribed by dule qf ther t m e n{ L

inspectors

inspections or public education with regard to fire safetv.
V4
SECTION 37. 101.575 (3) (b) of the statutes is repealed.
SECTION 38. 101.575 (4) (title) of the statutes is created to read:

101.575 (4) (title) ELiGiBILITY LT

REMENRIAWI THHELD PAYMENTS.
SECTION 39. 101.575 (4) (a) of the statutes is amended to read:

101.575 (4) (a)

v
yea&o-a Except as nrovided in sub. (7). a city, village, or town er-fime<dapartment




1999 - 2000 Legislature - 12 - L%l?ﬂ—ciﬁS/?

SECTION 39

1 unless is eligible to receive fire denartment dues only if all of the following conditions

are satisfied:

v
has complied with sub—(6) this section and s. 101.14 (2), except that. for the purposes

2
3 1. The department determines that the city, village, or town er-fire-department
4
5

6 . . . .
PQW-r\ spet

@ 2. The city, village or towngas—sabmi%t,ed—e mits an it form which-is |

8 provided bv the department and signed by the clerk of the city, village or town and

9 by the chief of the_each fire department providing fire protection and fire prevention

10 services to that the city, village or town,
11 and-whieleertifies certifying that the fire-departmenthas-complied-with city. village
12
v
and s. 101.14 (2), except_that. for the nurnoses this subdivision, the audit form shall
v
certify that at least 95% of the insnections reauired under s, 101.14 (2) were nrovided

for in the city, village or town.

SECTION 40. 101.575 (5) of the statutes is renumbered 101.575 (4) (a) 4. and
./
18 amended to read: Ao progs! ‘gﬁ_gﬁ_
19 101.575 (4) (a) 4. Ne If the city, village or town which-has-contracted contracts
@ or agrees with another city, village or town, or any part thereof, foff fire protection
21 may-be-paid-any-fire-department-dues—unless and fire prevention services, the
(&L o .
@ eentract-or contracts are or agreements shil uﬁ/suﬁiment to provide fire protection

23 to the entire city, village or town for which the fire protection serviee-is and fire

24 prevention services are being provided.

25 SEcTioN 41. 101.575 (6) (title) of the statutes is created to read:



1999 - 2000 Legislature ~13- LRB_4078/7
SECTION 41
1 101.575 (6) (title) USE OF FI RE DEPARTMENT DUES.
2 SECTION 42. 101.575 (6) (a) (intro.) of the statutes is amended to read:
C‘Q 101.575 (6) (a) (intro.) No city, village or town t

( 4 2 under-tris-seettorr may use any fire denartment dues received under s. 101.573 ame-

5 -his-seettorm for any purpose except the direct provision of the following:

6 SECTION 43. 101.575 (6) (b) of the statutes is amended to read:

7 ]

8 dreveiition i AHABY a coffr) tefedmentivid] 0 d
\9/ l both m\:‘:ﬂicigahi%s maﬁeceive ﬁ?eldepartlhé‘ﬁt duendéﬁsub.tg 1!%2{2._
10 inllage or town that eentraets—for receives fire protection serviee I
11 agreement wi citv, vi shall give I

12 dues received under s. 101.573 and this section to the fire~departrrent city, village
13 or_town providing the fire protection serviee services. That fire-department city,

14 village or town shall use those fire department dues for any of the purposes specified

15 in par. (a) @.

16 SECTION 44. 101.577 (tit'é) of the statutes is created to read:

17 101.577 (titl‘cje) Liability of city or village for fire department services

18 outside of boundaries.

19 SECTION 45. 101.645 (1) of the statutes is repealed and recreated to read:

20 101.645 (1) DeriNn TN, In this section, “smoke detector” means a device that

21 detects particles or products of combustion other than heat.

22 SECTION 46. 101.645 (2) of the statutes is amended to read: ‘,'(f“s(viu
@ 101.645 (2) APPROVAL-AND-INSTALLATION SMOKE DETECTORS APPROVED FOR USE. <A~

24 Onlv a smoke detector required that is approved Inc.

25




10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18

19

21
22
23
24

1999 - 2000 Legislature - 14 - LRR]?JWO'ZS/?

and-(3){a) sub. (3).

SECTION 47. 101.645 (3) of the statutes is amended to read:

101. 645 (3) Wﬁm The owner of a dwelling shall install
a functional smoke detector in the basement of the dwelling and on each floor level
except the attic or storage area of each dwelling unit. The owner shall install each

mok: r_reauir nder thi ion rdin he directions an
specifications of the manufacturer of the smoke detector. Except as otherwise
J T onnet s cering

provided in this subsection, the occupant of sueh a dwelling unit shall maintain any
smoke detector in that unit; if), If any occupant whedisnet other than the
owner, or if any state, county, city, village or town officer, agent or employe charged
under statute or municipal ordinance with powers or duties involving inspection of
real or personal property, gives written notice to the owner that the smoke detector
Is not functional the owner shall provide, within 5 days after receipt of that notice,
any maintenance necessary to make that smoke detector functional.

SECTION 48. 101.745 (1) of the statutes is repealed and recreated to read:

101. 745 (1) DEFIN\I/TION. In this section, “smoke detector” has the meaning given
ins. 101.645\/(1).

SECTION 49. 101.745 (2) of the statutes is amended to read: 5“'“%&(&‘-’0

101.745 (2) APPROVAL _SMOKE DETECTORS APPROVED FORUSE. '74%@ smoke

detector

be that is approved by underwriters

laberatery Underwriters Laboratory, Inc. . or anv other independent testing
X1

K odd commar
I ratory. mav satis he r irement under (4).

v
SECTION 50. 101.925 (1) of the statutes is repealed and recreated to read:



10

11

12

13

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

23

24

25

?
1999 - 2000 Legislature - 16— LRIIlBJ—ﬁ(.)".Y'E:;./.:

SEcTION 50

101.925 (1) DerinTION.  In this section, “smoke detector” has the meaning given

v/
in's. 101.645 (1).

SECTION 51. 101.925 (2) of the statutes is amended to read: 51'5'-12@-“""'
101.925 (2) APPROVAL SMOKE_DETECTORS APPROVED FOR USE. A Only a smoke

detector required—under-this—section-shall-be that is approved by underwriters
lal I I i I I ind I i
o add sevred Lomrn
SECTION 52. 101.972 of the statutes is amended to read:
101.972 Multifamily dwelling code council duties. The multifamily
dwelling code council shall review the rules for multifamily dwelling construction

and recommend a uniform multifamily dwelling code for promulgation by the

department. To the extent feasible, the council shall recommend a uniform

multifamilv_dwelling code that is consistent with nationallv_recognized standards for

resistant materials and construction methods. The council shall consider and make

recommendations to the department pertaining to rules and any other matters
related to this subchapter. The council shall identify, consider and make
recommendations to the department regarding variances in the rules for different
climate and soil conditions and the variable conditions created by building and
population densities.

SECTION 53. 101.973 (1) of the statutes is amended to read:

101.973 (1) Promulgate rules that establish standards for the construction of

multifamily dwellings and their components. The denartment shall obtain the

J
recommendation of the multifamilv dwelling code council under s. 101.972 before

promulgating a rule that is inconsistent with nationallv recognized standards and

- =~

%,

%



10
11

12

13.

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

23

24

25

1999 - 2000 Legislature - 16 - LRB-4078/?
RJIM:.......

SECTION 53

of ﬁre‘resistgnt materials and construction methods.

s Loy ek
SEC ) . of the statutes is amended to read:

601.93 (2) Every insurer doing a fire insurance business in this state shall,
before March 1 in each year, file with the commissioner a statement, showing the
amount of premiums upon fire insurance due for the preceding calendar year.
Return premiums may be deducted in determining the premium on which the ﬁ?e
department dues are computed. Payments of quarterly instalments of the total
estimated payment for the then current calendar year under this subsection are due
on or before April 15, June 15, September 15 and December 15. On March 1 the
insurer shall pay any additional amounts due for the preceding calendar year.
Overpayments will be credited on the amount due April 15. The commissioner shall,

prior-te before May 1 each year, report to the department of commerce the amount

of dues paid under this subsection and to be paid under s. 101—5‘1;&(1) 604.(\)/4 (3) (b).

SECTI N 55. 604.04 (3) of the statutes is renumbered 604.04 (3) (a).

SECTION 56. 604.04 (3) (b) of the statutes is created to read:

604.04 (3) (b) Before May 1 of each year, the local government property
insurance fund shall be charged fire department dues equal to 2% of the amount of
all premiums that, during the preceding calendar year, have been paid into the state
treasury for the benefit of the local government property insurance fund.

SECTIoN 57. 607.21 (intro.) of the statutes is amended to read:

607.21 Payments from life fund. (intro.) In addition to the payments under
s. 604.04 (5(3), and the payments which become due under its policies, the life fund
shall pay:

(END)



STATE OF WISCONSIN - LEGISLATIVE REFERENCE BUREAU - LEGAL SECTION
(608-266-3561)

U)
) A

St ( f 01575 (/) (om) o
/e, /,5750_/) [m) __2:7[ C!é// V///ad( 0..{2_«)‘01//) rece WCX 7@/‘@

nodetdon ond f/c ,ofe’fwar’{u’ﬂ seruices ades o contract o Ggrec: ,,,C,,f ,

!)/M Gaothe 6/#\/. l//'//A(P ac %nm /w/l n’)wo///oo«//ﬁeffrm?\/ recelve r(")/t

depac uead duzs i oHesvuse eliible,

L epp oF NI )

\




DRAFTER’S NOTE LRB-4078/P1dn
FROMVITHE RIM:......
LEGISLATIVE REFERENCE BUREAU

Representative Porter:

1. Attached is a preliminary draft of a bill generally relating to fire safety and the
multifamily dwelling code. Although the language submitted by the department of
commerce (department) was helpful in completing this bill, due to the confusing state
of the underlying statutes, the bill contains numerous differences from the submitted
language. These differences are primarily due to my efforts to make these statutes
readable. I have highlighted some of the major differences and issues below. | have
tried to accomplish the intent of the submitted language but, as is often the case with
a bill of this size, additional changes may be needed to make the bill conform to your
and the department’s intent. Please let me know if you desire any changes. After you
approve of the draft, I will complete an introducible version.

2. The fire safety and injury prevention education program is established in
proposed s. 101.139. | did not jnclude a separate authorization to establish a fire safety
program under s. 101.14 (1) (a), stats., as requested by the department, because the
program established in proposed s. 101.139 appears to include this authorization. As
currently drafted, the fire safety and injury prevention education program may be
funded out of applicable grants and donations, safety and buildings operations
program revenue or any general purpose revenue that the legislature allocates to the
new appropriation account under proposed s. 20.143 (3) (e). As | previously discussed
with John Lippitt at the department, this new appropriation account is not funded in

-

the bill. v

3. The bill repeals that portion of the appropriation currently in g/ 20.143 (3) (La),
stats., relating to administrative expenses under s. 101.141, statsbecause the bill
transfers the record maintenance duties under s. 101.141, stats., from the department
to fire departments.

4. Generally, the department has jurisdiction over places of employment and public
buildings, as well as certain residential buildings. The language submitted by the
department amended s. 101.14 (1)’(a), stats., to include a general statement of the
department’s authority and jurisdiction over fire inspections, fire prevention, fire
detection and fire suppression in all buildings. The jurisdiction and powers of the
department are primarily in s. 101.02, stats., and, thus, | have placed this grant of
authority in proposed s. 101.02 (15) (am). PTease review this section and let me know
if it is inconsistent with your intent.

4



—9- LRB—4078/P1dn

v/

5. The bill places the duties of cities, villages and towns in s. 101.14 (2), stats., and
the eligibility requirements for receiving fire department dues,in s. 101.575, stats.
Currently, a city, village or town must comply with s. 101.575 (3), stats., in order to be
eligible to receive fire department dues. However, under the language submitted by
the department, the requirements under s. 101.573 (3), stats., are a mandate rather
than simply an eligibility requirement. Thus, the bill moves those provisions to
proposed s. 101.14 (2) (ag). In addition, under proposed s. 101.575 (4), a city, village
or town still must satisfy these requirements in order to be eligible to receive fire
department dues. v

Does the new language in proposed s. 101.14 (2) (ag) 3. clearly describe what is

intended by the term “public fire education”? /
6. The language submitted by the department clearedﬁ;) an ambiguity in s. @

101.141, stats., by indicating that certain fire department fecords are open to the
public as specified in ch. 19 (open recordslaw). Becau‘;e the applicable fire department
records fall within the definition of™record™in s. 19.32 (2) /and, thus, are subject to the
open records law, the bill deletes any reference to the records being open to public
inspection in s. 101.141, stats.

7. Per my understanding of the department’s intent, the billcohforms the procedure
for collecting and distributing fire department dues with the current practice of the
depart‘xyent and the commissioner of insurance. See proposed ss. 101.573 (3) (a),
601.93 (2) and 604.04(3) (b). You may want to have both the commissioner of insurance
and the department review these provisions to ensure that the provisions are
adequate.

8. The language gubmitted by the department contained an amendment to s.
101.575 (1) (b) and (c), stats., to account for the possibility that a city, village or town
may contract for fire protection or fire prevention services from a fire department
rather than with another city, village or town. However, under current law only a city,
village or town may operate a fire department. As a result, the bill does not include

the requested language. v
The bill repeals s. 101%‘5 (1) (c), stats., because the requj eyent in that paragraph
is covered by proposed §s. 101.575 (4) (a) 1. and ))(am).

9. Under the bill, all eligibility requirements for receiving fire department dues are
consolidated in one location, proposed s. 101.575 (4) (a). In consolidating these
eligibility requirements, | tried to use consistent terminology with regard to those
municipalities that receive fire protection and fire prevention services, under a contract
or agreement with another municipality. See proposed s. 101.575 (4) (6/1) 3. and 4., stats.
The department should review these provisions to ensure that they are consistent with
the department’s understanding of current law.

Currently, s. 101.575 (4) (a) I., stats., requires a city, village, town or fire department
to comply with “sub. (6) and s. 101.14 (2).” Although the language submitted by the
department did not treat this section, the bill requires a city, village or town to comply
with all of s. 101.575, rather than just sub. (6). This treatment seems consistent with
the intent of the department.



_3_ LRB-4078/P1dn

v/

10. The bill amends s. 101.575 (6) (b), stats., to account for the provision of services
under a mutual aid agreement. Although this change seems consistent with the
general intent of the department, you may want the department to review this
provision to ensure that the provision rightly includes mutual aid agreements.

11. Regarding the smoke d¢tectors that are approved for use under proposed ss.
101.645 (2), 101.745 (2) and 101.925 (2), you may want to require that a smoke detector
be approved by Underwriter®§ Laboratory or any other independent testing laboratory
approved by the department.

12. The language submitted by the department would have prohibited the
department from promulgating certain rules under s. 101.973 (1), stats., unless the
rules were recommended by the multifamily dwelling code council. In effect, the
council would have the authority to prevent the department from promulgating these
rules. With certain limited exceptions, a “council” under current law is an advisory
body that may make recommendations but that otherwise does not have powers to
compel or prohibit agency activities. | drafted proposed s. 101.973 (1) in order to be
consistent with current law regarding the powers of a council. Under the bill, the
department is required to obtain the recommendation of the council before
promulgating these rules but is not bound by the recommendation. See proposed s.
101.973 (1). If this provision is not sufficient, please let me know and we can discuss
other options for addressing this issue.

Robert J. Marchant

Legislative Attorney

Phone: (608) 261-4454

E-mail: Robert.Marchant@legis.state.wi.us



DRAFTER’S NOTE LRB-4078/P1dn
FROMITHE RJIM:emh;jf
LEGISLATIVE REFERENCE BUREAU

January 24, 2000

Representative Porter:

1. Attached is a preliminary draft of a bill generally relating to fire safety and the
multifamily dwelling code. Although the language submitted by the department of
commerce (department) was helpful in completing this bill, due to the confusing state
of the underlying statutes, the bill contains numerous differences from the submitted
language. These differences are primarily due to my efforts to make these statutes
readable. I have highlighted some of the major differences and issues below. I have
tried to accomplish the intent of the submitted language but, as is often the case with
a bill of this size, additional changes may be needed to make the bill conform to your
and the department’s intent. Please let me know if you desire any changes. After you
approve of the draft, I will complete an introducible version.

2. The fire safety and injury prevention education program is established in
proposed s. 101.139. I did not include a separate authorization to establish a fire safety
program under s. 101.14 (1) (a), stats., as requested by the department, because the
program established in proposed s. 101.139 appears to include this authorization. As
currently drafted, the fire safety and injury prevention education program may be
funded out of applicable grants and donations, safety and buildings operations
program revenue or any general purpose revenue that the legislature allocates to the
new appropriation account under proposed s. 20.143 (3) (e). As | previously discussed
with John Lippitt at the department, this new appropriation account is not funded in
the bill.

3. The bill repeals that portion of the appropriation currently in s. 20.143 (3) (La),
stats., relating to administrative expenses under s. 101.141, stats., because the bill
transfers the record maintenance duties under s. 101.141, stats., from the department
to fire departments.

4. Generally, the department has jurisdiction over places of employment and public
buildings, as well as certain residential buildings. The language submitted by the
department amended s. 101.14 (1) (a), stats., to include a general statement of the
department’s authority and jurisdiction over fire inspections, fire prevention, fire
detection and fire suppression in all buildings. The jurisdiction and powers of the
department are primarily in s. 101.02, stats., and, thus, I have placed this grant of
authority in proposed s. 101.02 (15) (am). Please review this section and let me know
if it is inconsistent with your intent.



-2~ LRB-4078/P1dn
RJIM:cmh:jf

5. The bill places the duties of cities, villages and towns in s. 101.14 (2), stats., and
the eligibility requirements for receiving fire department dues in s. 101.575, stats.
Currently, a city, village or town must comply with s. 101.575 (3), stats., in order to be
eligible to receive fire department dues. However, under the language submitted by
the department, the requirements under s. 101.573 (3), stats., are a mandate rather
than simply an eligibility requirement. Thus, the bill moves those provisions to
proposed s. 101.14 (2) (ag). In addition, under proposed s. 101.575 (4), a city, village
or town still must satisfy these requirements in order to be eligible to receive fire
department dues.

Does the new language in proposed s. 101.14 (2) (ag) 3. clearly describe what is
intended by the term “public fire education”?

6. The language submitted by the department cleared up an ambiguity in s. 101.141,
stats., by indicating that certain fire department records are open to the public as
specified in ch. 19 (open records law). Because the applicable fire department records
fall within the definition of “record” in s. 19.32 (2), stats., and, thus, are subject to the
open records law, the bill deletes any reference to the records being open to public
inspection in s. 101.141, stats.

7. Per my understanding of the department’s intent, the bill conforms the procedure
for collecting and distributing fire department dues with the current practice of the
department and the commissioner of insurance. See proposed ss. 101.573 (3) (a),
601.93 (2) and 604.04 (3) (b). You may want to have both the commissioner of insurance
and the department review these provisions to ensure that the provisions are
adequate.

8. The language submitted by the department contained an amendment to s.
101.575 (1) (b) and (c), stats., to account for the possibility that a city, village or town
may contract for fire protection or fire prevention services from a fire department
rather than with another city, village or town. However, under current law only a city,
village or town may operate a fire department. As a result, the bill does not include
the requested language.

The bill repeals s. 101.575 (1) (c), stats., because the requirement in that paragraph
is covered by proposed s. 101.575 (4) (a) 1. and (am).

9. Under the bill, all eligibility requirements for receiving fire department dues are
consolidated in one location, proposed s. 101.575 (4) (a). In consolidating these
eligibility requirements, | tried to use consistent terminology with regard to those
municipalities that receive fire protection and fire prevention services under a contract
or agreement with another municipality. See proposed s. 101.575 (4) (a) 3. and 4., stats.
The department should review these provisions to ensure that they are consistent with
the department’s understanding of current law.

Currently, s. 101.575 (4) (a) 1., stats., requires a city, village, town or fire department
to comply with “sub. (6) and s. 101.14 (2).” Although the language submitted by the
department did not treat this section, the bill requires a city, village or town to comply
with all of s. 101.575, rather than just sub. (6). This treatment seems consistent with
the intent of the department.



—-3-— LRB-4078/P1dn
RJIJM:ecmhjf

10. The bill amends s. 101.575 (6) (b), stats., to account for the provision of services
under a mutual aid agreement. Although this change seems consistent with the
general intent of the department, you may want the department to review this
provision to ensure that the provision rightly includes mutual aid agreements.

11. Regarding the smoke detectors that are approved for use under proposed ss.
101.645 (2), 101.745 (2) and 101.925 (2), you may want to require that a smoke detector
be approved by Underwriters Laboratory or any other independent testing laboratory
approved by the department.

12. The language submitted by the department would have prohibited the
department from promulgating certain rules under s. 101.973 (1), stats., unless the
rules were recommended by the multifamily dwelling code council. In effect, the
council would have the authority to prevent the department from promulgating these
rules. With certain limited exceptions, a “council” under current law is an advisory
body that may make recommendations but that otherwise does not have powers to
compel or prohibit agency activities. | drafted proposed s. 101.973 (1) in order to be
consistent with current law regarding the powers of a council. Under the bill, the
department is required to obtain the recommendation of the council before
promulgating these rules but is not bound by the recommendation. See proposed s.
101.973 (1). If this provision is not sufficient, please let me know and we can discuss
other options for addressing this issue.

Robert J. Marchant

Legislative Attorney

Phone: (608) 2614454

E-mail: Robert.Marchant@legis.state.wi.us



S
60.55 Fire protection. %)

60.55(1)

(1) General authority.

60.55(1)(a)

(@) (intro.) The town board shall provide for fire protection for the town. Fire protection for the
town, or any portion of the town, may be provided in any manner, including:

60.55(1)(a)l.
1. Establishing a town fire department.

60.55(1)(a)2.

2. Joining with another town, village or city to establish ajoint fire department. If the town
board establishes a joint fire department with avillage under s. 61.65 (2) (a) 3., the town board
shall create ajoint board of fire cornmissioners with the village under s. 6 1.65 (2) (b) 2.

60.55(1)(a)3.
3. Contracting with any person,

60.55(1)(a)4.
4. Utilizing a fire company organized under ch. 2 13.

/ﬂﬂ(l{, /LL/ }’W/\) %W’QW}‘(:H /»._g{(ﬂ,,;,;'g,f,(ﬁ
Loacw 72 FNSEDT ¢ i /Z&/L'A‘cm.@

~ 1 M—«A/t/\
clybilipy e

o, ) og

N

e



61.65(2)(a)
(@ (intro.) Except as provided under s. 61.66, each village with a population of 5,500 or more
shall provide fire protection services by one of the following methods:

61.65(2)(a)l.
1. Creating its own fire department.

61.65(2)(a)2:
2. Contracting for fire protection services with a city or town or with another village. A village
that contracts for fire protection services shall pay the full cost of services provided.

61.65(2)(a)3.
3. Creating ajoint fire department with a city or town or with another village.

61.65(2)(a)4.
4. Utilizing a fire company organized under_ch. 213, except that this subdivision does not apply
in avillage that provides fire protection services under subd. 1. on December 9, 1993.

61.66 ’
61.66 Combined protective services.
61.66(1)

(1) (intro.) Notwithstanding s. 61.65 (1) (a), (2) (a) and (3g) (d) 2., any village with a population
of less than 20,000 may provide police and fire protection services by any of the following:

61.66(1)(a)

(@) A department which is neither a police department under s. 61.65 (1) (a) nor afire
department under s. 61.65 (2) (a), which was created prior to January 1, 1987, and in which the
same person may be required to perform police protection and fire protection duties without
being required to perform police protection duties for more than 8 hours in each 24 hours except
in emergency situations, as specified under s. 62.13 (7n).

61.66(1)(b)

(b) Persons in a police department or fire department who, alone or in combination with persons
designated as police officers or fire fighters, may be required to perform police protection and
fire protection duties without being required to perform police protection duties for more than 8
hours in each 24 hours except in emergency situations, as specified under_s. 62.13 (7n), if those
persons were required to perform those duties prior to January 1, 1987.

61.66(2)

(2) The governing body of a village acting under sub. (1) may designate any person required to
perform police protection and fire protection duties under sub. (1) as primarily a police officer or
fire fighter for purposes of s. 891.45 or 891.455.

62.13



62.13 Police and fire departments.

62.13(1)

(1) Commissioners. Except as provided in sub. (2m), each city shall have a board of police and
fire commissioners consisting of 5 citizens, 3 of whom shall constitute a quorum. The mayor
shall annually, between the last Monday of April and the first Monday of May, appoint in writing
to be filed with the secretary of the board, one member for aterm of 5 years. No appointment
shall be made which will result in more than 3 members of the board belonging to the same
political party. The board shall keep a record of its proceedings.

62.13(2)

(2) Exception.

62.13(2)(a)

(a) Except as provided under sub. (6m), subs. (1) to (6) shall not apply to cities of less than
4,000 population except by ordinance adopted by a majority of all the members of the council. A
repealing ordinance may be adopted by alike vote.

62.13(2)(b)

(b) A city that creates ajoint police or fire department with a village under s. 61.65 is not
required to create a separate board of police and fire commissioners under this section. The city
shall create ajoint board of commissioners to govern the joint department, as required in_s.

B 1tbe city also creates one separate protective services department in addition to the joint
protective services department, the city shall create a separate board of commissioners to govern

that department. A city’sjoint board of commissioners is subject to_s. 61.65 (3g) (d). A city’s
separate board of commissioners is subject to this section. 1‘\%
L
\
62.13(2m) T2

(2m) Joint departments, contract services.

62.13(2m)(a)

(&) A city may create ajoint police department or a joint fire department, or both, with another
city.

62.13(2m)(b)

(b) A city that creates ajoint police department or ajoint fire department, or both, with another
city under par. (a) is not required to create a separate board of police and fire commissioners
under this section. The cities shall create ajoint board of commissioners to govern the joint
department. If only one joint department is created, each city shall retain its existing board of
police and fire commissioners to govern the separate department. The cities may jointly
determine the number of commissioners to be appointed to the joint board by each city and the
length of the commissioners’ terms. A majority of the commissioners is a quorum. A joint board
of commissioners that is created under this paragraph to govern a joint police department is
subject to the provisions of subs. (3) to (7n), ajoint board of commissioners that is created under
this paragraph to govern ajoint fire department is subject to the provisions of subs. (8) to (12)
and ajoint board of commissioners that is created under this paragraph to govern ajoint police
and fire department is subject to the provisions of subs. (2) to (12).



62.13(3)

(3) Chiefs. The board shall appoint the chief of police and the chief of the fire department, who

shall hold their offices during good behavior, subject to suspension or removal by the board for
cause.

66.069(2)(e)
(e) Any‘tewn, village or city bwning »a{ublic utility, or thg board of any mu}%cii)al utility

s. 66.068, may ehter int eements with any other such towns, villages or
r any othérsuch boards of mumijcipal utilities, for mutuakhaid in the event bf an emergency
i ir respective servige areas\Such agreemer\fti\ ay include, M
isi movement of employes and equipment Mtween the s€rwice
areas of the variousparticipatifiig-municipalities for the purpase of renderingsuch aid and, for the
reimbursement of a municipality rendering such aid by the municipality receiving the aid.




STATE OF WISCONSIN - LEGISLATIVE REFERENCE BUREAU - LEGAL SECTION
(608-266-3561)

Ml

VKD'IS

‘ VO )0l J{ o) (c ke ot 2 400t )

(V) VQ, 5-17

\/

’pM’/ S“L{/R 7mmM~»

~23 el WL ° o M«»(f};,

W%M@%M{/Q

@\m\’)( AN 5“[2'&/“/




41 Updated 97-98 Wis. Stats. Database
UNCFFI Cl ALTEXT

family and 2-family dwellings that are accessible to persons with
disahilities, as defined in s. 106.04 (Im) (g), and shal make rec-
ommendations to the department for any changes to the uniform
dwelling code that may be needed to ensure an adequate supply
of one-family and 2-family dwellings. Upon its own initiative or
at the request of the department, the council shall consider and
make recommendations to the department pertaining to rules and
any other matters related to this subchapter. The council shal rec-
ommend variances for different climate and soil conditions
throughout the state.
History: 1975 c. 404: 1991 a 295; 1995 a 27.

101.625 Contractor financial responsibility council;
duties. The contractor financia responsibility council shall rec-
ommend for promulgation by the department rules for certifying
the financial responsibility of contractors under s. 101.654. These
rules shdl include rules providing for the assessment of fees upon
applicants for certification of financia responsbility under s.
101.654 and for the suspension and revocation of that certifica-
tion. The amount of the fees recommended under this section may
not exceed an amount that is sufficient to defray the costsincurred
in certifying the financial responsibility of applicants under s.
. 101.654.
History: 1993 a. 126.

101.63 Departmental duties. The department shall:

(1) Adopt rules which establish standards for the construction
and inspection of one- and 2-family dwellings and components
thereof. Where feasible, the standards used shall be those nation-
ally recognized and shall apply to the dwelling and to its electrical,
heating, ventilating, air conditioning’and other systems, including
plumbing, as defined in s. 145.01 (10). No set of rules may be
adopted which has not taken into account the conservation of
energy in construction and maintenance of dwellings and the costs
of specific code provisions to homg buyers in relationship to the
benefits derived from the provisions.

(Im) Adopt a rule which requires any one- and 2-family
dwelling which uses dectricity for space heating to be superinsu-
lated.

(2) Adopt rules for the certification, including provisions for
suspension and revocation thereof, of inspectors for the purpose
of ingpecting building construction, electrical wiring, heating,
ventilating, air conditioning and other systems, including plumb-
ing, as defined in s. 145.01 (lo), of one- and 2-family dwellings
under sub. (1). Persons certified as inspectors may be employes
of the department, a city, village, town, county or an independent
inspection agency. The department may not adopt any rule which
prohibits any city, village, town or county from licensing persons
for performing work on a dwelling in which the licensed person
has no legal or equitable interest.

(2m) Promulgete rules for certifying the financial responsi-
bility of contractors under s. 101.654. These rules shal include
rules providing for the assessment of fees upon applicants for cer-
tification of financial responsibility under s. 101.654 and for the
suspension and revocation of that certification. The amount of the
fees assessed under this subsection may not exceed an amount that
is sufficient to defray the costs incurred in certifying the financial
responsibility of applicants under s. 101.654.

(3) Contract to provide inspection services, a municipal
expense, to any municipality which requires such service under s.
101.65 or 101.651.

(3m) Contract with a private organization to provide educa-
tion regarding construction standards and inspection require-
ments under this subchapter and under rules promulgated under
this subchapter to builders of dwellings in this state. The depart-
menf may only contract with an organization under this subsection
if the organization is described in section 501 (c) (6) of the Internal
Revenue Code and is exempt from ‘federal income tax under sec-
tion 501 (a) of the Internal Revenue Code.

(5) Biennially review the rules adopted under this subchapter.

REGULATION OF INDUSTRY, BUILDINGS AND SAFETY

101.645

(6) Issue specia orders which it deems necessary to secure
compliance with this subchapter and enforce the same by all
appropriate administrative and judicia proceedings.

(7) Prescribe and furnish to municipalities a standard building
permit form for al new one- and 2-family dwellings. The stan-
dard permit form shall include a space in which the municipal
authority issuing the permit shall insert the name and license num-
ber of the master plumber engaged in supervising the installation
of plumbing or installing the plumbing & a new one- or 2-family
dwelling.

(8) Hear petitions regarding the dwelling code, rules and spe-
cial orders in accordance with s. 101.02 (6) () to (i) and (8).

(9) Establish by rule a schedule of fees sufficient to defray the

costs incurred under this subchapter.

History: 1975c¢.404; 1979 c. 221; 1981 c. 20; 1983a 27; 1983a 189s. 329 (8);
1987 a 343; 1993 a 26, 126,414; 1999 a 9.

101.64 Departmental powers. The department may:

(1) Hold hearings on any matter relating to this subchapter and
issue subpoenas to compel the attendance of witnesses and the
production of evidence at such hearings.

(2) At the request of the owner or renter enter, inspect and
examine dwellings, dwelling units or premises necessary to ascer-
tain compliance with the rules and special orders under this sub-
chapter.

(3) Revise the rules under this subchapter after consultation
with the dwelling code council or with the contractor financial
responsibility council, as appropriate.

(4) Provide for or engage in the testing, approva and certifica-
tion of materias, devices and methods of construction.

(5) Coallect and publish data secured from the building per-
mits.

(6) Adopt rules prescribing procedures for approving new
building materials, methods and equipment.

(7) Enter into reciprocal agreements with other states regard-
ing the approval of building materials and methods where the
standards of the other state meet the intent of the dwelling code
and the rules promulgated under this subchapter.

(8) Study the operation of the dwelling construction code and
other laws related to the construction of dwelling units to deter-
mine their impact upon the cost of building construction and their
effectiveness upon the health, safety and welfare of the occupants.

History: 1975 c. 404; 1993 a 126.

101.645 Smoke detectors. (1) Dernimion. The definition
of “smoke detector” under s. 101.145 (1) (c) aso applies to this
section.

(2) AperovaL AND INSTALLATION. A smoke detector required
under this section shall be approved and installed as required
under s. 101.145 (2) and (3) (a).

(3) REQUIREMENT. The owner of a dwelling shal ingtall a
functional smoke detector in the basement of the dwelling and on
each floor level except the attic or storage area of each dwelling
unit. The occupant of such a dwelling unit shall maintain any
smoke detector in that unit, except that if any occupant who is not
the owner, or any state, county, city, village or town officer, agent
or employe charged under statute or municipal ordinance with
powers or duties involving inspection of real or persona property,
gives written notice to the owner that the smoke detector is not
functional the owner shall provide, within 5 days after receipt of
that notice, any maintenance necessary to make that smoke detec-
tor functional.

(4) INsPECTION. The department or a municipal authority may
inspect new dwellings, may inspect the common aress of dwell-
ings and, at the request of the owner or renter, may inspect the inte-
rior of adwelling unit in adwelling to ensure compliance with this
section.

History: 1977c. 388; 1983a 189s. 329 (4); 1987 a 376; 1989 a 109.
This section is a safety statute the violation of which constitutes negligence per se.
Johnson v. Blackbum, 220 Wis. 2d 260,582 N.W.2d 488 (Ct. App. 1998).

Unofficial text from 97-98 Wis. Stats. database. See printed 97-98 Statutes and 99 Wis. Acts for offic/al text under s. 35.18 (2)
stats. Report errors to the Revisor of Statutes at (608) 266-2071, FAX264-6978, email bruce.munson @legis.stafe. wi. us



21 Updated 97-98 Wis. Stats. Database
UNOFFICIAL TEXT

the same by the first day of August in each year to the state super-
intendent of public mstruction.

(d) The department may prepare and provide suitable forms for
distribution to the school systems in the state, for the purpose of
providing uniform reports on fire drills conducted during the year
in accordance with s. 118.07 (2).

(2) (a) The chief of the fire department in every city, village
or town, except cities of the 1st class, is congtituted a deputy of the
department, subject to the right of the department to relieve any
such chief from duties as such deputy for cause, and upon such
suspension to appoint some other person to perform the duty
imposed upon such deputy. The department may appoint either
the chief of the fire department or the building inspector asits dep-
uty in cities of the 1st class.

(b) The chief of every fire department shall provide for the
inspection of every public building and place of employment to
determine and cause to be eliminated any fire hazard or any viola-
tion of any law relating to fire hazards or to the prevention of fires.

(c) 1. Except as provided under subd. 2., the chief of every fire
department shall provide that the inspections required under par.
(b) be made at least once in each nonoverlapping 6-month period
per calendar year in dl of the territory served by his or her fire
department. The chief of afire department may require more fre-
quent inspections than required under this subdivision. The
department by rule shall provide for generd exceptions, based on
the type of occupancy or use of the premises, where less frequent
inspections are required. Upon written request by the chief of a
fire department, the department by specia order may grant an
exception to acity, village or town to conduct less frequent inspec-
tions than required under this subdivision.

2.In 1 & class cities, the fire chief may establish the schedule
of fire inspections in that city. The fire chief shall base the fre-
quency of the inspections on hazardous classification, the propor-
tion of public area, the record of fire code violations, the ratio of
occupancy to size and any other factor the chief deems significant.
Property other than residential property with 4 dwelling units or
less shall be inspected at least once annudly.

(cm) In addition to the requirements of pars. (b) and (c), afire
department shall provide public fire education services.

(d) The chief of every fire department, or, in 1 st class cities, the
building inspector appointed by the department under par. (a),
shall designate a sufficient number of inspectors to make the
inspections required under pars. (b) and (c).

(e) Written reports of inspection shall be made and kept on file
by the authority having jurisdiction to conduct inspections, or its
designee, in the manner and form required by the department.

(f) Every inspection required under pars. (b) and (c) is subject
to the supervision and direction of the department, which shall,
after audit, certify to the commissioner of insurance after the expi-
ration of each calendar year each city, village or town where the
inspections for the year have been made, and where records have
been made and kept on file as required under par. (€).

(3) The department shall annually conduct training sessions
and provide manuals and other materials and services to assist
deputies and inspectors in the fulfillment of their duties under sub.
).

(4) () The department shall make rules, pursuant to ch. 227,
requiring owners of places of employment and public buildings to
install such fire detection, prevention or suppression devices as
will protect the health, welfare and safety of al employers,
employes and frequenters of places of employment and public
buildings.

(b) 1. Except as provided in subd. 2., the rules of the depart-
ment shall require al such places and buildings over 60 feet in
height, the construction of which is begun after July 3, 1974, to
contain an automeatic fire sprinkler system on each floor.

2. a Subdivision 1. does not apply to any open parking struc-
ture, as defined by the department.

REGULATION OF INDUSTRY, BUILDINGS AND SAFETY

101.14

b. If the department determines that water would cause irrepa-
rable damage and undue economic loss if discharged in such
places or buildings, it shall require a suppression device which has
a substance other than water.

¢. Subdivision 1. does not apply to any building over 60 feet
in height the construction of which is completed or is begun prior
to July 3, 1974. o

(c) 1. The rules of the department governing such places and gt
buildings under 60 feet in height shall be based upon but may vary §
from those provisions in the Building Officials and Code Admin-
istrators International, Inc., building code which relate to fire §
detection, prevention and suppression in public buildings and £
places of employment. -

2. Before the effective date of the rules promulgated under
subd. |., as affected by 1983 Wisconsin Act 295, section 3, the
department may grant a variance to any rule relating to automatic
fire sprinklers and mandated under chapter 320, laws of 198 1, if
the department first does both of the following:

a Consults with the chief of the fire department having
authority over the place of employment or public building.

b. Determines that the variance provides protection, substan-
tially equivalent to that of the rules mandated by chapter 320, laws
of 1981, of the hedlth, safety and welfare of employers, employes
and frequenters of the place of employment or public building.

(d) To the extent that the historic building code applies to the
subject matter of this subsection, each qualified historic building,
as defined under 5.101.121 (2) (c), is exempt from this subsection
if the owner elects to be subject to s. 101.121.

(dm) Each building required by rule under this subsection to
contain fire detection, prevention and suppression devices shall
have the necessary devicesinstalled at the time of its construction.

(e) Whoever violates this subsection may be fined not less than
$100 but not more than $500 for each day of violation.

(f) The department may inspect al buildings covered by this
subsection and may issue such orders as may be necessary to
assure compliance with it.

(9) As used in this subsection:

1. “Automatic fire sprinkler system” has the meaning pro-
vided in s. 145.01 (2).

2. “Fire detection, prevention and suppression devices’
include but are not limited to manua fire darm systems, smoke
and heat detection devices, fire extinguishers, standpipes, auto-
matic fire suppression systems and automatic fire sprinkler sys-
tems.

(4m) (a) In this subsection:

1. “Automatic fire sprinkler system” has the meaning given
ins. 145.01 (2).

2. “Dwdlling unit” has the meaning given in s. 101.61 (1).

3. “Multifamily dwelling” has the meaning given in s.
101.971 (2).

4. “Nondwelling unit portions’ means the common use areas
of a multifamily dwelling, including corridors, stairways, base-
ments, cellars, vestibules, atriums, community rooms, laundry
rooms or swimming pool rooms.

5. “Politica subdivison” means a county, city, village or
town.

5m. “Two-hour fire resistance” means 2-hour fire separa-
tions for all walls that separate dwelling units, exit corridors and
exit stair enclosures and for al floors and ceilings, so that the spec-
ified walls, floors and ceilings are capable of resisting fire for a
period not shorter than 2 hours.

(am) A political subdivison may enact ordinances, as pro-
vided in this paragraph, that require an automatic fire sprinkler
system or 2-hour fire resistance in every multifamily dwelling.
Any ordinance enacted under this paragraph shall meet the stan-
dards established under pars. (b) and (c) or under pars. (d) and ().

Unofficial text from 97-98 Wis. Stats, database. See printed 97-98 Statutes and 99 Wis. Acts for official text under s. 36.18 (2)
stats. Report errors to the Revisor of Statutes at (608) 266—-2011, FAX264-6978, emaii bruce.munson @legis.state. wi.us




Marchant, Robert

From: Lippitt, John

Sent: Wednesday, February 02, 2000 5:16 PM

To: Marchant, Robert

cc: DuPont, Robert; Starzyk, Samantha; Spooner, Christopher
Subject: RE: Fire dues bill

Rob:

Thank you for bringing these issues to our attention. We do not want to create any new mandates in ch. 60, 61, 62 or 66,
Stats., at this time. The public policy issues concerning villages providing fire protection and fire prevention services may
be addressed at another time. Please revise the proposal so the cities, villages and towns must ensure the services are
provided as a condition to be eligible for a fire dues payment.

Call me at 6-1 036 if you would like to discuss this further, thanks.

John
----- Original Message-----
From: Marchant, Robert
Sent: Tuesday, February 01, 2000 11:44 AM
To: Lippitt, John
cc: DuPont, Robert; Starzyk, Samantha; Spooner, Christopher
Subject: Fire dues bill
John--

| have discovered an issue that | need some help with. | apologize for the length of the email but the issue is
complicated. | will outline the issue and then offer a potential solution.

As we discussed yesterday, the bill places all municipal requirements in s. 101 .14 (2). Several of these requirements
are in proposed s. 101 .14 (2) (ag) (see Section 36 of the bill). Although these requirements are consistent with the fire
protection requirements applicable to cities under ch. 62, | am concerned that the requirements in proposed s. 101.14
(2) (ag) in some cases are inconsistent with and, in limited instances, conflict with current town and village fire
protection requirements in chs. 60 and 61.

For example, s. 60.55 (1) (a) requires every town to provide for fire protection services. Section 60.55 (1) (a) 3. and 4.
authorize a town to obtain fire protection under contract with any person or through a fire company. Should s. 60.55
(1) (a) be amended to require a town to provide for fire protection and fire prevention services? Should the authority of
a town to contract with any person be repealed, in light of proposed s. 101 .1 4 (2) (ag)'s requirement that a town
maintain or contract with a volunteer fire department or with a paid or partly paid fire department? Should proposed s.
101 .14 (2) (ag) be changed to allow for a town to receive services from a fire company?

Different problems arise when you look at s. 61.65 (2) (a), which requires a village with a population of 5,500 or more
to provide fire protection services. Under s. 61.65 (2) (a) 4., a vilage may provide these services through a fire
company, unless the village had its own fire department on December 9, 1993.

Again, should every village, regardless of population, be required to provide fire protection and prevention services
under s. 61.65 (2) (a)? Should the bill incorporate the exception to a village’s general authority to utilize a fire company
if the village had a fire department on December 9, 19937 Also, should proposed s. 101 .14 (2) (ag) be changed to
allow for a village to receive services from a fire company consistent with s. 61.65 (2) (a)?

If the requirements in proposed s. 101 .1 4 (2) (ag) are intended to apply to every city, village and town, then | will need
to amend the relevant provisions in chs. 60 to 66 to make the requirements consistent. If the requirements in
proposed s. 101 .14 (2) (ag) are not intended to apply to every city, village or town, then the language in that section wil
need to be changed to reflect the department’s actual intent.

If it is consistent with the department’s intent, one option would be to delete the “maintain or contract with a volunteer
or paid department” language and replace it with “provide for fire protection and fire prevention services as required
under s. 80.XX, 61 .XX or 62.XX." [ think you need to amend proposed s. 101 .14 (2) (ag) 1. to read more like
proposed s. 101 .14 (2) (ag) 2. (as amended, it would read something like “has a designated chief and singly, or in
combination, provides continuous fire protection in the city, village or town”). Each of the provisions in chs. 60 to 62

1



could then be amended to require a city, village and town to provide for fire protection and fire prevention services as
required under s. 101.14 (2) (ag).

When you can make the time, could you review the sections noted above and let me know how the department
intends to proceed? Please feel free to call if you have any questions.

Thanks.

Robert J. Marchant

Legislative Attorney

State of Wisconsin Legislative Reference Bureau
robert.marchant@legis.state.wi.us



