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H 60.01 Minimum qualifications of applicants for registration by 
examination. (1) TRAINING AND EXPERIENCE. Applicants shall submit 
evidence of completion of one of the following combirations of training 
and experience: 

(a) A baccalaureate in public health sanitation an;l one year of ac­
ceptable employment as a sanitarian. 

(b) A baccalaureate in a science course and 2 years of acceptable em­
ployment as a sanitarian. 

(c) A baccalaureate in a non-science course and 3 years of acceptable 
employment as a sanitarian. 

(d) Two years' training at an accredited college and 4 years of satis­
factory experience as a sanitarian. 

(e) High school graduation and 6 years of satisfactory experience as a 
sanitarian. 

(2) REFERENCES. Applicant shall provide 2 acceptable references, not 
relatives, who can indicate his competence in the field of environmental 
sanitation. 

History: Cr. Register, August, 1958, No. 32, eff. 9-1-58. 

H 60.02 Examination. Applicant shall pass an examination con­
ducted by the examining committee. (Section 140.45 (4), Wis. Stats.) 
Examinations will be conducted at least semi-annually. At least 2 weeks' 
notice of examination shall be given to qualified applicants. Any candi­
date for registration may appeal from the findings of the examining com­
mittee by appearing in person before the committee. Request for appeal 
shall he filed in writing within 30 days of notification of the results of the 
examination. Examination papers may be destroyed after the 30-day ap­
peal period. 

History: Cr. Register, August, 1958, No. 32, eff. 9-1-58. 

H 60.03 Renewal of certificate; delinquency and reinstatement. 
Renewal of the certificate of registration is required by January 1 of each 
year. If the renewal application and fee of $5 are not submitted by Janu­
ary 1, the certificate of registration shall be revoked automatically. Rein­
statement within the next 12 months shall be effective on pay1nent of the 
$5 renewal fee. Reinstatement after a 12-month period shall be subject 
to the filing of a new application for registration and pay1nent of ihe $10 
application fee, except that a certificate which has been revoked for a 
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period of 5 or more years shall be reinstated only after filing a new appli­
cation, payment of the $10 application fee and passing a written exami­
nation. 

History: Cr. Reiister, August, 1958, No. 32, eff. 9-1-58. 

H 60.04 Reciprocity. Reciprocal agreements may be entered into 
with states having equivalent qualification and examination require­
ments for registration. 

History: Cr. Register, August 1958, No. 32, eff. 9-1-58. 
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