
LAWS OF WISCONSIN—Cll. 200. 	205 

incorporation, the volume and page where such agreement is 
recorded. The register of deeds shall forthwith transmit to the 
secretary of state a certificate stating the time when such agree-
ment was recorded and shall be entitled to a fee of twenty-five 
cents therefor to be paid by the person presenting such agree-
ment for record, provided, that the abandonment of the organi-
zation or the revocation of articles in pursuance hereof shall not 
relieve such corporation or any signer or subscriber for stock 
or any stockholder then existing from any liability hereby 
created. 

SECTION 2. This act shall take effect and be in force from and 
after its passage and publication. 

Approved May 9, 1913. 

No. 387, A.] 	 [Published May 10, 1913. 

CHAPTER 200. 
AN ACT to create sections 380a and 396a of the statutes, relat-

ing to meetings of board of regents of the university and board 
of regents of normal schools. 

The people of the State of Wisconsin, represented in Senate and 
Assembly, de enact as follows: 

SECTION 1. There are added to the statutes two new sections 
to read: Section 380a. The meetings of the board of regents of 
the university shall be open to the public and the press and all 
records of such meetings and of all proceedings of such board 
shall be open to inspection by the public and the press at any 
reasonable hours thereafter; provided, that said board may hold 
executive sessions, the findings of said executive sessions to be 
made a part of the records of the proceedings of said board. 

Section 396a. The meetings of the board of regents of the 
normal schools shall be open to the public and the press and all 
records of such meetings and of all proceedings of such board 
shall be open to inspection by the public and the press at any 
reasonable hours thereafter ; provided, that said board may hold 
executive sessions, the findings of said executive sessions to be 
made a part of the records of the proceedings of said board. 

SEcrioN 2. This act shall take effect and be in force from and 
after its passage and publication. 

Approved May 9, 1913. 


