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dollars for an air compressor ; one thousand five hundred dollars 
for remodelling the employes' dining room ; two thousand dollars 
for an X-ray machine; and twenty thousand dollars for the con-
struction of an addition to the power house and for the purchase 
and installation of power plant equipment. 

SECTION 2. This act shall take effect upon passage and publi-
cation. 

Approved April 19, 1927. 

No. 94, S.] 	 [Published April 20, 1927. 

CHAPTER 34. 
AN ACT to amend subsection (1) of section 56.08 of the statutes, 

relating to employment of prisoners in a county jail. 
The people of the Stale of Wisconsin, represented in Senate and 

Assembly, do enact as follows: 
SECTION 1. Subsection (1) of section 56.08 of the statutes is 

amended to read : (56.08) (1) In any county having no work-
house any person, and in all other counties any female person, 
convicted of any offense and sentenced to imprisonment in the 
county jail shall be committed to hard labor ; provided that the 
court may order the imprisonment, or a part thereof, to be in 
actual and ordinary confinement, unless the jail to which the 
commitment is made shall have been declared inadequate or unfit 
by the state board of control pursuant to section 46.17. Every 
such prisoner, for such period of time as he may have been sen-
tenced to hard labor, shall be required to do and perform any 
suitable labor provided for by the sheriff anywhere within said 
county ; but the hours of labor in farm work shall be not less than 
ten nor more than twelve hours, and in all other work not more 
than ten hours, each day. 

SECTION 2. This act shall take effect upon passage and pub-
lication. 

Approved April 19, 1927. 


