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246 .06 May transact business in her own
name and for her own benefit . When the
husband of any married woman has deserted
herr or for any cause neglects or refuses to pro-

246 .08 Husband not liable for antenuptial
debts. Marriage does not render the husband
liable for the payment of the wife's antenuptial
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CHAPTER 246

246 .01 Realty of. The real estate of every
description, including all held in joint tenancy
with her . husband, and the rents, issues and
profits thereof of any female now married shall
not be subject to the disposall of her husband,
but shall be her sole and separate property as if'
shee were unmarried .

246 .02 Estate of, not subject to husband .
The real and personal' property of any female
who may hereafter' marry and which she shall
own at the time of marriage and the rents, is-
sues and profits thereof shall not be subject to
the disposal of her husband nor be liable for his
debts and shall continue her sole and separate
property

246.03 May receive, hold and convey
property. Any married female may receive by
inheritance or by gift, grant, devise' or bequest
from any person, hold to her sole and separate
use, convey and devise real and personal prop-
erty and any interest or estate therein of any
description', including' all held in joint tenancy
with` her husband, and the rents, issues and
profits thereof in the same manner and with like
effect as if she were unmarried, and the same
shall not be subject" to the disposal of her hus-
band nor be liable for his debts . Any convey-
ance, transfer or lien executed by either' hus-
band or wife to or in favor' of the other shall be
valid to the same extent as between other per-
sons.

246 .05 Indiv idual earnin gs. The individual
earnings of`every married woman, except those
'accruing from labor performed for her hus-
band, or in his employ or payable by him, shall
be her separate property and shall not be sub-
ject to her husband's control or liable for his
debtss

vide for her support or for the support and edu-
cation of her children, she shall havee the right
to transact business in her own name and to
collect and receive the profits of such business,
her own earnings and the earnings of her minor
children in her charge or under her control, and
apply the same for her own support and the
support and education of such children . Such
business and earnings shall not be subject to her
husband's control or interference or liable for
his debts . .

246 .07 May sue in her own name . Every
married woman may sue in her own name and
shall have all the remedies of an unmarried
woman in regardd to her separate property or
business and to recover the earnings secured to
her by sections 246 05 and 246 06, and shall be
:liable to be sued in respect to her separate prop-
erty or business, and judgment'may be rendered
against her and be enforced against her and her
separate property in all respects as if she were
unmarried: And any married woman may bring
and maintain an action in her own name- for
any injury to her person or character the same
as : if she were sole. She may also bring and
maintain an action in her own name, and for
her own benefit, for the alienation and the loss
of the affection and society of her husband Any
judgment recovered in any such action shall be
the separate property and estate of such mai-
ried woman Nothing herein contained shall af-
fect'the right of'the husband to maintain a sepa-
rate action for any such injuries as are now pro-
vided by law,

246 .075 Liability of wi fe for injuries to
husband. A husband shall have and may main-
tain an action against his wife for the recovery
of damages for injuries sustained to his person
caused by her wrongful act, neglect or default .
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246 .09 Insurance of husband , son , etc .
( 1 ) Any married woman may, in her own name
or in the name of a third person as her trustee,
with his assent, cause to be insured for her sole
use the life of her' husband, son or other person
for any definite period or for the natural life of
such person; and any person, whether her hus-
band or not, effectingg any insurance on his own
life or on the life of another may cause the same
to be made payable or assign the policy to a
married woman or to any person in trust for her
or her benefit ; and every such policy, when ex-
pressed to be for the benefit of or assigned or
made payable to any married woman or any
such trustee, shall be the sole and separate
property 6f' such married woman and shall in-
ure to her separate use and benefit and that of
her children, and in case of her surviving the
period or term of'such policy the amount of'the
insurance and all proceeds and avails therefrom
shall be payable to her of her trustee for her
own use and benefit, free from the control, dis-
position or claims of her husband' and of the
person effecting or assigning such insurance
and from the claims of their respective repre-
sentatives and creditors and from the claims of
herr creditors, whether or not the rightt to
change the beneficiary was reserved or permit-
ted by the terms of the policy,. The amount of
such insurance, proceeds and avails free from
the control, disposition or claims of her credi-
tors shall be limited to five thousand dollars . .
Nothing contained in this section shall be
deemed to affect or impair the right of the in-
sured or person effecting such insurance to
change the beneficiary of a policy in accordance
with the terms thereof; where such right . .t has
been reserved .

(2) Provided, that, subject to the statute of
limitations, the amount of any premiums for
said insurance paid with intent to defraud
creditors, with interest thereon, shall inure to
their benefit from the proceeds of the policy ;
but the company issuing the policy shalll be
discharged of all liability thereon by .payment
of its proceeds in accordance with its terms,
unless before such payment the company shall
have written notice, by of in behalf' of a credi-
tor, of a .claim to recover for transfer, made or
premiumss paid with intent to defraud credi-
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debts; but she shall be liable to all remedies for
the recovery of such debts to be enforced
against her and her separate property as if she
were unmarried .
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torn, with specifications of the amount claimed .
The amount of any such insurance may be
made payable, in case of the death of such
married woman before the period at which it
becomes due, to her children or to their guard-
ian for their : use, if under age, or to any other
person as shall be provided in the policy In
such case the receipt of such married woman
or of such children, or of theirr guardian if mi-
nors, shall discharge the insurance corporation
from all further liability therefor . The provi-
sions of this section shall apply to all insurance
on lives effected before November 1, 1878 ..

246. 10 May ebe assignee or receiver. Any
married woman may be appointed and act as
assignee or receiver, except of the estate of her
husband or of property in which he is interest-
ed, and shall be subject to the same liabilities
upon her bond and otherwise and exercise the
same powers as other assignees or- receivers,,

246.11 Married women may assi gn insur-
ance policy. Any married woman may, with
the written consent of the person effecting the
insurance, assign, incumber or dispose of any
right, title or interest she may have in, to or
under any policy of life insurance, whether on
the life of herself' or of her husband, or of any
other person, and whether such policy be ex-
pressed to be for the benefit of or assigned or
made payable to such married woman, or any
trustee for her, in the same manner and with
like effectt as if she were unmarried . The provi-
sions of this section shall apply to all insurance
on lives, whether effected before or after March
18, 1903, but shall not apply to assignments
thereof' made before said date.. .

246 . 15 Women to have equa l rights .
Women shall have the same rights and privileg-
es under the law as men in the exercise of suf-
fiage, freedom of contract, choice ofresidence
for voting purposes,:,jury service, holding office,
holding and conveying property, care and cus-
tody of children, and in all other respects : The
various courts, executive and administrative of-
ficers shall construe the statutes where the mas-
culine gender is used to include the feminine
gender unless such construction will deny to fe-
males the special protection and privileges
which they now enjoy for the general welfare .
The courts, executive and administrative offi-
cers shall make all necessary rules and provi-
sions to carry out the intent and purpose of this
section
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